TFWE IS TOXDY
SRT aawgécséox 9TCIT

FooFEdF 30003CdWO0T (3WIRB) AG3C0DF, 2025
(20253 QgeRziod dFeods Foss-04)

(3rEsd ITRRPONOT IDHTRAROAR WONCTTTE THTRY)

FTooEET 30t Wo88 IR, 19613, D3R, ST FBE e0TBEN
20T LAGODT.

QD). AJBENOT  TOWRBWRE B LINDMN Toecrddd  3Xe00t3CI3T
DO, 19671 (19628 TEET LIPOND 12)), NI R, STV W e3I0TIEH T
AT NTVeH OO ;

QWY PPTI  NEe00%T DB,I0NL SRERDE),  TooEEdT Do
LPOTTNOBOR 0TI B4 ZV0RNTO03 IR NI ZIONE):-

1. TOFR, DIV DI), FTYT0YP.- (1) 8 LDIANRNEI), ToELT
30T ITWOTT (ST GE) LD, 2025 DOT FCONIT,T,.

(2) BRY &8 TRTWS 30N WTI3T,T,.

2. 300 100 3T BW.- TOocE3T SCed0t3eITTT RO, 1961 (19623
FOEET IDAONTD 12)3 (YE), ATILEN0T TR LIRDONTNTOTY FTODEITDNT)
1036 TJFTTITWE)., "80T) WRENY” D0 VBBNY WHRONR "eRRTY BRENY” DOW
SENY, 3030e8R33,30,.

3. ®T00 158 W BR.- DR RIODINT 153¢ JyTTLTW (3)€ V-
RTTEITS 3TV B8 20D GVW-TTEDeI), ALORITLT),, DOTT:-

@) B ODIONTDT TDI), FOOFET oNINDT W&, IDRIDT T
9RO, 2004 (20043 TIEET PO 14)3 QVBWORPNF ), O30T 2353030
U ONAWT, TOWIOD BVEIW 9GP0 NeddoYeD, DI, WOWFIONI* T’
QOB BT SN0YPeHR, BV 9T SNT A3l QYRS 9G0P
D3I, NT,Y B3R, YU LT X% T VLR 950 9O A0;3T
T30 YLD €TI0 LITBTED,, T30 YL L9300 00TNPT SNENS €92)e3,,



BERVBOD NR* 2 L9IRTIDONY FOWORHIES,, DRA,,0°, ATBONT DA, 0° C9ITe00
88 DOI) Doy ATOE Tog) 9DTFINPRP AT O03E e9QTOON 538D &I0B 3T,

(5) DR, 0%, AB/OODT DX, 0° IF0 LPFZINRPAT 03¢ 9T
338 R03 TR Bwo RTEFTTR (1)3). ene3fNAIT PTONS) I AT
SRTBROD 3T, B8 LIPODNENT VWWORPNF L Tjaes), Ty eE,3T,:3),,."

4. 15 DI, 150 BRRX RFTOONY ACRFT.- DR IRIONIDT 153€
FWYTTEIT 3TI2000 8 BDIODS BRA TTTLINTS), ADRIT,R),, DOTT:-

"15d. WOWITERIFD® DROT  dWoWNY YIS BrIRRIITF .-
LIBNY I, VI;BERRAIR)WTY,N, ROOMIT ST 3003l SIS
SNPsA NRC N FOONEDIECRCN RNTOE T PR IFTION NPT
2OWITEBRE D IT), DT e0WI T, AZBE NI, NP5 FTOD ToONEIPO
203D, TONERRBTIF) DONNFLTBIWIOT IPOSTE) 33T,

152). BOTWNTRTINY DT HO RCDF.- AT Teg) ARTE THOWITLRT3I
ANIAD{30n) T ONE 235e3R, 00D, SORATNICEAAVE FOTNTRTI ANIAD{e}300
TOODE WA TOONEIPOS aNI),  DINERRBNY)  DONeIRWIBITIOOT
LPOST) B3T,330,,."

5. @00 370 SWH_RBB.- (1) 3DR® eIPIONNT 373 TJFTLT (2)3C 03 -
RBCBE) -

(@) "e33) 30oNFR[BR" D0 JPNY WROR "®B33), B[RENF[IN” D0
BENFI), 3B REBAIT,LI,,; 203,

() "20T) ARe)T TRBDICNNFITN” 0w J/INEY WROR  "808D ©OF
BR@OINPRTNR" 020 BBNYI, )33 RIT,T),.

6. IT00 380 SWIBR.- (1) 30RO LIRDDONTNT 383 BTTETE),, -

(D) "W0RD WREWITNR” D0 JWNAY BN "33, SRENFSTNR” 02
BENF D, T)3RBRCRAIT,R,,; 203,

() "80e33), AT TRDIONNFRTN” D0W VWINY WBOR  "&03) OF
B OINPRTNR" 020 BBNPI), )33 RIT,T),,.



7. RTT0 3800 FCIVFR.- (1) 2RO LIRNIONTNT 383 &WyTTLT Tz S8
FODTTR, ADARIT,T,, DOTWT:-

"38d. WOT03W FHDTW WFTFTOD ARCG.- (1) 003 353000 Tod) BT
O30T AODT &3 A 3eIICDT 228,00, LDRDAITEL..

(2) €3€230T3ITOTR FIOMPTDOT B e3ARCIDIMON e3ZTN® 9T €333
NBOLT DDROTIND 9T 33T TEN0W AWRDOTIN® Ooc)e |33
WOI03T TR, WFARIT,EL), DD, WOR0F  B[DAMUICHN 00T
X OBRTT,N 88 LIRDONNT VBWOBNPE WOWSI BRTBOIIINIT,L), TN S8
eIDAONNT 23R VTWOPNREIREOIZ 90T €3€e30T3CeITTOTT  SLLOTILIONTI,
923033, IBRREN e9T3200 SNV A YTV SPEOTIER DYPTIOON
L9 TOTe) ¥, NT 3T, T30,

DRTW: B BTTREW R L3NPMN, 30ei0t3e)TOTS]  DROT  FOONRTT
BT "WOWVOITW Fa"ad) B3 &0 IRIYNF ), PR P)E)T), DOTT:-

() ROOMPTTR, 99T 33T/3TOD TEN0W ATRON w3 TWEI), TOTEHT)
B0 3BASRTWIEIT) 90 O0RODNT), WFRIIT) BT 9330 AT
9300 DDA T, 9G 00

(i) FIOMPTII,, €333/e3F0 FEIN0W RATBRST, AFDOT X FT, DC03ToN
2002V RITIYT eIFI0 €33T/e3FTAD WwBITTW 9T WFFTONAS o3t =31
NG5 DRITYTI) €90 e33T/E3TAVI0T B3I FRF )T €90 0300e)TE eI0T
R3S WFTN €98 BBRITIH T, 9300

(i) AOOMITRD WoAWINTE G0 TOA BRIV G0 e35e33000
SBRISTV NS 9T V3T APT, WOROITW FaNedsd), FHNRRPS L30T
e3mon 230E3 DRI T 90 23630370303 2350TITH T, €TI0

(iv) ROOMOBINR T WeS3MON WOEO03T 20D, 9B I &)R0elasd)y, WPA
03N TINR/2WwITVNARTT, VRN 9G¥ BRTMINR T 0L/ NV ,NY,
B1eT® 303,30300%,33 RSO, WPRIHT), L9300

(V) ATOETT O30T FOODEFTHRTRONE). FOOTOTIN FO3RCBTTS BB, N,
O30 T TR 23, AOOMOTA)OT 20e303a00N BT OIEHT."



8. W30 398 3TDBR.- 00 LIIPICDNE 39:3¢ &FTETE),,-
() DOTB (R)TE),,-

() "0 VREWRTNR IRDRWBIWIE AW TOUWIARNOTW" D0 BWNY
BN "ePRT) BRENPITVNR )R ORWBIDOE FToUWARN0R" D02 BWNAT),
) 3BV AT, T3,

(i) "80233), AT TRTIAWNP[TNR” D0W JVRINY WHROR "&DRTY OF
B OINFRTNR" 020 BBNFI), &332 RIT,T),,.
(2J) VOB (W)TE),,-

() "VRBY WVREWRVN A DRWIBITIE FOW FoUIRIAN0T" 00 IBNY
WBON "03), BRENPRION A DRWBITOE ToU0ARN0TW" D0 BBNRFI),
@) 3O3R AT, 203,

(i) "200T) ©OF TRIOINYRIR’ R0 BINY WO "0 OF
B OINPRTNR" 020 BBNYI), @333 RIT,T),.



5

T3 L3NS 3D, ToTINY BCPF
(@dco&:%ﬁds‘i HoRDIRN ONIATOE)

S3RIF,0T, ST aDID),  3AS),T3 S0t eIWOTBY  CTI
302300 W&, WONY 9NW3 30T NI, WOTOIW R[RRCS dPOSNPOTI
SRDETOON  TRWED THORNS DI, BFNP), OFA)TBT,N, Tooe&dT
3T IDOCT  IRACND, 1961 (19628 TIEET PO 12)3), 30T
SOTBIIHTI) e9e3T5TI0C3) [ONEIRT.

€303 D0 B8 ITIEODT.



SDFT WO RS K3

TAR,e)3 TORVI3,T T DOWON O0HTE TB23,S 233,23 YVOERMIHD)..



R)39;03,0€223 TOZTODTVE VI 230 I3 K3

DO 4

(1) 88 DOBT DROT ADRL) TARDATIE  15-0 TyTTeY)
2WOVVTEBRE VS BDPOT YI5TE aNI), s NFATOD PO T,NS
FTOODEIPON  aNI),  DINEAPRBNFI), DADEINEY DROT
QAODNAD) AT TT, LIPTOTaI), IS,

(2) &8 DOBT DDPOT ALDAD) TWARAAITVE 15-2) TyTTe0a))
POWNTRC3 D00 XDTOD BOWNTRTI D050
TOODE BB A NS ToODEIPOS  aNIJ),  ONE RPRBNFIN,
QAONTINY TDRDT AONNRE) ATE T, L9IPTOTe3T), LIS,

WA,ed3 TR BWPNTTT &830503/0¢2 3000 30lTO A BRTB,NG.

T3 ,003) AN°. T,
TAA 20030 TEI,0D), BRTIIRVTA
ABTOT 2003

3.e30°. mmogé
TOORNFTEF
TIOFWE VOT TORDD




WO
FooFr &3 30303080 9RDAOHD, 19613 (19628 Foorédd aDADD 12)

NT_y3 on

XXX XXX XXX

10. SRS ORTD.- SEIIS 9ERO, DX SRENY  WORD  9BHR
B0 5200NCIT,T),.:

V303, SRV, BRODTIE S3€eiot3edTTI), 6:3€ TJTTTW (1) SORETTETI
980N AONNRCIVT DV0FS,03 2002, 9T03TTW 93N ROWORNATO3I 2,0 BRA
SRIMN  ORE  FARRT, WOF  SeoicdDolNn), RS RIS 93O
EINODRT R BRA A NON TBFTROR 93T 96 FOWORPATTOF 95330 &0
STRINTI),  ALTORITEDONR 93D 200D aT520088 AT, BRODTITIOT)
IARINECEAAME

XXX XXX XXX

37. WOBPRI), OZWPHNYS), 3P, DDRII[I), SDPDIFHTY woTd
OBV TOG.-
XXX XXX XXX
) (13 NBITTORT  NDBWOBNPI,  MONAE CO3E  esne), e9IBVTIG
QLEONOT €3 €380 ONFTTN IR DRWIBITIOE TOU0ARNO0T I 2wOT) AedT
B OINF TN IRDAWIBITE BOBRDOT e9ITe00 BRTBOOBOWR WOLRITNIT,T,,.

XXX XXX XXX

38. QORTRTY,N TWOB.- AP LRI WOFONTE AT HWAROTN FOOMTIN
NRTeS TR TR0 BT, TYPLTDARIE O03C e3TCR, CIWOIG DLIEONIE aees3,
20T BBVETWITN IRDRWIBITOE TOU0AR0E 95300 80e33), A0edT CRE0OINF IV
RDAWIBITOE IR0 €95300 BeICWOOTOWR TWOTZTNITT,..

XXX XXX XXX

39. WoRBNRYNR JOWORDAW FTHON; PBVWOPNYI.- T8 IRV O30T
VBWOFRRY,; DODFA) 3T PO 9T, PV 0FAT  O03E  353.03ne), S8
e9RAONTNTE), ORI ADER,, OB, NTWOPATRE,E), ITVTOG DDEONTITI
a3, -

(D) BRTWOIX e9TWOTITO,N 2u0T) WRE TLIRTN )R DR WO AOLID FoU0AR0TS
PO 033), AT  CRTOICNFRTNR LDRDRVTIDOE  2IUD,S0N0T  CIT00
BRCVBOOTOR BORIVNIT,),,; 03I,

() RTVBI 930 V0N TEW LITORT,N DT 3RE LISV IR,DR 0TI
MO TOUROARRN0T IFI0 20T OF BRTIOINFITN )R DRWIBITOE I A0
IR YRIVBOOTWOR CBORITINST,T),.

XXX XXX XXX

TTFO BNTFHFOOON, WFR A0, BONKRD, TAR . BEND 300, 103e =[ews 2025



KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL
ONE HUNDRED AND FIFTY FIFTH SESSION

THE KARNATAKA MONEY LENDERS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025
(LA Bill No. 04 of 2025)
(As passed by the Karnataka Legislative Assembly with Amendment)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Money Lenders Act, 1961.

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Money Lenders Act,

1961 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1962) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the seventy sixth year of

the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the

Karnataka Money Lenders (Amendment) Act, 2025.
(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 10.- In section 10 of the Karnataka Money
Lenders Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1962)(herein after referred to as the
Principal Act) for the words “five years” the words “three years” shall be
substituted.

3. Amendment of section 15.- In section 15 of Principal Act, after sub-

section (3), the following sub- sections shall be inserted, namely:-

“(4) The Group B Officer of Revenue Department or Rural Development and
Panchayath Raj Department or Urban Development Department or Town Planning
Department or Woman and Child Development Department or Social Welfare
Department or Minority Welfare Department or Tribal Welfare Department or
Backward Classes Welfare Department shall report if any person is in contravention
of the provisions of this Act and the Karnataka Prohibition of Charging Exorbitant
Interest Act, 2004 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 2004) to the concerned Registrar,
Assistant Registrar or any Officer authorized by the State Government, in this
behalf.

(5) The Registrar, the Assistant Registrar or any Officer authorized may on his
own motion or on the report submitted by the Officers referred in sub-section (1),

shall take action under the provisions of this Act.”



2

4. Insertion of new sections 15 A and 15 B.- After section 15 of the

Principal Act, the following new sections shall be inserted, namely,-

“15-A. Settlement of disputes by Ombudsperson.- The Government shall
by notification appoint an Ombudsperson who can act as a mediator between the
borrower or lender, for settling the disputes. The procedure and guidelines for the

settlement and mediation shall be in the manner as may be prescribed.

15-B. Grievances Redressal Forum.- The Government shall establish
suitable grievance mechanism. The procedure and guidelines for grievance

mechanism shall be in the manner as may be prescribed.”

5. Amendment of section 37.- In section 37 of Principal Act, in sub-

section (2),-

(a) for the words “six months”, the words “ten years”, shall be substituted,;

and
(b) for the words “one thousand”, the words “five lakh”, shall be substituted.
6. Amendment of section 38.- In section 38 of the Principal Act,-
(a) for the words “one year”, the words “ten years”, shall be substituted; and
(b) for the words “fifty thousand”, the words “five lakh”, shall be substituted.

7. Insertion of section 38A.- After section 38 of the Principal Act, the

following shall be inserted namely,-

“38A. Prohibition of using coercive action.- (1) No person shall charge

exorbitant interest on any loan advanced by him.

(2) Money Lender shall not use any coercive action either by himself or by his
agents or by his family members for recovery of money from the debtor and any
form of coercive recovery shall be liable for punishment under the provisions of this
Act and empower the Registering Authority to suspend or cancel the Registration of

such Money Lender as provided under the provisions of this Act.

Explanation: For the purposes of this section, "coercive Action" by a Money

Lender against the debtors include the following, namely:-

(1) exerting pressure or obstructing or using violence to or insulting or

intimidating the debtor or his/her family members, or



3

(i) persistently following the debtor, his/her family member from place to
place or interfering with any property owned or used by him/her or
depriving him/her of, or hindering him/her in the use of any such
property, or

(iii frequenting the house or other place where the debtor resides or works,
or carries on business, or happens to be, with an intension of taking
coercive action, or

(iv) using the service of private or outsource or external agencies, criminal
background to negotiate/urging the debtor to make payment using
coercive and undue influence, or

(v) Seeking to take forcibly any document from the debtor which entitles the

debtor to a benefit under any Government programme.”
8. Amendment of section 39.- In section 39 of the Principal Act,-
(@) in clause (a),-

(i) for the words “with simple imprisonment which may extend to one year”,
the words “with imprisonment which may extend to three years”, shall be

substituted; and

(ii) for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words “three lakh”, shall be
substituted.
(b) in clause (b),-

(i) for the words “with simple imprisonment which may extend to two years”,
the words “with imprisonment which may extend to ten years”, shall be

substituted; and

(ii) for the words “one lakh rupees”, the words “five lakh rupees”, shall be

substituted.



4

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

(As appended to at the time of introduction)

It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Money Lenders Act, 1961
(Karnataka Act 12 of 1962) to protect economically vulnerable groups and
individuals from the undue hardship usurious interests rates and coercive means of

recovery by licensed money lender and unlicensed money lender.

Hence, the Bill.



5

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed measure.



6

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

Clause 4: (1) Section 15-A proposes to be inserted by this clause
empowers the Government to prescribe by rules the
procedure and guidelines for the settlement and the manner
of mediation by the Ombudsperson.

(2) Section 15-B proposes to be inserted by this clause
empowers the Government to prescribe by rules the
procedure and guidelines for grievances mechanism of the

grievances redressal forum.

The proposed delegation of Legislative power is normal in character.

KYATHASANDRA N.RAJANNA
Minister for Co-operation
excluding Agriculture Marketing

K.R. MAHALAKSHMI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Council




7

ANNEXURE
EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA MONEY LENDERS ACT, 1961

(KARNATAKA ACT 12 OF 1962)

XXX XXX XXX
10. Term of licence.- A licence shall be valid for a term of five years.

Provided that where a money-lender holding a licence has made an
application for a fresh licence before the date prescribed under sub-section (1) of
section 6, for the succeeding 1[term]l, such money-lender shall, notwithstanding
the expiry of the term of his licence, be deemed to have a valid licence until orders
are received by him on his application for the fresh licence.

XXX XXX XXX
37. Entry of wrong sum in bond, etc., to be an offence.-
XXX XXX XXX

(2) Whoever contravenes the provisions of sub-section (1) shall, on conviction,
be punished with imprisonment which may extend to six months or with fine which
may extend to one thousand rupees or with both.

XXX XXX XXX

38. Penalty for molestation.- Whoever molests, or abets the molestation of,
a debtor for the recovery of a debt due by him to a creditor shall, on conviction, be
punished with imprisonment which may extend to one year or with fine which may
extend to fifty thousand rupees or with both.

XXX XXX XXX

39. General provision regarding penalties.- Whoever fails to comply with or
acts in contravention of any provision of this Act, shall, if no specific penalty has
been provided for in this Act, on conviction, be punished,-

(a) for the first offence with simple imprisonment which may extend to
one year or with fine which may extend to fifty thousand rupees or
with both, and

(b) for the second or subsequent offence with simple imprisonment
which may extend to two year or with fine which may extend to one
lakh rupees or with both.

XXX XXX XXX

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengalur, 10t Mar, 2025, P7, W.D. , Copies 300



