TFWE IS TOXDY
SRT aawgécséox 9TCIT

Foor &% o n¥ JowFne) D3I, P3N (W IR) A3C0HT, 2025
(20258 OcREzgod Qgiehs 10a-26)

(BT QTOTTLEONOT WONCHRTRE SRITY)

FTOOFET SDOIYNY FOWPNY) DI, PI3sNEY PO, 195630, DI,
33T TN 20T IGCODT.

Q). YRENN0T FORBIWRE B LBNPMON FoorddT 3DOJNY FOWPNYH
NI, PWI3NE 9PN, 1956 (19578 TEEIT LIPODED 5) 33, eI R, 3T,
20TBIEY) T T2 NI WO OTI;

QR PO03 Meelo%sT  DR,B00NC DRERE),  TooeedT  Tosg
LPOTTNOBOR 0TI B4 ZV0RNTO03 IR NI ZIONE):-

1. 0B R, BID D3I, TTV0I.- (1) B3 BRDIANNEI, ToREET DOYNY
ROWFNE) 2N, P3NP (3T FTE) 9D, 2025 0T FBONIT, T3,

(2) BRY &8 TRTWS 30N WTI3T,T,.

2. [TO0 30 SWHJBR.- Toor&dT DOYNY FOoWPNY I, P3N
e9PAOND, 1956 (19578 ToRE&T PRI 5)(B),  BRENN0TW DR
L9 DONTNWOTI) e3 LR CITING) 33 ByFTLTE) -

(i) "NV 3B 4T3 A0e)T CRTIONNY" D0 BBNY WHOR 200030 OFH 80333,
A0e)T CRTWIONNE” D0 BWRNF, w33t RITT),;

(i) "€98233), A0e)T BRTOANNY” D0 BWNY WHRON 20T OFE Q3,3 4030
20e)T BRTVIONINE” D0 BWNRFD, &30A3eCBRITT,;

(i) "V, OF 8033), AT TRWIONNY" DOW IJWPNEY WHRON "8R3 OF

CR@OINT" D0 BWNP, &T3O3RAST,T,;



3. ®¥F0P 40 3WIJ/R.- DR  RIDRDT 43¢ JyF3w,  (1)3e
VBT TTRE), "2WO0T) OFE BRI, A0edT SRTIONY" 00 BWRNY TR
"DTVRBY OFTE 80e33), AT BRTWIONNF" D02 BBNPI, B3OSR RIT,,;

4. FFOD 6> B STWIRBV.- DR LIRNIODINT 60 TyFTLDTE), "80e33,
A9e)0 BRTIOINY” D00 BWENY WHRONR "0R,3,4330 A0edT SRR D0

BBNFI), 33 RERRITT),;

5. ¥TO0 62 T SWRBR.- DR 9RIANNT  62) JyTT0T, (1)
VBRTTEORE), "20T) OFEW VR,3), AT BRDOANY" 020 RBNY 2TOR
"RCRY OF BRTIONNE" 0 BBNPI, &SRB RCRBAITT),,;

6. RT00 9V V), WE WRBIFPTN.- DRO LIPAONRNT 92D TyTTLae3),,
2EN,WBIT,T,.

B3 QIIeONTH) 0T FOLTRIT 1993¢ DY BT LFFHRR0D TR 2.0 TI
DTEOPNFHOD TST0eeTORZBER.

RGBT
TIOF 3T NTONRY



T L3NYH D3I, ToUNY BCLTF
(Deecdena, HoRHTR CRGAEO3)

TA3 RT DBEBD 33, BC). AOTRY), BB FwoNT. D50 YNY,
DOIYNY, To%s DOIYNY DI, T DOIYNY AOWT D), B3 NEFD, e
FTOOROTW BOR,DATIRYDQ).. ST3.D0T, AOWY, aDIWolN 335, 33 3335, 20B
B3sMe) 9TONY TOR,OBMON Fooeddd sDOYNY ROWFN) 303y, P3NY
IR0, 19563, ST 2330TBIIHTI) 9a3T5e3083) SONREIRCIINGS.

3T O0T B8 IFCONT.



SDFT WO RS K3

TR TORAVOIT  TeDOTW  NDOAFTON  OWOXR) BI), TSCES
CR@WIOINY 35336 T BeH),a30 3, MVOEITITI.

AT T30 05
0 DEN0-I)

3.e30°. wm@gé
FTOONEFTEF
FIOF T APOT TOWD)



WO
Foorédd DDoInY Fowdned DH3I), P3N aDIDHD, 1956

(19578 BT ¢3% 9D AODD 5) B e 43 N
XX XX XX

3. DDEN0Y DI, oI NY FoWFNYH.- VTN 2,07 3oNPHR
RNBV,3 4330 AT CRDIONNEY ROWP DI, I8A3RW, DO 60T 3oNnYR
©90e33), AT TRTWIOINY AOWFRI), AOWIAD BIT,E),. 9RO 20T
WRET, VOO, OF 80a33), AT CRTICANY 3355 L3500, TRTW ROTIOD
MDIEICEAAN

XX XX XX

4. oYNPR DOIT DINPH.- (1) TSP, =N0JA, WBONLRTY
SNBEE). 3, LIPTOTIRH VR IST a0I), OFE IT00NT 983I), DINY
e933DODNTTR BIA, 3 D00, WFACN €9T3a00 90T AR, 3 DwoAT WRBON
T8 30NY) OT) OFW YR, A0e)T BRTICNY WIW), DN 2307 335000,
BBON) BT, BTONTIT,T),. B VTR TTEIT IBONE). 2WwTNREIVT DadoR eIy
RAIDRIWTIWORE 0T  JyeoewBe). AW, NAPIITE), DI, 933
SDCTIONTI 2E3),; LDALEIEEY) LOT WO eNINF, XTI T,EL..

(2) AR, 3 D0AT, WBRON DS Wold 33T, BI,Y, aN0IYNE) WPRIT
QAT), ORTYI NNRLINY WFIMN, AODNRERT 0T ©9¥30N), Toss
RNTOETY) NPT FTECBNP, AIARR INPPRITE),. €530 Td 30NY), DROAT
AWEBH DI, A LEIMN 3DI), 90T DWORTER), QT 3RCENY dT0sA 303,
ARBEDBBNON 20RE D), AYe)T CRTICINY 23357 B,¥,e00N33T,33),,.

XX XX XX

6. T DOIYNY JIoWYNRN.- T3ABPRW, Toxs aN0JNR T8 SonPn
802330, APe)T CREIONNY FOWFR, NI, T8 S0NPNR DRV OF CRTIAIINE
e3.333; 233503070, FOWIOD s3PRIER),.

XX XX XX



62). To%s DOINY DWINYD.- (1) T3ABPRW, Tos :DOHA) 933
BTN, I, VTEREZTT 9333, DINY 9:3RCDT3N WonLesd SNITE,
AAR,3 DWOATNY, WFRO) TR0 HOF AAL,S JeoAT, WBUN T8 30NPNR
2,03 OFT GR,3), AT CPRDIOINY BIW), oI 2okl 3350030, BBOEN
B, W0NTIT,RB),. B OBRTIHT RN, WBNIRT D03,
RRI)DBRIWTIDORE  OT  RIeeBe). AW NRAPIIT,R), o03), T3
DCNTIONT 2,630, JALEIEY) 90T WV INF I, NCTIT,.L)..

(2) AMAV3 AT, WBUIN DI LRBNR P35, BT, To%s 00030
WFRIE DATS), PRFI BLINSG WFTMN, D0DLNAVE 0T 9¥IaD),
Oo%y ATIETE) aNPTY TRBNPI), AAL. SRRAPRITT),. @300 &d 0N,
DTARE DWEDBHB 203I), ALEIMON aNI), 90T DRAIWE)., B 3RCENY dDosA
TN, ADWEBTHBNON &R, ARe)T CRTWIOINY 23357 BT, 00NTIT,3),,.

XX XX XX

92). EV;EN03), D0, T 0T DI, WRDOIYNY JoWY D3I,
P3NP, BWF.- B0D5eN0Y, N0, Tos N0 aNI), NTNOYNY F0WY
NI, P3NP, BSWON 301 9DIODD, 19613 48:3¢ WyTTIT Ja3CHBORN DOT
(V)3 90D, SOTBWOPNHEDT 233 DDVT BRW50TEH SOV a30¢e3 20233 e 13¢
DV0TROT WB02%3e00N &3)38 80T WRENY 3TV B, e300 3T,T3),.

XX XX XX

TFFO WNTFHOOO, WFA PG, LONHRD, TR , J3N 300, 205¢ = 2025



KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL
ONE HUNDRED AND FIFTY FIFTH SESSION
THE KARNATAKA MINISTERS SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES
(AMENDMENT) Bill, 2025

(LA Bill No. 26 of 2025)
(As passed by the Karnataka Legislative Assembly)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and Allowances Act,
1956.

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ministers Salaries
and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 5 of 1957) for the purposes hereinafter
appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy-sixth year of
the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Ministers Salaries and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2025.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 3.- In the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and
Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 5 of 1957), (hereinafter referred to as the
Principal Act), in section 3,-

(i) for the words "seventy five thousand rupees" the words, “ one lakh fifty
thousand rupees”, shall be substituted;

(ii) for the words "sixty thousand rupees" the words,
thousand rupees”, shall be substituted; and

(iii) for the words "four lakhs fifty thousand rupees" the words, “ five lakhs
rupees”, shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 4.- In section 4 of the Principal Act, in
sub-section (1), for the words “one lakh twenty thousand rupees”, the words, “ two
lakh fifty thousand rupees”, shall be substituted; and

4. Amendment of section 6A.- In section 6A of the Principal Act, for the
words "fifty thousand rupees" the words, “ seventy five thousand rupees”, shall be
substituted.

5. Amendment of section 6B.- In section 6B of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1), for the words “one lakh twenty thousand rupees”, the words, “ two lakh
rupees”, shall be substituted.

6. Omission of section 9B.- Section 9B of the Principal Act shall be omitted.

«©

one lakh twenty five

I hereby certify that this Bill is Money Bill within the meaning of Article 199 of
the Constitution of India.

SPEAKER
Karnataka Legislative Assembly



2
STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

(As appended to at the time of Introduction)

There is a considerable increase in the cost of living. The salary and
allowances to the Chief Minister, Ministers, Ministers of State and Deputy Ministers
have not been revised since a long time. Therefore, it is considered necessary to
amend the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and Allowances Act, 1956 for revision of

salary, house rent allowance, sumptuary allowance.

Hence, the Bill.



3

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There will be a recurring approximate additional expenditure of Rupees ten

crores per annum from the proposed legislative measure.

SIDDARAMAIAH
Chief Minister

K.R. MAHALAKSHMI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Council



4

ANNEXURE

EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA MINISTERS SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT,
1956. (KARNATAKA ACT 5 OF 1957)

XX XX XX

3. Salaries of Chief Minister and Ministers.- There shall be paid to the Chief
Minister a salary of seventy five thousand rupees per mensem and to each Minister a salary
of sixty thousand rupees per mensem. They shall also be paid a sumptuary allowance of
four lakhs fifty thousand rupees per annum.

XX XX XX

4. Residences of Ministers.- (1) Each Minister shall be entitled, to the use of a
furnished residence in the City of Bangalore throughout his term of office and for a period
of sixty days immediately thereafter, or in lieu of such furnished residence to a house rent
allowance at the rate of one lakh twenty thousand rupees per mensem. The residence
provided under this sub-section shall be furnished on such scales, and the plinth area
thereof shall not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed.

(2) In a residence used by a Minister who is entitled to a house rent allowance in lieu
of a furnished residence, three rooms shall be furnished by the State Government on such
scales as may be prescribed, to be used for official purposes. He shall be entitled for an
allowance of thirty thousand rupees per month for maintenance and upkeep of residence
and for layout and maintenance of gardens included in such residence.

XX XX XX

6A. Salaries of Ministers of State.- There shall be paid to each Minister of State a
salary of fifty thousand rupees per mensem and a sumptuary allowance of three lakhs
rupees per annum.

XX XX XX

6B. Residences of Ministers of State.- (1) Each Minister of State shall be entitled,
to the use of a furnished residence in the City of Bangalore throughout his term of office
and for a period of sixty days immediately thereafter, or in lieu of such furnished residence
to a house rent allowance at the rate of one Lakh twenty thousand rupees per mensem. The
residence provided under this sub-section shall be furnished on such scales, and the plinth
area thereof shall not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed.

(2) In a residence used by a Minister of State who is entitled to a house rent
allowance in lieu of a furnished residence, three rooms shall be furnished by the State
Government on such scales as may be prescribed, to be used for official purposes. He shall
be entitled for an allowance of thirty thousand rupees per month for maintenance and up
keep of residence and for layout and maintenance of gardens included in such residence.

XX XX XX

9B. Increase in Salary and Allowances of the Chief Minister, the Minister, the
Minister of State and the Deputy Minister.- The salary and allowances of the Chief
Minister, the Minister, the Minister of State and the Deputy Minister shall be increased
after every five years commencing from 1st April, 2023 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index
provided under clause (v) of Explanation to section 48 of the Income-tax Act, 1961.

XX XX XX

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengalur, 20t Mar, 2025, P7, W.D. , Copies 300



