TFWE IS TOXDY
SRT aawgécséox 9TCIT

FOOFET dPONNOBOT JOWF NP, V,y3, BCIINeH D3, P3;ne
(3T BR) A@Zeod, 2025
(20253 QFRRTE0H PR 50936—25)
(BRFEIT DTRTHLI0NOT WONCHRTTRG TRTTY)

TOOEFET  LdPOTNOBOT  AOWFNY), )edyd, NIINYY a3, P3N
9RO, 195630, 2RI R, STV eVTBEN 2u0TI) LIGLODT.

YD), YJEE0T  FOBIWIE B EINPMEN ToEET  IPPONNOTBOT
ROVFRY, 53,3, SIN 03y, BINY 90IChHED, 1956 (19570 BP0
DO 2) B0y ENIJ,ER,, STV 20TBIEY T ONIT 20 NBIH)TDOTS;

QR PO03 MeelowsT  R,B00NC DRERE),  TooeedT  Dosg
LPOTTNOBOROTI B4 ZV0RNT03 IR NI ZeIoNE):-

1. F0ZR, BVIV) D3I), FTFT0YW.- (1) B LRPRIADENTI, ToeEds
AFOTTDORBOT ROWFPRD), De3yd, LITN) 503, B3NT  (STZDR) DA,
2025 0T TBONIT,TD,,.

(2) BRY &8 TRTWSE 23001 W3B3T,T,.

2. ¥300 30 STW BR.- ToorET IPOSTNOBOT ROWPNEY), ey,
REITNS) DI, P3N PO, 1956 (19578 TOEET PO 2) ([,
YB,TN0T TR e IODNWOT eve3 LD INT) 33¢ &-yFTT LT,

(i) VJIFTTD (1)3E), "W 3B 4T3 AeIT TRWICNNY" D0W BWNY TN
"0 OFTT GI,3,473) A0edT CREIONNT" 002 JWNRFI), a0I, "o,
©OF TCRJIAINY" D0W JINEY WHRON "800 ©F TRTIONE" 02
BTNYI, B3R REBIITT,,;

(i) VBTTTED (2)3€), "D 3B 4T3 T0edT BRTIONNY” D0 JWNY TR
"0 OFTT GI,3,4T3) A0edT CREIONNT" 002 JWNRFI), a0, "o,
OF TCRIIAINY" D0W JINEY WHRON "800 ©OF TRTIONE" 02
BBINYIN, Ty3RBREBIITT,,;

3. ®§309 40 3TWI_BR.- 5300 e9DICNENT 43¢ TFTRTE) -

(i) VBT TTD (1)3L)., "20TD OFT €9T33D, AT TRTIONNY" DOW BHNY
WROR "AVRY  OF 8033), AT TRTOANY” D02 BN,
RIEIOWOI T IC AN

(i) Q) NBTTTLRE), "Q9B,3), AT TRTWICWNY” D0 BWNY WHOR

'Y 3,403 AT CRETIOINE" 02 BWNFI, &8 CRIT,3),,.
4. R3O0 80 ISTWJBB.- HPO GRPIRDRDT 83 JyTTLT, ()€
VBRTTEIT, (B) DORBT RWPTWOIE JTOINTRE), * 3DRT) A9eITT S0TISRT)



BRTIONNE) aNI), NP TOe)T TRTIOINE)" D0 BBNY WBANR "6033) AeedT
B OINE) 203, B3, ARe)T BUeWoOINF” 0L BWNP, 83 RRIT,R),.

5. ®¥T00 100 SWHIBJBR.- DR 9PICHNT 103 JyF3eaws, (1)
VBT TTLOTE),, "€9Te33), AoeIT RTINS 02 BWNY TN 0203, A0edT
B OINY" 0 BWNPI, B8R RIT,T,.

6. 300 109 O STWIBR.- DR LIRIONINT 1078 BTTLTE), "e9Ta3 3,
70T CRDOONNY” D00 JWNY WBONR "0WI), A0edT TRTJICNS" D0
BTNPI,, I 3BRCRRIT,,.

7. BF00 1023 O SWHIRVBR.- 2DRO L9DIODTNT 1028 JyFTTWE), “80e33,
A0 CRTDIONNY” D00 IJWNY BN "©&,3), A0edT BRTICWNE” 0D
BENPI,, T 3BRRRIT,),,.

8. BTV 10¥ O SWIJBR.- DR IRIONNT 108 JyFTRTC), “80a33),
700 CRBDICINY" DN0W BJWNY BN "©B,3), A0e)T BRTICNNY" 0D
BTNPI,, B3R CRRIT,,.

9. {30 1180 W JBR.- DRO LRIRDRDT 1136 JTTLT, (1)3€
VBITTLORE), "Se3B), Ae)T CRTIOINY” D0 BWNY TN "00I), A0edT
B OINY” 0 BWNP, B3R RIT,T),..

10. B30 116> 8 SWIBB.- 20RO IRAONTNT 110 BTTEITE), -
(i) SVRVI)FTTed (1)3TE). -

(R) "TROEET LdPOTNOTBOT ROWPNY), Jedyd, SXIINED aNI), PI3NY
(BT BB) DO, 2009" DO BWNYD, €3e3TLINE) NI, 90INY
WROR ""FTIEET LdPOTENOTWOT BOWFNY, Dedyd, 33LIINYD 303,
B3N (3T FTB) 9PN, 2025" 0W T/WNYD, €33TNYD D3I,
0INFI), T3V RCBAST,),;

() "80e33), ARe)T BRTIANY" D0W JBNY WBONR "&,3,433) A0e)T
CREIOINT" D0 BBNPI, &B3A3RERRIT,TD,; &I,

() 838 HWB0ITTE), “80T0 AT TRTIONY" DI, “2.0TD OF
SRTIANNYIY," D0W BBNY BN "QR,3), Ae)T BT[N
NI, WO OFXT 80833), AT CRIIOINFI," 0 BENP),
9T DN 3RV AIT,T),.

(ii) (5)3¢ GUT TWyFTLIT, (i) DOBTE),, 20T OF BRTWICINPNR" 02 BTN
WRAR "DTBI OF BRTIANNLR" D02 BBNF, 130308 R3T,3),.

11. B30 113 8 SWIBB.- 20RO LRI 11 JyFTLIBE). -

(i) VBETTeD (1)3C), "DTBY OFE 80333), Ae)T BRTICNY” D0W BHNY
WROR "R OF BRTOANNE” 02 BBNP, TySO3RCRI T,

(i) QVTBTTTeD (2)TE),, “"DTWI OFT 80333), AT TRTWIONNY" D0 BWNY
RN "R OF BRTOANNE” 02 BBNP, &TySO3RERI T,

12. B30 118 ), V€35, WTBIHTI).- e 9IPIONNT 118 &WTT9e330,,
20830, 0TBIB,T),..



13. B399 12 B 3@ RBR.- zHPO 9PNIODTDT 12:3¢ &WTTETE), -

(i) (%) DOBWTE -

() VB0 (ii)BE) , "800 FOeIT BRTOCWNY” " D02 BWNY TR
"Q&,3), AOe)T BRTIOINF” D0 BWNF, 3B RERBRIT,T),.

(2)) QVBDOT (iv)3TE)., “dTTWI AT B0TISRTI BRTICNE” " ed0W
BINY BN "B, T0IT CRTWICNINY” D02 BWNRP,
3O3R RITT,.

(i) VOB (RR)3C), "e9Te33), ToeIT TBRTICWNY” " D02 RWNY BN
"R0W3IY, MOe)T BRTWIOINP” D0 BWNF, 333 RERRIT,),,.

(i) OB (JRR)B),, “ AT OF 80533, AT CRTOANTF," D0 BWNY
WROR DRI OFT 8033), AT  TPRWIOINPI," D0V  BWNP,
&33PV AITT,..

(iv) DOT(2F) T, TR 8 TDI0DIT, TySBRCRIIT,T, DOTT:-

“(i) BRTI0LS eNIY, B3, FTNY, LH V03T FLF) B3NS TN 9023

RW,NT[), BORD) €93 2R 323, NPMN 38 SONDN 20T OFT
23, A0e)T BN,

(i) AT, FBTBsON IS, FIERBNPI, Ve3E0REO) €3a3, AT/OODTIN
03D, BROWIAITNY FOWF DOT GT,3, 4030 AT BT ONRE).”

B3 QIIeONTH) 0T FOLTRIT 1993¢ DY BT WFFHRR0D TR 2.0 TI
DTEOPNFIOD TST0edeTORBE.

zz;aaﬁsgda
TIOF 3T NTONRY



T L3NYH D3I, ToUNY BCLTF
(Deecbena, HoRDMTNR CRGAEO3)

P0RS RWLEBE). MO B YNNI TW. 3B D0TW  Tooe&dT IS
DDOBOTWRT  AOWY, e3yd, NIINEG a3, P3NY PRI, 195630,
(19578 TOFET  OPRIONRD  2) 3TN BB DWW aNPDT  IORCOD
TOONE NWEBTT NI, FOATT ROWPNFI), NI, P3NP, ToNne IO VIV
FO3PEBSRTT, 3323,ReHT) €935 Fe3003) SONBRIINGS.

€33 .D0T B8 LITILANT.



SDFT WO RS K3

TR TVAVIZT TeDROTW WORAETooN e33R TeCES TRDIAINY
3336 T LHOTIVH) BUR,,a30 32T, VOEMIZ .

NW.F. Joédcer
ERIWOINVIENONOWIA VDIV VR AN A T2A)
BN AORLOD 352330001 203,
TR BB eI, &WjadoAlTtSsedd e300y

3.e30°. mmoge
TOORNFTEF
TIOFWE LT TORDD



WO

FooF&dT AP DHORBOTW FOWF NN, VIy3, VCIINYH D3, P3N

9D AODHD, 1956 (19570 FT0F 3T 9RDODD 2) B evd,_ 43 on
XX XX XX

3. 3POR3 &3, IWOGFF0 oW NY) &3, 3355 P ;NY.- (1) Aoz 3N 2,0TD
3ONPR DT 3 4T3 AT BRTIONINY FOWF s3I, WO WRET, Vo), OF CRTOAIINY
3335 335000y, KOO 0B IT,T3),,.

(2) RYPIZsTONR 200TD 3ONPR DTT3,4T30 AT CRTONNY ROWF DI, 20T
WR/ET, VOO, OF CDAIN €335 23350030, RO 300RBITT),.

XX XX XX

4. IR 3 D), IPWP;F0 03T SDINYN.- (1) LTS, FLOTT3, PVTALRS,
VBRI TD), TSBVFEW VCNTT), ATOETT a0V AWLITT aDI), LITAFITFTE e300
R2FCITR &30302,3) ), LIINTOVTW 93P FRIE aNIY, L9ITWT DTES 3BI00NT 9833,
RDEBANY 930D T WONKRTB) SNT 90 WONKLRTB) SNTTW BDNINPOT a3,
FSBRCANET® PR 20T ARV,I DIONTD, 20BN ROWOD WL PRI
BT,F30NCIT,R), G0 OF AAR,I 2NIN WBON 30NPR 2,080 OFEW ¢TI,
A0e)T CRBDIONNY BTRD), DI o 3353, BI,PROONTIFEY,. S8 VB-TTILT
BT 2 BN 2I0ART eDTORNTY, DODNREIVTOT FEBNF )RR IRPPRIT,T), D3I,
93T ) 0F° ALDE ) DONNRITOT eNINFI), INTIT,TBL)..

(2) DI Wl P3N BT,F,W0E AW I AWRFTD), DR De3e B
DONR T, M eNeeN YETRFE) NI, ¢ PIN ALDW 3T BT THone
Qe BHBNON SONPT Q@ 3), Ae)T CRETIOINE 23357} €930) BT,%,S00NTIT,T3),,.

XX XX XX

8. FoIW AT IPoRS, I-FWORS, IYPWOGF, GOR-RWOG:T,
DBRCE R[FE To0DTT) IFFD ; FWIF0) D), D3I, ABRCE RVFTW TDIV;
X333 0) QRN Y F)odeee W3 eD3), 930 W3 NYD.- (1) AWITsT, GURB-RLI3sT,
RIS eI, PVT-ALIT, ITSALE WFE DONTT) ATOED eIV ALFCITT a0, BT
BTE BY; NFCSTC) YSOINY) 3, WPTOT ASNPNR FOWORATW TIERDNE a0€e3
RYOA 20VTBIWIN, B8 BFTTLITE). DDE RBRAT BINS) a3, RCIINY L9IDART 33)0350£9
2033, ByS0R 335 95300 BIT P3NP BB,P,300NTIT,T,..

(2) 299030 w¥NR @WjeooA 300N, AP, SUT-AYRRS, RPIG3F a0I), YVa-
RNYOGT, ICRLE BFEW DOONTD), ATOED Vs AFCITT  a0I), TG BVTE a00D;
ReFCITT) B, -

(D) GO RNROT RBEIVT TyOIIRLINPMON €3 TyDTE), ©235edT0e V3 WEEOD
2,003 FTO3I0D WITW NTWTRT, BT,S,e300NTITT,:

XX XX XX

(&) TyoHoeer DINPMN NI, AP R IFT), NPT RF,E T3DIT, 0TI
A0e)T CRTICINY DIB3NPNR B3),%¥,e00N33T,03),:

XX XX XX

10. ORB-J LR DI), VRV-TLIOF;BF0 IOWF N~ (1) NT-TRRS NI, SVR-
RYOGT F 303e0,0NMe 30NPR 908:33), Aee)T TN ROWPI), AOWI0D
S BIT,T,.

XX XX XX

1079. LdBRCE IFE TOODTS FOWY .- TG TFE 8302, FORTIN 3ONPNR

€9033), M0e)T BRTWIONNY AOWFRI), OO 0B 3T,
XX XX XX



1023. TTOFD W FWCIFON JoWY.- F3ABRY, ATED AWITOR Jondn
£0233), ARedT BRTWIONY ROWPI), RO 203 T,

10¥. JdBRCPRTE DDy IWCIFTON JoWY.- F3ABPW, ATED RBPLITON
30NN 82330, AIT BRTIANY AOWFP I, A0 I T3,

XX XX XX

11. APOVIY D), PO VDRI, IBR ;0 FOWY.- (1) LIPOSZEY 9T IO
BORIS @33R, AWR;IN J0NPR SOWIY, AT CRTIOINE AOWPTI, RO
DOBITLLD,. ¢ AOWPE) ©9FWVTI),; FNWHBEI0N  2HIONAOINGT D0TD  FCAAT
DVVOTROW 9BON DB NI T,EY, 9FW IPOSAL LITW IS BORISE), 830
A0, Ne330, 30020 TaZ5a00@D0R MoedITESN B30T ABRC FOBLERE), 9303,
TN DOTDITEETT R T DVVOTDOT 900 VD AI,Say) SVOEIVINIE RPRTE3E €905
DRCRB T DODIREEIT RT3 €3 WoDA,Se)) GVOERT DIROTDOT €905
SIOYALIN FARIAIARIA K A ANK

XX XX XX

1. IVI0N ATy, B3BT I~ (1) Toer&dT LIPS DOBE AOWPNYD,
D3yd, 3T W NI), P3N (3T BB) RO, 2009803 80T WBRE Afes A AT S8
TPTOTW &)303RW,, 358, NOTT, -

() LB BORT'S ABR 500N, L9300

(i) LPOS[ALID AR50, €930

(i) LPOITRYY ABAsoN JNT: DI, AP VORI AWRsOON PN A
A 2T0TIN 9533 23I3T VYT 93PN )8 30N 805330, AT TRTIANY Dadyd,
ACINITeIARIOWADIAICEAANE

XX XX XX

(5) (1) OFT-TTTITS &TT D3y, 2CITT, BT, T,V &332, ATWR 5N, -

() ©BIR DI, 9B BRINITCIN  [MREFRH  WING  WOTD ORI,
WBNAIT,T, TNIY, EIT, 95330 OVT)TE AeNONTE), FRREEIT Toss BA, AOON INMeNT TA,
AR RBNY  DROTF, FTOIFELFTHRE), 2[093:30  AOeONse0N 0 R FDOT
FOrRTRAS 9T T VRTINS O0)TC BFT, 9WTC). DONAIRWIBITOTOT
BEEONED). BRCNWTEN BT,y VCBIT,T),.

(i) AODLNRWITITIR 90T IPISRHE)., 30D, 905 RTCINPNR 2PBEN,, L0TITE),
edENOIT EDRDT IO TS0 eNRDT 2,0T3) LI B2, OIVEINPT 33D 2,20,:€
e3TIOC 9T300 €33 202, BURIMPTIRODMINEE, TOITVE eI SVTL3T,N, DT NI,
e9TRLWT* SONPINTE) TR AT FOIINFE). TOTOOD 3IVTBLTITIVNG, WOT) TWRE T,
20T OF CRTIOINPR 93 DoNTITT,..

XX XX XX

11%. 3355 B35 (1) TG BTE VOODTIN SBRET, ATWY OFET 60a33), A0eIT
BTN 3355 335 ROTIONINIT,T,,.

(2) OVB-AYPRY, GUB-AYPIsT ATOED VY AFCIT DI, LATRFIZTE
BNV5RWCST QIO BRETF, NVW) OFEW  80e33), A0edT TCRDIOINY 3335 33;
AOTVODNINIST,T,.

11R. PR3, IO, PVRILPOR S, RBIWOG T, IBRCE RIFW oo TO),
JBFD Y FWCBTFO), IVRCE RIFXW eI FWCITV), APON I DI, AP
BORI,N IBWI;0 Bowey D3I, PI;NFSD, B3 .- A0T38, BT, SVT-RLI0R, ST -
RNYOGT, TRLE BFE DoO0NTDR), ATOED 2V ALFCITTY, LITURLE BT 00V RFCITT,
RO AL D), LIPS BORIS RWAT AOWY &0, B3NP, S0 30N 9PN,
19618 4583 WyTTOW JITBOD (V)X DOBT ORONED). OBWOPAT 33 DT



RALRF;0TE S0 &3¢S 13 DY 2023007 w002 e00N )8 80T WDVRENPN 03P
DIEIC ANV

12. AP I IWA 0D aDI), PN IVRIF'N IWF;0I-9R01 @)oo 2335
D3, DIPI ;NS D3, 3,83:;8¢0D '[eDH B, 3T]" FPP;NeN.- T3 9DAODTDT eHeBn
828398 AODDNY eHROT APFOZRTOTE ROB),NIR wFRBE,, -

XX XX XX
() Ty3BRY, ATR; 9PN W AWARs a0NI), ITILODNR AR IIG0
€953 02)ZTITI L33 N0 AR, -

(i) To%ss ATOETeY) ~BELATRORY WX 37,3 BP0 BRPIOONTE), 953200
FOOFET PO DDOWOEY) DA RBAT  3X,F 9T BRPOOOINT ).
QAORNNRWTIWOTOLT R Poe3T0T ToNe ORI RWIIWITOT &330353C0D FT/OART 03I,
2383,00:3), 908N BBTNTRL,L;

(i) Cozss ATETe) TWAT AONINPNR 2wPBED,, 9330 Oyt Y33 I FTE),
BBTITROT 23,T353CO SR 203, B3 1T DD 0RE R, NP, 290 AY, FBLBODEN;

(i) 1120 TJyTTLOT IBONED), NJ33yd, W3, A LTORISTIE T3, a0023-
ATFs, ARD JONPST 9TRONA), 3;T53CAD  NTVTR IO FLeR) NDVOWTR VWL,
OB3E). AWD RBRI DI, TRINAPRIIT, RCINR WwFDBED, T3 Jone) 0D F0edT
BRTIOINY NI &33T353COD P 357 BB, NTIT,3),,.

(iv) 112) TTTRT RO, BEN0W Nedyd, CITad, BBOINY TV &)303e,
BsTO3, T3 30NPNR TR AITE 8083 ST BREWoOINY INRIT 23;T3s3C0D 23351
9FBE VONTI T3,

(RR) APOS RPOAD DD, PO BWORIS &SRB, ATWR5N, WDV TLI)
&)O30£e 23350300N 38 3ONPN €9833), AedT CRTIONNE e3R0ONY, DONIRWIBITIVTI
DC30DEA), R LFDREN BE),Y,B0ONTIT, T,

(RAR) R2de3, Doty R23e3, CUT-AWES, AYPO@WS, AYOsT, VW -R2I0RS, PVT-ALO3sT,
dBRLE WFE J0ODNT, ATOED Qs AWCIT 2DI), ITUAEE TFEW 3BND;s RNeFC3T Q3B
ADTO3 Ty3AWBRW, ATARD, Tyd BVLOTOR) BREBE), DORNRWIITIIEOT DN,
23, OT ROINPNR 2 FTDEI), 20T 9T B3, TYOIVNT T, W2, 3R 95330
BRIMNTIRODNR 3N 33T, IOITERYN) 90 Tye3,00 aDROT  O3I0e)T3E
BEEONE). T)O30ED VBN TWjeI RS SVTL3T,N DAYCT eI, 9TR,LWT* 3ONYIS). T
OFE  8033), AT TRDIAWNT, TR A TOIINMPD), TBTITRLLD
B,P,BVNTITE),. 90T FWOIRLINF D), 20RON ABR;TY RO TR0 D3,
VB0 BT, ,200NT3T,T.0)..

XX XX XX

(323°%) 3B, RBR5INE B8 2NV P3sNP) A0 WNIT,3),, -

(i) BRTD NI, 3BLE® FTVNPLMN 9330 23DAE 3F,NAPTEN 3oNPR 93,3,
A0edC BT ONYD;

(i) 2DV T L3) 335N PN 9T I, A0edT B,

(iii) ©90%F 333, N FOWOTI 80T AT BRTOA;

(iv) AT, AWRsoN 3T, TIEWSNYDY, VaBECRC) €358, ATOODTIN a3,
BROLIDOINY FOWY DO B3I, AT CRTIAN.

XX XX XX

FTFO BNTFHOOON, VTR AT, WONKRD, AR . BENWD 300, 203e &weFE 2025



KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL
ONE HUNDRED AND FIFTY FIFTH SESSION
THE KARNATAKA LEGISLATURE SALARIES, PENSIONS

AND ALLOWANCES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

(LA Bill No. 25 of 2025)
(As passed by the Karnataka Legislative Assembly)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and
Allowances Act, 1956.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Legislature Salaries,
Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957) for the purposes
hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy sixth year
of the Republic of India, as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the

Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2025.
(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 3.- In the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and
Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957), (hereinafter referred to as the Principal

Act), in section 3,-

n

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words " seventy five thousand rupees ", the words
"one lakh twenty five thousand rupees" and for the words " four lakhs

rupees", the words "five lakh rupees" shall respectively be substituted;

" "

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words " seventy five thousand rupees ", the words
" one lakh twenty five thousand rupees rupees" and for the words " four lakhs

rupees", the words "five lakh rupees" shall respectively be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 4. - In section 4 of the Principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "one lakh sixty thousand rupees", the words
"two lakh fifty thousand rupees" shall be substituted ; and
(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "twenty thousand rupees", the words "twenty

five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.



2

4. Amendment of section 8.- In section 8 of the Principal Act, in sub-section (2), in
clause (d), in first proviso, for the words “three thousand five hundred rupees and seven
thousand rupees” the words “five thousand rupees and ten thousand rupees” shall be

substituted.

5. Amendment of section 10.- In section 10 of the Principal Act, in sub-section (1),

n

for the words " sixty thousand rupees", the words "eighty thousand rupees" shall be

substituted;

6. Amendment of section 10E.- In section 10E of the Principal Act, for the words

" sixty thousand rupees", the words "eighty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

7. Amendment of section 10J.- In section 10J of the Principal Act, for the words

" fifty thousand rupees ", the words "seventy thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of section 10K.- In section 10K of the Principal Act, for the words

" fifty thousand rupees ", the words "seventy thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

9. Amendment of section 11.- In section 11 of the Principal Act, in sub-section (1),
for the words "forty thousand rupees", the words "eighty thousand rupees" shall be

substituted.
10. Amendment of section 11A.- In section 11A of the Principal Act,-
(i) in sub-section (1),-

(@) for the words, brackets and figures “the Karnataka Legislature Salaries,
Pensions and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2009", the words, brackets and

"

figures the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances

(Amendment) Act, 2025" shall be substituted,;

(b) for the words "fifty thousand rupees", the words "seventy five thousand

rupees" shall be substituted; and

(c) in the eighth proviso, for the words “rupees five thousand” and “rupees one
lakh” the words “rupees twenty thousand” and “ rupees one lakh fifty

thousand” shall respectively be substituted.

(ii) in sub-section (5), in clause (ii) for the words "one lakh rupees", the words "two

lakh rupees" shall be substituted.



3
11. Amendment of section 11C.- In section 11C of the Principal Act,-
(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “two lakhs fifty thousand rupees", the words
"three lakh rupees" shall be substituted.
(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "two lakhs fifty thousand rupees ", the words

“three lakh rupees " shall be substituted.
12. Omission of section 11D.- Section 11D of the Principal Act shall be omitted.

13. Amendment of section 12.- In section 12 of the Principal Act,-
(i) in clause (c),-

(@) in sub-clause(iii) for the words “five thousand rupees” the words “twenty

thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-clause(iv) for the words “rupees two thousand five hundred” the words

“rupees ten thousand” shall be substituted.

(ii) in clause (cc) for the words “sixty thousand rupees” the words “eighty thousand

rupees” shall be substituted.

(iii) in clause (ccc) for the words “two lakh fifty thousand rupees” the words “three
lakh fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
(iv) for clause (h), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(i) one lakh ten thousand rupees per month towards meeting the expenditure
incurred by him on telephone and cell phone calls, constituency allowances

and postal charges;

(i) twenty five thousand rupees as the salary of the personal Assistant and the

Room Boy of the Member in the discharge of his duties as a member.”

I hereby certify that this Bill is Money Bill within the meaning of Article 199 of

the Constitution of India.

SPEAKER
Karnataka Legislative Assembly



4

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

(As appended to at the time of Introduction)

There is a considerable increase in the cost of living. Therefore, it is
considered necessary to enhance the salaries and allowances of the parliamentary
functionaries and the legislators and certain other benefits by amending the
Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act

2 of 1957).

Hence, the Bill.



5

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There will be a recurring approximate additional expenditure of Rupees Fifty

two crores per annum from the proposed legislative measure.

H.K. PATIL
Minister for Law, Justice, Human Rights
and Parliamentary Affairs and Legislation
and Tourism

K.R. MAHALAKSHMI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Council



6

ANNEXURE

Extract from the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956
(Karnataka Act 2 of 1957)

XXX XXX XXX

3. Salaries and sumptuary allowances of Chairman and Speaker.- (1) There shall be paid
to the Chairman a salary of seventy five thousand rupees per mensem and a sumptuary allowance of
four lakhs rupees per annum.

(2) There shall be paid to the Speaker a salary of seventy five thousand rupees per mensem
and a sumptuary allowance of four lakhs rupees per annum.

XXX XXX XXX

4. Residences of Chairman, Speaker etc.,.- (1) The Chairman,. Speaker, Deputy Chairman,
Deputy Speaker, Leader of Opposition, Government Chief Whip and Opposition Chief Whip each
shall be entitled to the use of a furnished residence in the City of Bangalore within thirty kilometers
from the limits of the City of Bangalore throughout his term of office and for a period of 3[sixty
days|3 immediately thereafter, or, in lieu of such furnished residence, to a house rent allowance at
the rate of one lakh sixty thousand rupees per mensem. The residence provided under this sub-
section shall be furnished on such scales and the plinth area thereof shall not exceed such limits, as
may be prescribed.

(2) The Chairman or the Speaker who is entitled to a house rent allowance, shall be entitled
for an allowance of twenty thousand rupees per mensem for maintenance and upkeep of the
residence and for layout and maintenance of gardens included in such residence.

XXX XXX XXX

8. Travelling and other allowances of the Chairman, the Deputy Chairman, the Speaker
and the Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of the Opposition ,the Government Chief Whips and the
Opposition Chief Whips on tours.- (1) The Chairman, the Deputy Chairman, the Speaker and the
Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of the Opposition ,the Government Chief Whips and the Opposition
Chief Whips shall be entitled while touring on duty connected with their offices to travelling and
daily or other allowances at the rates and upon the conditions specified in this section.

(2) While touring inside India the Chairman, the Deputy Chairman, the Speaker and the
Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of the Opposition ,the Government Chief Whips and the Opposition
Chief Whips shall be entitled,—

(a) for journeys by train to two times the single fare of the highest class available in the train:
XXX XXX XXX

(d) to daily allowance at rupees three thousand per day for the days of journey and for the
days of halt at any place:
XXX XXX XXX
10. Salaries of Deputy Chairman and Deputy Speaker.- (1) There shall be paid to the
Deputy Chairman and to the Deputy Speaker each a salary of sixty thousand rupees per mensem.
XXX XXX XXX
10E. Salary to the Leader of the Opposition.- There shall be paid to each Leader of the
Opposition a salary of sixty thousand rupees per mensem.
XXX XXX XXX
10J. Salary to the Government Chief Whip.- There shall be paid to each Government Chief
Whip a salary of fifty thousand rupees per mensem.
XXX XXX XXX
10K. Salary to the Opposition Chief Whip.- There shall be paid to each Opposition Chief
Whip a salary of fifity thousand rupees per mensem.
XXX XXX XXX
11. Salary of members of the Legislative Assembly and the Legislative Council.- (1)
There shall be paid to every member of the Legislative Assembly or of the Legislative Council a salary
of forty thousand rupees per mensem which shall accrue to him from the day on which he is

declared duly elected, or, in the case of a member nominated by the Governor to fill a seat in the
Legislative Assembly or the Legislative Council, from the date on which he is so nominated, or,



7

if such declaration or nomination is made before the vacancy occurs, from the date of occurrence of
the vacancy:

XXX XXX XXX

11A. Pension to the members etc.- (1) With effect from the date of commencement of the
Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2009 there shall be paid
to every person who has served for a period of five years as,-

(i) a member of the Legislative Council; or
(ii) a member of the Legislative Assembly; or

(iii) partly as a member of the Legislative Assembly and partly as a member of the Legislative
Council, a pension at the rate of fifty thousand rupees per mensum for the remainder of his life.

XXX XXX XXX
(5) Every member entitled to pension under sub-section (1) ,-

(i) shall be provided with one non transferable pass for him and his companion which shall
entitle them at any time to travel by road transport services of the Karnataka State Road Transport
Corporation from the ordinary place of residence of such member in Karnataka to any place in the
State of Karnataka or outside the State and back in such class of accommodation therein as may be
prescribed,;

(ii) shall for every financial year be entitled to receive in such manner and subject to such
conditions, as may be prescribed, a sum of rupees one lakh per annum payable in two equal
installments in the months of April and October for the purpose of travelling either single or with a
companion in one or more journeys by air or by railway in India.

XXX XXX XXX

11C. Sumptuary allowance.- (1) The Leaders of the Opposition shall be paid a sumptuary
allowance of two lakh fifty thousand rupees per annum.

(2) The Deputy Chairman, the Deputy Speaker, the Government Chief Whips and the
Opposition Chief Whips shall be paid a sumptuary allowance of two lakh fifty thousand rupees per
annum.

XXX XXX XXX

11D. Increase in Salary and Allowances of the Chairman, the Speaker, the Deputy
Chairman, the Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of Opposition, the Government Chief whips, the
Opposition Chief Whips, the members of the Legislative Assembly and the Legislative
Council.- The salary and allowances of the Chairman, the Speaker, the Deputy Chairman, the
Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of Opposition, the Government Chief whips, the Opposition Chief
Whips, the members of the Legislative Assembly and the Legislative Council shall be increased after
every five years commencing from 1st April, 2023 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under
clause (v) of Explanation to section 48 of the Income-tax Act, 1961.

XXX XXX XXX

12. Travelling and daily allowances of, and medical and other facilities to, members of
the Legislative Assembly and the Legislative Council.- Subject to such conditions as may be
determined by rules made under this Act,—

XXX XXX XXX

(c) Every member or on ex-member and the members of his family who are residing with and
are dependent on him shall be entitled,—

(i) free of charge to such accommodation in hospitals and dispensaries maintained by the
State Government or in hospitals or dispensaries notified by the Karnataka Legislature and to such
medical attendance and treatment as may be prescribed;

(ii) subject to rules made by the State Government to reimbursement of expenses incurred by
him for medical attendance and treatment obtained at any other place.

(iii) every ex-member who is in receipt of the pension under section 11A shall be entitled to
fixed medical allowance of rupees five thousand per month, subject to the condition that the said
amount shall be deducted in the medical reimbursement claim if any during the said month.

(iv) Every person who is drawing family pension under section 11B shall be entitled to rupees
two thousand five hundred per month as fixed medical allowance.



8

(cc) Every member of the Legislative Assembly and of the Legislative Council shall be entitled
to receive in the prescribed manner, a sum of sixty thousand rupees per month as constituency
Traveling Allowance.

(ccc) Every member including a Minister, a Minister of State, a Deputy Minister, a Chairman,
a Speaker, a Deputy Chairman, a Deputy Speaker, a Leader of the Opposition and a Government
Chief Whip and a Opposition Chief Whip shall, for every financial year, be entitled to receive in such
manner and subject to such conditions, as may be prescribed, a sum of rupees two lakh fifty
thousand rupees in two equal instalments payable in the months of April and October for the
purpose of travelling either single or with a companion in one or more journeys by air or by any class
or by any railway in India. A member shall not be entitled to any travelling or daily allowance for
such journeys.

XXX XXX XXX
(h) every member shall be paid an allowance of,-

(i) twenty thousand rupees per month towards meeting the expenditure incurred
by him on telephone and cell phone calls

(ii) sixty thousand rupees per month as constituency allowances;

(iii) five thousand rupees per month on postal charges;

(iv) twenty thousand rupees as the salary of the Personal Assistant and the Room

Boy of the Member; in the discharge of his duties as a member.
XXX XXX XXX

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengalur, 20t Mar, 2025, P7, W.D. , Copies 300



