2e0 2E3 Bk RN

Foorédd NCIWOTT (3T RBR) AFCoDH T, 2025
(20253 QgeRzRiodh dFeods Fos5-02)

(Brtsd ITRRPOOT IHTRIROIR WONTTTT THITY)

TOOEET NCITWOTT IR0, 196130, DI R, 3TFBE e300T 2u0T3) IGKONT.

Q). YTEN0T FOTWIWTIE NTWLBNLMON FEET NTeIWOTT eIROND, 1961
(19623 TREEIT 9RO 13)30, aNIJ R, 3T e330TITH T3 O3NT.eNBIHTBOOT ;

YT 003 NEAT0%5T DR, TV WRE W), TIEET Tos c)POSN0TBORDOT &3
EODT0I LIRDONIIZIONE:-

1. FOZRW, BID) DI, WYTOY.- (1) &8 PIADENTI), TOE&T NTeIWoTT
(3TN FBE) 9RO, 2025 DOT) FEONITT,.

(2) VR &8 TRTWS 230N WIB3T,T,.

2. ®TOD 30 W BB.- Toor&T NTe)WOTT IR0, 1961 (19628 Foeedd
eI 13)3 ([E), BTYEN0TW DR IRDONNEIOT) FBODEINT) 33¢ TyFTT
0)e3VTB-20¢C). "803) WRENY” D02 BINY BN "eNRTY WRENY" D0 BWRPT,
30300 8RIET),.

3. ®)T0D 150 3WIBR.- 2RO IRIONGNT 153¢ &WTTLAT (1) R -TyTTEOTE),
"800 SRTY BRTIONNPR" D0 RBWNY WHROAR "80%3) ©OF TRTIANFTTNR" 02
BENPI, T3S RIT,N.,.

4. F3309 160 3T BB.- aDR LPRAORTDT 163¢ TFTLTE,,,-
(R) (7)¢ DOBT 33220003 &8 2NI0RITWI, ALDAITE,, DOTT:-

"8) NTe) VE,EDOW D  BRPVIMN  e33Tn) 9T 33T DP0ET
FNROTDINEG) 9T 33T TEN0W RIWRDOTNE) O30T 93T WOWOITW TjeNaddy
WPRIT,EL), DI, WOE03 TRAUID Ozt RN CRITTI,N &8 9D
NVBVWORNFE WOBIN BRBVOIINITE), TONL &8 9NIONNE NBWORNY  0e3n
TWORARTOZ 90T NTeIWOOS  SECOTEIONT), 900N BRAD)  €953ad9
T BRA) SBCOTER TWAYPTODOR) IR TOT e ¥,e300NB 33,30,

WOW: 88 BT B E3NLMN, NCIDOTT PROT NTCd YT LTTI
"WO03E TjaR "2 T8 SNIODTRINF D, WwPNRRPIT), DOTT:-



() NCed BELEIN, 9T 33JT/BSTOD TEN0W ATAONR WwI WS, TORR)T
9300 3WOZPTWI )T 9T GOAONTY, WFAITHE) 9T €9e3a300)RI)T) €900
WVEPORIYH T, 9T

(i) NCe) BELETII,, B833/e3T0N EN0W AWAC, B FRNOT A YT, DB03T0oN
002D BPwe  B3T/BTOD  WHBIST BT WFTONAS o)t x,301
NG5BS DRITHTI) €9Ted0 e33T/eSFTANOT BB FRP )T IT300 €333/e3TANOT O30 T3E
OB ALE8S WFTIN 98 BRI, 9T

(i) NTBed VEEII) 0RWINE BT TOX WDV T 33535000
SBRISTI S BP0 V3T AFPT, WOROITW FaNeddd, FyeFed SUB L3O esnen
23643 AETBOH T 95300 23E30350M02303 2300 TBITHTIY, E9T3e00

(iv) NCed YDA T DeS3MON WOEOITW aD3), 9INWI &jeioesedsdy, WA
B3N T3N/2wTONARTT, VAN T BRTMINR 900 201/ NV NY, 3jeddI®
303,303,533 ReSOD, WFRITHT), L9T3209

(V) RBTETT O30T FOODE FRBRBONE), NTed YEJZBITT T3 RCBIT BI,NDY,
0303 T¢ B8, AOONMPTIOT WeS03ev0N &BTEO)T)."

() "e33d 3ONPHNYR" D0 VBBNY WHRANR "®B3I), JRENFPIIN” D020 BBRPS,
B33 RITT,;

(R) "20T) AReIT BRWIONTIET" D02 JINY TR "80T30 OF TSRTONF TR
D0 BBNP, &B3ABRCBRIT,R,,; eI,

(Bd) TWBOINT, WENIWIT,,,.

5. BB 160d-8 ST RJBB.- (1) DRD IPIDRDT 1600 IJFTLTAS  (2)3€
VT -TTTLT,, -

(D) "e38) 3OMSHNPLTR" D02 JBAY WRBONR "®BI), FRENFTTNR” D0 IWRPI,
BJREIOWOIR I IC AN

() “200T) APeIT BRTDWIONNPR" D0 VWM WHRONR "800 OF BRT/ANP TR
N0 BWNP, TSR RERAIT,,,; 203,

() BBOIVFWE) -

(i) 2007 3ONMPNOI" D0 RBWNY WWANR "eNRTY WRENPNOI” D0 BWNRPI,
@3O3 RITTY,; T3,

(i) "80T3) SRTY BRTIANNPN03" D0 BHNY WHON “"TBY OF SRTIANLNOI"
N0 BBNFI, B3R RCBRIT,T,,.

6. ©B00 180 3THRHB.- THo© HICHTHT 187X BFTLTE, -
() (1)K ev-BWTTe3, -



(i) 20233y, BRTIONTIFR" D0W BHINE VTR “2DRTY OF TRTIANTPR" D0
BPNF ), &30S RITTY,; eI,

(i) “2,0T3) SRTY TRTIANNPR” 02 BWNY TR 80T OF TRTIOTILT" D0
BENF, T33RCRRITI,.

() (23 QUB-TTTLTE), "B®I), TRWIONTYR" D0 BHINY WO "DTBY ©F
ONLIADICINAT-IN S IARENSIARA AN LI VA IOWOI R ENIC T A AN

7. 18, 180 D3I, 183 VBRI ®FOANY ACIFTW.- PO LPIORDT  183¢
R TTERE 303300, T BNOD BRF ByFTLNT, RCORIT,),, OTS:-

"18-. WOWITERIFD® DPOT dNVOWNY WS FEFRRRAIIF.- JOBNPI,
B3sBEBRRI)TT,N, N3ed) BEED DB, NCIW0S SWIR PR NOToN
FOONEDIEORAD)  ATETeY) WIPRABIOD 3DROT  WO0TERBRE I, DT
SBRBITE),.  WITE  aD3I)  DFRB0N  FoohEITON  sH3B),  sPonE BT
QORI RWTITOOT IPISHE) B3T,53),.

18-2). OTNTRVINY ATo0™o WCDF.- ATETY) APRTHRE  IOTNTRTI
Q000  TOONE 53R 0N,  AOARITLE),. TOWTRTZ o0 FToONE 2353300
FOODEIFON aN3Y, TONERBRBTIY) DOV RWIITOOT IGPOSEE) 83,530,

18-2. DT, BRPPAT 9PT0D.- (1) T9 LIRIONRNE DI, FooFEdT 8D
W8, PRINT ARG 9DACHED, 2004 (20048 TEEIT LIPIOND 14)3 QUEB00BPNRTI,
O303¢  3sBONY MU OPAWT, TOWIOD YUoB  IF0  NeedXTehd, 03,
FWOFOONI* VO Y083 €920 a0 eI, sNTLY 93, R), A0S 95300 Aadhoes T
QOB BT IO F0N;ZT TED5L0 VEIV SIG0 WIBTEY,, T0580 Y0 0PI
DRENY 93D, BB N ) 9TV ROWORTIE,, DBXe,,0°, RIBODT
DBR,,0° T & DI Toky ATETY) WPFLINRRPAT OBk 9TOR [T
SO BIT,T,,.

(2) DA, 0% RBIONT DRAY,,0° BFW0 LPTLINPPLAIE 9DTOON 333 X,03
DA O NB-IJFT3L (1)3D). e3fNAT 9RTONS) A AT [IDOD 3R, S8
9RAODENT NVBVWOPNF R T)adad3), FyWe,3T,E),,."



T3 L3NS 3D, ToTINY BCPF
(@dco&:%ﬁds‘i HoRDIRN ONIATOE)

e3,R30,0308, NTeIWT a0I), RS B3 NTeIWoBD) RIS TH2WD D&, WONY
9NV 3 3ROWT DI, WORNOITW WBRLRCIY )PISNPOT SRDETN THWES MHOZNSD
I, WsINFI, BFAIRNTT,N, FOee&dT NTIWTT IR, 1961(19628 TR0eEdT
IR0 13)30, ST 3I0TBIHTI 93T Fe30T3) BWOMEBATS.

333, D0 B8 LIPEODT.



SDFT WO RS K3

FWA,ed3 TOAVOI3T TeDROTON O30T B2, &323,59) VORI,



R) 390300233 JOAIN BWPoRDTOR DI, IS K3

DOTB 7

(1) &8 DOBW DDROT ALDRD)  TyARNATIE 18 T30
WOWNEFEBREDTS sDRDT BIHE a0, aNFATOD  dPoST,NS
TOODERIRO eNIY, eNERRWNF I, DONEINE ZDRDT CIIREN
RTOETT, L9RDTOTe30, DETBIZTI.

(2) T3 VOB ZDROT ALDAD) TWAADATIE 182) FTTTEde) TOTNTRT3I
Q0T GXDTOD BDDOTWNTRTIZ D0V  TOODE a35e3A, MONS
TOODEIPON eI, aANE ARV NFP D, DODEINY DRDT DODIREN
RTIETT, L9RNTOTID), CTBIZ .

TWA,ed3 FOAS GFV0RTOTE &)Fo503/0¢2300) e30lTOR & BT, NG,

T3 ,003) AN°. TO%ED,,
T 2003 TEIL0D), BRTIIRBTA
ABTOT 2003

3.30°. mmogé
TOONFTEF
FIOF T APOT TOWS)




WO
Bo0F )8 NODTOTT 9DAOHED, 19618 (19628 Foord s e9BIohad 13) vd, 3 23on

XXX XXX XXX

3. NOATOTR 3BT ), BVWBODIF,T),.- O353¢ 353,03, A30RYTE B3I, S5
9IDDODNT NTJWORFNYD 230N WTV[OT DVOOTDOR €33) S0ONPINY) 200T,00TI
33080003, &3 LRPIONDT &NBR NTBIWoTS (RS 3, BBETPOLRT, BRTI) IO
RIBBD), BRI AFTE), NBLITOTIOR) 5e300T0en), a0I), TooeddT NTeIoTT
(BT BB) 9PN, 19858 HYTOLE T 4ed TyTTLTRE), SVBWORAITOI 3T3)30
B3RO,  AOWOCH RT3 BRTI) SBRITZEL), B0 SCRITHTIDI,
2DIOTNTTVAI T,

WOV 1.- 9T BE,LTA N 3N e9Ted0 NMIRPNTAONE 3N 9500 3T 36T
BELLNYS). NI, MNP AONE 3N 2,0T38,03 TBed), LONRBONTY, 9T 3530033
RPN, NTCeIWOTI BRODTT 9330 90T T3OSROT) ONTRNR 95300 3353000083
RPT, ROWORDATO3 &)35tT NTeIWOTS HAS 80, BBONIT,T),,.

)WV B2.- T3 9IRIONTNT 2NETN @D0RT VBT 33A3ROT) NTeITWOTS RS,
0T VRENY 9BRONEBR A0WDNCIT,E), SWC, OB, 9[BHPANOT 931
SeLTORDTIT.

XXX XXX XXX

15. NBITOT STERBINYD), ADFR BRI TB,03 IR DRWONR, To©
FRWIP T w0 BV, R ODI), A LFDNPHT) BoRBACOD NI~ (1) NTed
3eE30DE). T MBS STLIBIWD), 9Fwo ORATINTD). 3CDANPTY,03 TR
FRRWONTY, 20A,3e0N AN TR, 9T NTed 23¢E30NE). e9Tw0 933 3T,RP).
900 DRR,BINY). 303,03 B3, BT, 2B.0DT), €950 O3t 93T
R, SRTTRPE 9T A LTOAIE O08¢ NTeITWITD, 9BV ~EEONWTI
&0Ce3 20T ST BTN dR,DRDTIDVETOT I, SONOT L30LIN3T,3),,.

XXX XXX XXX

16. NOIWOOT FOF) Y30 FTONFNYH TWOBACODPINIT,E), .- (1) BT,
VRENPNOI TLD WONA,TEFOTI) 90 03 LDTITY)TIN FOTIWTIES O30T &350
NBeION &3R,e3:30,, SNTITRP,S; 9T

(2) AR, NTIWITT) TRE), NTed 23¢E30NT,; NTIONE), 9TV d)eTNANTE),
DRI 90 SRTTRP)E; L9IG00

(3) NBAONE). 23 NP, INTITRF,) BT WRENPN0O3 FLR 30N, O003¢
BsTONT, D3R RATR,ES; 9T

(4) O30T w3 0D, VXD BRI, NTed VLN 23TON BTIRIE), BRTI,
03T STTS), DOED 350T3IS; 9T

(5) O30YTE W3ODT), 9T 9TIE). NTed VWON W), Tt ORI
Ty RLON0T WTINTS s30T 93T e300 TR TIES; 95300



(6) WRATRP),E ToOBRYT 933 DOCMN, 300083T9,N 95330 JeSMoN 95309
O300eYTK &3RI,EIT), NTed [T €950 NTed VW FRCTIES 003K e35303R0NN 900
€930 2.BONIVLRODN O30e) T FOIT), €953 2,83, 0T3e33), e00RTRP,S; 95300

(7) 88 RIRDNDT NPT 90 TR LIPTFHINRPITOT FToOTWE), aN3IY,
903 DC30NE), BRTI), 933), NTed Y&, O30T 230D, 23000E3 23003, €353
23007383, NTed QLIS IO I3 2300T3IISEITTOTIey) DEIEONEIVTI 230¢e3 €3Bd SONHNPTR
)R.DRWBIDOTOT TOUWRRNOT 9T 20T AOedT BRDIONINPN IR.DALTIDITOT
20D, 0T LITI L9RTBOOTBOR TWOLRININIT,T3),:

RBTOD), (7). ORI, VE3LNDAT TOONETI,N TOUOIARE  €IBRO)  2uOT
SONMPNAZ  TRDOANTITZLIL), aNI), WO 80T SRTBY  BRHWaAINPNO3
FTEHANTIT, L.

XXX XXX XXX
16. NOATOTR w3 NS, VRATAY, I,
XXX XXX XXX

(2) TR DRATAFLD) 3R, 28 003 NTBe)TWoTD) SITUIE DEECNIVE o003 €33
3ONPINPR QAR DIVTIDTOETOL  TOUIWOANOT  a0J), WOWY AT  CRTIANRLH
IR,DRWTBIDITOT HIVD,SSAI0T L3O NIT, T30,

WC03), TOUYWIAE TPRON) 0T 30NPN03  TFLDONNTIT,EL), D3I,
250,30 80T SPT) BRTIONNPNOI FLNANTIT,T.L)..

XXX XXX XXX

18. ODAODDT WO OFIMON Toedod; WORS, QID.- (1)88 9IRIONNT
95300 €9T3T BN TR AT O0e)TE DODNT SVTWOFNP R, 9IT0 aD0RT) 00T
3RS O0YTE DWORPINPR, 90 ROINPRD, SV OAI O303¢ e3ne), €905
V) OFTIMON &3 LIRIODNNTE). 23T FWB O0YTE Y3T BOBWSIONTY, NVTWORANTT,
9B LIEONVT &3¢S 80e33), CRTIANNDN A DRWIITIOTOT IS0
NI, IOT 353,000 B8 0TS B8 TyTTLATS aCTN 37 9Tz B8 LIRVONTNTE)., 2 PRPOTI
O30t V3T VTWOGE a3 31D e9WTE 0T DEBESTONET 2083 ST
BREOINPR IR DRWTBIWITOT 299,300 BOLIVNI T,

(2)33¢ TWyTTTW NOBWOGBNF D, GV 0NA NTeIWOTS &3530000a3:30, SRS TS
L9330 BERIEYT, I0TIEITRISTBIeS eITWTOGT e9TTORONOT) DBLEZTOCI 3BT
03503 B5B0N) 9T eIBTOGETRY, T WRETR), RTIR)TY, WVO0TNRBATT (1):¢
VRVTYTTEIT aNCBNR €933 03003 IS THDOIIVNTIRRRE €3 2059, 303 B3N, TN
LITVOOG 2VTWITH TR, €923 2VOTNWDAITOT €93RONE). ITTOG DLECNT 0D
BV0TE 330003 B3OSR0 DR T,N B3, BRTWIOCNNYN A DR WTBIWIWOT DI R,
20D, NAN 0T TWOLITINITLT),.

XXX XXX XXX

TFFO BNTFHOOON, NFR ARG, 0N, TR , JAND 300, 103e [eee 2025



KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL
ONE HUNDRED AND FIFTY FIFTH SESSION

THE KARNATAKA PAWN BROKERS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

(LA Bill No. 02 of 2025)
(As passed by the Karnataka Legislative Assembly with Amendment)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Pawn Brokers Act, 1961.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Pawn Brokers Act,
1961. (Karnataka Act No 13 of 1962) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the seventy sixth year of
the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Pawn Brokers (Amendment) Act, 2025.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 3.- In the Karnataka Pawn Brokers Act,1961
(Karnataka Act No 13 of 1962) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in
section 3, in the explanation-2 for the words “five years” the words “three years”
shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 15.- In the Principal Act , in section 15, in sub-
section (1) for the words "five hundred rupees", the words "five lakh rupees” shall be
substituted.

4. Amendment of section 16.- In section 16 of the principal Act,

(a) after clause (7) the following shall be inserted, namely,-

“(8) shall not use any coercive action either by himself or by his agents or
family member for recovery of money from the pawner and any form of coercive
recovery shall be liable for punishment under the provisions of this Act and
empower the Registering Authority to suspend or cancel the Registration of such

pawn broker as provided under the provisions of this Act.

Explanation: For the purposes of this section, "coercive Action" by a pawn

broker against the pawner include the following, namely:-



2

(i) exerting pressure or obstructing or using violence to or insulting or
intimidating the pawner or his/her family members, or
(ii)) persistently following the pawner, his/her family member from place to
place or interfering with any property owned or used by him/her or
depriving him/her of, or hindering him/her in the use of any such
property, or
(iii) frequenting the house or other place where the pawner resides or
works, or carries on business, or happens to be, with an intension of
taking coercive action, or
(iv) using the service of private or outsource or external agencies, criminal
background to negotiate/urging the pawner to make payment using
coercive and undue influence, or
(v) Seeking to take forcibly any document from the pawner which entitles
the pawner to a benefit under any Government programme.”
(b) for the words "six months", the words "ten years", shall be substituted,;
(c) for the words "one thousand rupees", the words "five lakh rupees", shall be
substituted; and
(d) the proviso shall be omitted.
5. Amendment of section 16A.- In section 16A of the principal Act, in sub-

section (2),-

(a) for the words "six months", the words "ten years", shall be substituted,;
(b) for the words "rupees one thousand", the words "rupees five lakh", shall
be substituted; and
(c) in the proviso,-
(i) for the words "one month", the words "three years", shall be
substituted; and
(ii) for the words "rupees five hundred", the words "rupees two lakh",
shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 18.- In section 18 of the principal Act,-

(a) in sub-section (1),-
(i) for the words "fifty rupees", the words "three lakh rupees", shall be
substituted; and
(ii) for the words "one hundred rupees", the words "five lakh rupees”,

shall be substituted.



3

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words "ten rupees", the words "two lakh
rupees", shall be substituted.
7. Insertion of new sections 18A, 18B and 18C.-After section 18 of the

principal Act, the following new sections shall be inserted, namely,-

“18-A. Settlement of disputes by Ombudsperson.- The Government shall
by notification appoint an Ombudsperson who can act as mediator between the
pawner or pawn-broker, for settling the disputes. The procedure and guidelines for
the settlement and mediation shall be in the manner as may be prescribed.

18-B. Grievances redressal forum.-The Government shall establish suitable
grievance mechanism. The procedure and guidelines for grievance mechanism shall
be in the manner as may be prescribed.

18-C. Authorized Officer.- (1) The Group-B Officer of Revenue Department
or Rural Development and Panchayath Raj Department or Urban Development
Department or Town Planning Department or Woman and Child Development
Department or Social Welfare Department or Minority Welfare Department or Tribal
Welfare Department or Backward Classes Welfare Department shall report if any
person is in contravention of the provisions of this Act and the Karnataka
Prohibition of Charging Exorbitant Interest Act 2004 (Karnataka Act No 14 of 2004)
to the concerned Registrar, Assistant Registrar or any Officer authorized by the
State Government in this behalf.

(2) The Registrar, the Assistant Registrar or any Officer authorized may on his
own motion or on the report submitted by the Officers referred in sub-section (1),

shall take action under the provisions of this Act.”



4

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

(As appended to at the time of introduction)
It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Pawn Brokers Act, 1961
(Karnataka Act No 13 of 1962) to protect economically vulnerable groups and

individuals from the undue hardship usurious interests rates and coercive means of

recovery by licensed money lender and unlicensed money lender.

Hence, the Bill.



5

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed measure.



6

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

Clause 7: (1) Section 18-A proposes to be inserted by this clause
empowers the Government to prescribe by rules the
procedure and guidelines for the settlement and the manner
of mediation by the Ombudsperson.

(2) Section 18-B proposes to be inserted by this clause
empowers the Government to prescribe by rules the
procedure and guidelines for grievances mechanism of the

grievances redressal forum.

The proposed delegation of Legislative power is normal in character.

KYATHASANDRA N.RAJANNA
Minister for Co-operation
excluding Agriculture Marketing

K.R. MAHALAKSHMI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Council




7

ANNEXURE
EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA PAWN BROKERS ACT, 1961

(KARNATAKA ACT 13 OF 1962)

XXX XXX XXX

3. Pawn-broker to obtain licence.- No person shall, after the expiry of six
months from the date on which the provisions of this Act come into force in any
area, carry on or continue to carry on business as a pawnbroker at any place in
such area, unless he has obtained a pawn-broker’s licence under this Act and after
the commencement of the Karnataka Pawn Brokers (Amendment) Act, 1985, except
on payment of security deposit as provided in section 4A.

Explanation 1.- Where a pawnbroker has more than one shop or place of
business, whether in the same town or village or in different towns and villages he
shall obtain a separate pawnbroker’s licence in respect of each such shop or place
of business.

Explanation 2.- Every pawn-broker’s licence granted under this Act shall be
valid for a term of five years, but may be renewed from term to term.

XXX XXX XXX

15. Pawnbroker advancing smaller amount or receiving higher interest
than that specified in accounts to be punishable.- (1) Any pawnbroker who
actually advances an amount less than that shown in the pawn-ticket or in his
accounts or registers or who takes or receives interest or any other charge at a rate
higher than that shown in the pawn-ticket or in his accounts or registers shall, on
conviction be punished with fine which may extend to five hundred rupees.

XXX XXX XXX

16. Certain other acts of pawnbrokers to be punishable.- A pawnbroker
who,-

(1) takes an article in pawn from any person appearing to be under the age of
fourteen years or to be intoxicated

(2) purchases or takes in pawn or exchange a pawn-ticket issued by another
pawnbroker

(3) employs any person under the age of sixteen years to take pledges in pawn

(4) under any pretence purchases, except at a public auction, any pledge while in
pawn with him

(5) suffers any pledge while in pawn with him to be redeemed with a view to his
purchasing it

(6) makes any contract or agreement with any person pawning or offering to pawn
any article, or with the owner thereof, for the purchase, sale, or disposition
thereof within the time of redemption; or



8

(7) sells hypothecates, pawns or otherwise disposes of any pledge pawned with him
except at such time and in such manner as is authorised by or under the Act

shall on conviction be punished with imprisonment for a term which may
extend to six months or with fine which may extend to one thousand rupees or with
both

Provided that for an act referred to in clause (7), the term of imprisonment
shall not be less than one month and the fine shall not be less than five hundred
rupees.

XXX XXX XXX
16A. Pawnbroker to redeem pledges.-
XXX XXX XXX

(2) Any pawnbroker who fails to so redeem shall, on conviction, be punished
with imprisonment for a term which may extend to six months and with fine which
may extend to rupees one thousand:

Provided that the term of imprisonment shall not be less than one month and
the fine shall not be less than rupees five hundred.

XXX XXX XXX

18. General penalty for contravention of Act, etc.- (1) Whoever
contravenes any of the provisions of this Act or of any rule or of any terms or
conditions of a licence made or granted thereunder shall, if no other penalty is
elsewhere provided in this Act for such contravention, on conviction be punished
with fine which may extend to fifty rupees and, if such person has been previously
convicted whether under this section or any other provision contained in this Act,
with fine which may extend to one hundred rupees.

(2) Any person who after having been convicted of the offence of carrying on,
or continuing to carry on the business of pawnbroker in contravention of the
provisions of section 3, continues to commit the same offence in the same year,
shall in addition to the fine to which he is liable under sub-section (1), be punished
with a further fine which may extend to ten rupees for each day after the previous
date of conviction during which he continues so to offend.

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengalur, 10t Mar, 2025, P7, W.D. , Copies 300



