2e0 2E3 Bk RN
FooF 8T 30 FWDF ORCG (3T RBR) IG3C0DF, 2025
(202538 QgeSTRed dFeows Foad-15)
(BRFEIT DHRTTLI0NOT WONCHRTTRG TRTTQY)

TOOEET PR TWPT ORCG 9RO, 201130, aNI R, STVBE 3003 20T
ATODT.

Q). AV,INOTW  FORBIWE NBLINPMON Foe&dT B0 TWYLT LRI,
201130, (201480 TOE&T  9DAODED A0Bs 38) D3R, I3TWRBE 230030
O30T NBIHTOOT;

QR T3 NEPTIHE DR,FVTE WRE W), FRREET Ty dPOSEN0OBODOT B3
EORT0I LIRDDONIIZIONE:-

1. FO3 W, BRIV aD I3, TWB0723.- (1) T3 L9IPNIONTNTT), FOREET 30 TRPT DR
(STNFBE) 9RO, 2025 DO FEONIT,E),.

(2) VR B8 RT3 200N WTIT,R,.

2. J309 20 SWHRJBR.-TooredT PR TWYLT ARG 9PIODD, 2011 (20143
FTooEET RO 38)(VY), BRENI0T 2R IR0 V3 ¢DFINI)T 23¢
RTOTW  (B) DOBWD). () NBROBBE)S BTOINTE 3B0W00D 88 s0RITI,
AORIT,R,, NOTT:-

"), BT0I) TOREET 50 TOWIORN LIDAOED, 1964 (19643 FIEEIT IR0
12)3 39, 104 95330 673 TYTTLNFE 230eNF 03 OB FFD DYPRTONY) 00e)TI
T30, BYTOL AT, 9T, 2E0,DTBIT,T).,.

OO J/T0D), V), OITNYI, HyeoTeooN (aerially) €3T,T0T3T,00, 03D,
O30T BIT AP, BONRRITEL),.”

3. BTV 40 3T RBR.- cDR LRIONTNT 43¢ WyTTLIT (3) VB RTTLIT) 33
"QRB,B.4030 AT CRDICNNYETN”  D0W  J[WNAYTR  WXBUN  "80:33), AT
ONOFARIOWMALEIN oA HFNSTARAATAL NV IOWO I T A AV



4. RT0ed 50 3T BR.- cDR 9RO 53¢ TyFTLT (V) NB T, 303
"9 ,3, 4T3 AOeIT BRTWIAINPR” 02 BWNRPT 22TEDN “60e33), AT B ONNPLR" 02)
BINFI, Ty3RBCRRIT,T,,.

5. B30 90 STWI_RBR.- 0RO LINIONNT I &yFTEITIE),, -
(i) VBT TTED (2)T WBN B8 B30T, &)303/¢R3 R I T, DOTWT:-

"2) AFR T5030O0DNEY) WRTWLPONT, R0E_LON3N SRTTRPEE B L3Te,N,
2BRONT), FWPT 0B NTEH 0T E3BREDR I 234003 AT N 95300 9T
ALEDE €9T3e0 2T I @230, BT WPNPORTE FoSRILIV0TION A BRI IT3e00
Vs A3PETLBTI TR0, €9ITTeI0 O30YTE BI3T ROO0RS WO T, BONBRIT,E).

(i) QVTETTED (3)T VTWN B2 ZNI0ORITTR, B3R RERAIT,E,, DOTIT:-

"3) RDIACNTNTE STRLDAOITW PR FWPTON TF,Y3Is TR0 BT,AEDs 03I,
DT3B ITB0D IPETH 9T &8 TPAROE O0eHTE BP0  TOSRIWT,
70,30 ToNe TOEET 230 TOWICH 9RO, 1964 (19648 TROEEIT 9IPIOND
12)3 955950 XIV-d-8). ADER BDBRCIVE 9TTOFNY F0WOFRE), TP 230
PND ISBT BB T,N TBRERT dFHR 050300000 E). e9ReI2FTOTBONN,
SBONWIBIT NI, TR Vo500 ONT 3CeoE ) 9030 NTIT,T,."

6. ®¥yBFOP 120 RF3BRCWN.- NP IRIONDT 1236 TTTLTW TR &8
EODTT, T3A3RCBRITE, DOTT:-

12, IR ©o;03000HTW  AW,0D.- (1) S 9PNIDDTRODE).  IHR
VO;03O0NY) I, TWTOODENFI), TR 0  ARBI)TT,N  €9IN35eITIe3
LRDTIONP I, 203, W3T A2),0R0NT), ATOE Tag) SLaNT 200BIT,T3),,.

(2) NOTTTTED (1) SeDTeINTBITIVE LIDTOONE) aNIB), SOTTT &WINeE NS, €930
ROWPNY), B3N, DTS PO a0I), 3T Al WOI,NE) QAONeAIRWTBITO3
JVITZE),. (N NOBETTRWER SRR 9PTONS) aNJ), N°TCC SWPIIT
IRTITNFI, TR V5030 ONTI EITISTTY DRE R FILRLWBDITI."



T3 L3NS 3D, ToTINY BCPF
(IFeoBH, HORUTR ORIXTO3)

FoOFET 8P TWPLT ORG 9PN, 2014 (20143 Tooe&dT 9RIOND 38)0,
D053, ‘3R TRPTFT 0N0IB O30T e30R3 F35NY e99eIFoTBON, 3,03 PI)
DI, PR TRPLF, FWPAB PRAID WRBIST, TOSPNWEBEN 230000 o HDIST,
ROWORNAT TBaNL ToEET 30 TOWIORN LIPAODD, 1964 (19648 FI0EEIT IR0
12)3 959500 XIV(Q)TS), ODEFRBRATOT IBTOFNYLTR  IOWORAT  IF3ony
€92) O3B NN TR V503500, AOARD IR0 AIIRRPLRIING.

RATED PRedd NI, ARRE BT NNWLITO,NS 25000 TFTBMNS VTBWOFNP,
ENT,SBR 3T TRREET 2300 FOTWIOD PO, 1964 (19648 T EdT 9RO 12)30,
3B BUING. 005 Rag@Le2d, D500 00 e 0D IV, T
e, MO AOTF JTIT, TWOWLE Vs oa0I), V3T ane BRCNOTT® JTIT,
BOOED Ty a0I), VITD, YINPAS WD BNy SR)EFNPD)., IFTETT 03I,
AOTE LT BRINY FOTFTBONE), Toss AT BT 2520020,00030, BTEBT 208, TBCPT. &8
3TV BRO) ATOETT  PReIODR,; AOTZ AT aNI), FOWIOD IRTONE) €930
YT 25e302I0,0AN0T BRTBRENTOIRNT)T, V03DBBAIZE. ATETT BZRedINS
2,32,33003 AT, TyTTLNY TODDAIWON 903TTI),  ST,ToBes DDT  aINE 33,y
DYTOLRITHTN.

22,00 &N, F°TFTT SLeNTO30N) AT BT @WTe0RTOTeIdNE3), 3aNe DODDNRED,
SOISTORBNE) DI, SDET STRINY DROT BWP3I D3R UNIHTDOL, 0390 )T
JDTOIMON  RITIETTW N 2FTBONT),  INIBBRRING. 80 TWYIAD 93T
RTTNTS), TOBION, B2, AN,

€33, 00T B8 ITCODNT.



SDFT WO RS K3

BWA)S TOARVOIT Faad) OP0)TK B2, 3323,53830, WwPNRRORTIHD)..



R) 39,0300 3 TOITODTOVE VI o, IS &3,

DOT-6

123¢ RBTTDE 2DRDT 3O3R B LIFRT ()3 VT -RFTE),
edFE V50O CNT LIPTIONE) 203, 3T J°TTT SLaDT varie ROVPNY,
B351, DTS LIPS a0I), BIT Aledd ROIDNY DI DORDNPI,,
B A T ATOE TT, LIQRTOTeII), LIS TI.

FWA,ed3 TOAS GIIO &3)F05A3/C3O3 20lTO A BRI, N3IT.

BYyR,, L30CPR
TOWOO N0,

3.e30°. mm@gé
TOONETEF
FIOF T PO TORD)




WO

FooF&dT PR FWPF 9DIOHD, 20118
(20140 B0 3% 9D 083 38) 03,3 en

XX XX XX

2. BOLWORNYY .- B8 LPNIODTNTE),, AOTLIE 23) LI eINTsRBRAT BRTI),-
XX XX XX

(83) "B DOWT,-
XX XX XX

“(i) DO%5T ), SNT BTEBNP A S 2530000 TONR 20,03 WONLRTI TNTOSNT WODT
B0NIAN0T 18 3.LDNENRRINS 250e)), TooeedT SNT DODING RV, 19763
VBWORPNY  OBONE). IRPARBAT SNT BDeNENLOT 10 3.DCNLRSNS 230D,
SNSAPNRY BD3NPOTW 5 B.IXNRLRPNS 300ed), TAL @WONIN aDI), TE 60
BOWIAN S BDNINPLOT 3 B.eANLRPNS XTOET, 377, 9T 00T PReIET FOR N
D3I, P BWIND, AL HYPRTIVNY), ATETH WBIS, DODOIZD TVaNe
353 MABIOND) BV TR, CITTe00 TOASTWEEILS ROAR T ALDTIES 23400y :

RT03I), N3 ADERBDBBAIT BRONTY, BRTIVIBRA 3T JIBNFSAS 30
FRPTTT ROWORPRAT 2303 [TTEINE) SFLDOTW FRAINRE,IT,T),,."

XX XX XX
4. BR FRPFOD DRCG.- XX XX XX

(3) (MIBX QVWVITTIT 90 (2 QVWRTTEIE  NWWORPNT ), PV ORI
O393R, CITTVE DEEONWIT 3BT, WO WRET, TLRPODDE ST aDRT
SRENPRIOR DB DRWTIWOE  9BHON TR dFZON0T aNI), B&,3,430 A0edT
B0 QINPRTN )R DAWTIITVE BIDD,SSAI0T L3O INIT,T3),,.

XX XX XX

5. 30 FWPTFN FoWOFRE,038 93T 9ORBTIPNRLMON WOR.- O3T0c302), e353.030,
B3 9PIONDT NTWWOENF T, GV O3 A BRTWPT e0TBIES Ty ONIOTS €953 O30 TE
€905 BRTWPT FOWOFHE) -

XX XX XX

(B) O3, 353,030, &3 FeNRDAT OVHTE T3 003303 BT3GR
9T3T,N O3, 358,003, BRTFATPOBT e9T3eI0 WRTBATRF, &joNIATT,

- ©983:3), BTV AEIEONWT ZBIAT), 2WwOT) WRE T, TR VDL 3TWT, aNRTI
SRENPR )T DRVTITOEOT  9BHON  ToT0e0R dFZONOT aNI), V&340 A0edT
BRTIONNYR IR DRWTIWOT 22IEIDAN0T WOLBIVINIT,T),.



XX XX XX
9. AFCR TO;0POODNY FOONFIFTON NI, LHPTONY).-
XX XX XX

(2) QAT V503D, WRTWENONR, RO, ST, SNCNTRPES VS LIT,N, 30
FPT 00BRNTONOT) STREAREIVE PR YT o 950 T JALLDE €9T3e00
P53, 9B WPNRRODRTE TBIS NBS3 BT eINBedTes Vs8R LT
By R, 00, €900 BOWOTES, O330e3)a3¢ BIT DRWODNF ), BONBRIT,E),.

() Y, BSBRLDI PRTWPT TY3sNY), FWPAROT 2300 DD WAL €3 T)33To,N
BBROT TR Vo500 003 9T 90T Tt ITo,N 2w0TB,03 BB, DI
V50O ONNPTT, YNY Byd ATOE T &8 DI DDE R DBRRWIITOT 90T 2,0T3E),
FOTB O, 30T,

BB03B), dFHR TsAROON) 3IJ, BVOTW  ADIERT  OHTE 9236030
BB R,LE3T, DT 90 FTIRFTOOINTONOT) €92)e0NTEIT 9T, €3 €923 0N,
O30T, B, JFOTBONI, SBATW 3TR,DRIT,T,.

XX XX XX
12. 3R ;035000 AW,0N.- (1) 88 RINDTBRONE), TR Vo503 D)

33, TTOORENPD, SCDR) RB/0NT,N TS IPTONYI), DI, V3T
SPTTTRN, TR D950350O0NTT EIGTT SCedIATRFLITIT.

(2) (13 QVWTTTEITICd BCeIIRWIBITIVE LIIRTOONE) NI, FOTTT FWyeSNeE NS, €933
ROPNE), P3NP, FeNTO3 LIPS aNIY, V3T Afedo R/IZ,NPD DI, )R Jo50350O0NT
9350 BSWPTPNTOONSD, TsTERBS Aado3aC23 AT 3BIzI003), Q)OI RWTITITOTTD)
eSNC3T,,,.

XX XX XX

TFFO WNTFHOOO, WFA AP, LONTRD, TR , TN 300, 183¢ =mweFE 2025



KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL
ONE HUNDRED AND FIFTY FIFTH SESSION

THE KARNATAKA LAND GRABBING PROHIBITION (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025
(LA Bill No. 15 of 2025)
(As passed by the Karnataka Legislative Assembly)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition Act, 2011.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Land Grabbing
Prohibition Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 38 of 2014), for the purposes hereinafter

appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the seventy sixth year of

the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the

Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition (Amendment) Act, 2025.
(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2.- In the Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition
Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 38 of 2014),(hereinafter referred to as the Principal
Act)in section 2, in clause (d), in sub-clause (i), after the proviso, the following shall

be inserted, namely:-

“Provided further that, where any action has been initiated on lands under
sections 39, 104 or 67 of the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act
No. 12 of 1964) by any competent authority, the same shall be excluded.

Provided also that, the distances herein shall be reckoned aerially and in no

other manner.”

3. Amendment of section 4.- In the Principal Act, in section 4, in sub-
section (3), for the words “twenty five thousand rupees”, the words “fifty thousand

rupees”, shall be substituted.



2

4. Amendment of section 5.- In the Principal Act, in section 5, in clause (e),
for the words “twenty five thousand rupees”, the words “fifty thousand rupees”,

shall be substituted.
5. Amendment of section 9.- In the Principal Act, in section 9,-

(i) for sub-section (2), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(2) The Special Court shall for the purpose of taking cognizance of the case,
consider the location or extent or ownership of the land alleged to have been
grabbed or of the nature of the illegality involved or in the interest of justice or any

other relevant matter”.

(ii) for sub-section (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(3) In respect of an alleged act of land grabbing or the determination of
questions of title and ownership to, or lawful possession of any land grabbed under
this Act and offences specified in Chapter XIV-A of the Karnataka Land Revenue
Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act No. 12 of 1964)may be tried in the Special Court
constituted for the area in which the land grabbed is situated and the decision of

the Special Court shall be final:”

6. Substitution of section 12.- In the Principal Act, for section 12, the

following shall be substituted, namely:-

“12. Staff of the special court.-(1) The Government shall appoint officers
and other employees required to assist the Special Court in the discharge of its

functions under this Act.

(2) The categories of officers and employees who may be appointed under
sub-section (1), their salaries, allowances, method of recruitment and other
conditions of service shall be such as may be prescribed. The administrative powers
of officers and employees appointed under sub-section (1) may be specified by the

Chairman of the Special Court.”



3

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

(As appended to at the time of Introduction)

The Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition Act (Karnataka Act 38 of 2014)
was enacted to establish a "Special Court” in the State for speedy trial of any act
alleged as 'land grabbing' and to prosecute the offences related to land grabbing,
ownership of the grabbing land, cases related possession of land legally and such
offenses specified in Chapter XIV(A) of the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964
(Karnataka Act 12 of 1964).

Whereas the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1964)
has been amended to streamline the provisions for the protection of Government
Land and land meant for public purposes. The Hon’ble Supreme Court in Hinch
Lal Tiwari vs Kamala Devi, Jagpal Singh vs State of Punjab and others and Joginder
vs State of Haryana and others in reportable judgements has repeatedly
emphasized the responsibility of the State Government in protecting the
Government and public lands. This amendment will enable to protect the
Government land and ensure the revenue officials do not strike from their primary
responsibility. To introduce the accurate way of measuring distance while filing
case against encroachment of the Government lands.

And whereas appointment of staff and employees is a prerogative of the
Government and governed by the rules, norms and economy orders. Hence,
surervision of the Government is required for any recruitment. Enhancement of
penalty in other cases of Land grabbing.

Hence, the Bill.



4

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed Legislative measure.



5

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

Clause: 6 sub-section (2), of section 12 proposed to be substituted
empowers the State Government to prescribe rules the salaries,
allowances, method of recruitment and other condition of service
of officers and other employees of the special court.

The proposed delegation of legislative power is normal in character.

KRISHNA BYREGOWDA
Minister for Revenue

K.R. MAHALAKSHMI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Council




6

ANNEXURE
Extract from the Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition Act, 2011

(Karnataka Act 38 of 2014)
XXX XXX XXX

2. Definitions.- In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,-
XXX XXX XXX

(d) “Land™* includes,- 2 [(i) Land falling in all urban areas of the State and
also land falling within 18 kms from the Bruhat Bengaluru MahanagaraPalike
limits, land falling within 10 kms from the city limits notified under the provisions
of the Karnataka Municipal Corporations Act, 1976, land falling within 5 kms from
the City Municipal Council limits, land falling within 3 kms from the Town
Municipal Council limits and Town Panchayat limits belonging to the Government,
Wakf or the Hindu Religious Institutions and Charitable Endowments, a local
authority, a statutory or nonstatutory body owned, controlled or managed by the
Government: Provided that, excluding the land specified above in all other areas the
cases pending related to land grabbing shall stand abated forthwith.

4. Prohibition of land grabbing.-XXX XXX XXX

(3) Whoever contravenes the provisions of sub-section (1) or sub-section (2)
shall on conviction, be punished with imprisonment for a term which shall not be
less than one year but which may extend to three years, and with fine which may
extend to twenty five thousand rupees.

XXX XXX XXX

5. Penalty for other offences in connection with land grabbing.- Whoever,
with a view to grabbing land in contravention of the provisions of this Act or in
connection with any such land grabbing,-

XXX XXX XXX

(e) causes or procures or attempts to procure any person to do any of above
mentioned acts;

shall, on conviction, be punished with imprisonment for a term which shall
not be less than one year but which may extend to three years and with fine which
may extend to twenty five thousand rupees.

XXX XXX XXX
9. Procedure and powers of the Special Courts.-XXX XXX XXX

(2) The Special Court shall for the purpose of taking cognizance of the case,
consider the location, or extent or value of the land alleged to have been grabbed or
of the substantial nature of the evil involved or in the interest of justice required or
any other relevant matter.



7

(3) All alleged acts of land grabbing shall be tried only by the Special Court
constituted for the area in which the land is situated, or where there are more
Special Courts than one for such area, by such one of them as may be specified in
this behalf by the Government.

Provided that if, in the opinion of the Special Court, any application filed
before it, is prima facie frivolous or vexatious, it shall reject the same without any
further enquiry.

XXX XXX XXX

12. Staff of the Special Court.- (1) The chairman of the Special Court may
appoint officers and other employees required to assist the Special Court in the
discharge of its functions under this Act.

(2) The categories of officers and employees who may be appointed under
subsection (1), their salaries, allowances, method of recruitment and other
conditions of service and the administrative powers of the Chairman of the Special
Court shall be such as may be prescribed, after consultation with the Chairman.

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengalur, 18t Mar, 2025, P7, W.D. , Copies 300



