
 
PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À ¥ÀjµÀvÀÄÛ 

£ÀÆgÀ LªÀvÀÛ ªÀÄÆgÀ£ÉAiÀÄ C¢üªÉÃ±À£À 

                                                 

       (     )     , 2024 

(2024gÀ «zsÁ£À¸À¨sÉAiÀÄ «zsÉÃAiÀÄPÀ À̧ASÉå-36) 
(PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À¸À¨sÉ¬ÄAzÀ CAVÃPÁgÀªÁzÀ gÀÆ¥ÀzÀ°è) 

 

                                                 

            , 1963                     .  

                                             

                                             , 1963 

(1964              4)                         ;   

   ,                                          

         ಈ                :- 

1.                   .- (1) ಈ                      

                                            (     ) 

     , 2024             . 

 (2)   , ಈ                ; 

 2.               .-                              

                                , 1963 (1964        

      4)    (                                ) 

“     ”                       “    ”            

                       . 

 3.       15       .-           15          ,- 

 (i)                (1)                       ;     

 (ii)                 (1)           ಈ         

        ,     :- 

 “(2)                                      

                                            



2 

 

                            ,                  

                  (LLP)    ,          ,               

             ,                                     

      ,                        (CSR)                

                                               

      ,                                 ,      , 

          ,                                    

                                          ʼ         ʼ 

                            .”  

 4.       26       .-           26         (1)  

            (iv)        “          ”               “    

        ”    “              ”               “       

      ”                        . 

 5.       31       .-           31         (3)  

          ,- 

(i)    (i)     “          ”               “    

        ”               “              ”          

     “             ”                        . 

(ii)    (ii)     “            ”               “       

      ”                        . 

  

  

 



3 

 

                      

(«zsÉÃAiÀÄPÀªÀ£ÀÄß ªÀÄAr À̧ÄªÁUÀ ®UÀwÛ¹zÀAvÉ) 

 

 ಈ                                            

                            , 1963 (1964              

4)                             ,- 

 (1)                                   (LLP)     

             ,                            ,     

                                         ʼ         ʼ 

                       ;     

 (2) ಈ                                        . 

 

      , ಈ     . 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  



4 

 

              

 

                                             . 

 

 

 

  . .     

   ,                  , 

                          

                

 

 

 
 

PÉ.Dgï. ªÀÄºÁ®Qëöä 
PÁAiÀÄðzÀ²ð 

PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À ¥ÀjµÀvÀÄÛ 

 

  
 
 



5 

 

     

                                             

                , 1963 (1964              4)        

   

 

XXX                  XXX                    XXX 

 

15.             .-                                   

                                                    

                                                      : 

   , ಈ                               ,               

                                                    .    

XXX                  XXX                    XXX 

26.      .- 

(1) (i)                     ,       ,       , 

      ,        ,                            ; 

     

(ii)                                 9         (1)  

                 10         (1)    -                      

       ;      

(i)                      ,     ,     ,         ,         

                            ;     

(ii) 20         (1)                                    

-       ,                                       

                                           

            .     

(2) 22         (1)                                

                                                

                                               

                                              

                                                   

                                                   .    



6 

 

XXX                  XXX                    XXX 

31.             .- 

XXX                  XXX                    XXX 

(3) ಈ                    ,            ,- 

(i) (2)           ( )                            , 

                                                 

                               ; 

(ii) (2)            ( )                                

                            -              

        .  

 (4) ಈ                              ,               

                                     ,               , 

                                            

                                        ;             

                                                      

                                 ,              

                       ,                      ,    

                                                 ; 

    ,                                            

                                   .      

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

À̧PÁðj ªÀÄÄzÀæuÁ®AiÀÄ, «PÁ À̧̧ ËzsÀ, ¨ÉAUÀ¼ÀÆgÀÄ, ¦7, PÁ À̧Æ , ¥ÀæwUÀ¼ÀÄ 300, 24£ÉÃ dÄ¯ÉÊ 2024 



 

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL 
ONE HUNDRED AND FIFTY THIRD SESSION 

 

THE KARNATAKA ANCIENT AND HISTORICAL MONUMENTS AND 

ARCHAEOLOGICAL SITES AND REMAINS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2024 

(LA Bill No. 36 of 2024) 

(As passed by the Karnataka Legislative Assembly) 
 

A Bill to amend the Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and 

Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961. 

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ancient and 

Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961, (Karnataka 

Act 7 of 1962) for the purposes hereinafter  appearing; 

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy fifth  year of 

the Republic of India as follows:- 

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 

Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains 

(Amendment) Act, 2024. 

(2)It shall come into force at once. 

2. Substitution of expression.- In the Karnataka Ancient and Historical 

Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 7 of 

1962)  (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) for the word “Director”, where 

ever it occur the word “Commissioner”, shall be substituted.   

3. Amendment of section 15.- In the  Principal Act, in section 15,- 

(i)  the existing clause shall be numbered as  clause (1) ; and  

(ii) after clause (1) as so numbered the following shall be inserted, namely:- 

“ (2) A Company or Firm or Limited Liability Partnership concern  (LLP) or a 

Partnership Firm, interested Societies or Cooperative Societies, Trusts or Non- 

Governmental Organisations or interested individuals are eligible to be empanelled 

as „Smaraka Mitras‟ to adopt Ancient Monuments and Archaeological sites and 

remains, Heritage buildings and Heritage areas across Karnataka for conservation, 

preservation, restoration and annual maintenance, development of tourist basic 



2 
 

 

and advance amenities under their corporate social responsibility (CSR) programme 

as per the stipulated guidelines or terms and conditions set forth by the 

Government of Karnataka and issued thereon from time to time by the way of 

Notification under the scheme of Adopt  a Monument”.  

     4. Amendment of section 26.- In the Principal Act, in section  26, in sub- 

section (1), in clause (iv), for the words “ three months” the words “two years” and 

for the words “two thousand rupees” the words “Rupees one lakh” shall be 

substituted.  

     5. Amendment of section 31.- In the Principal Act, in section  31, in sub-

section (3),- 

(i) in clause (i)  for the words “ three months” the words “two years” and for 

the words “two thousand rupees” the words “Rupees one lakh” shall be substituted; 

and  

 (ii) in clause (ii)  for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “Rupees one 

lakh” shall be substituted. 

  

 

 



3 
 

 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

(As appended to at the time of Introduction) 

 

It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Ancient and Historical 

Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 7 of 

1962) to,- 

(1) make eligible a Company or Firm or Limited Liability Partnership 

concern (LLP) or a Partnership Firm, interested Societies or Cooperative 

Societies, Trusts or Non-Governmental Organisations or interested 

individuals to be empanelled as „Smaraka Mitras‟.; as 

(2) revise penalty and punishment for the violation of the Act. 

 

Hence the Bill. 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



4 
 

 

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 

 There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure. 

 

 

H. K. PATIL 

Minister for Law and Parliamentary 

Affair, Legislation and Tourism 

 

 

 
K.R. MAHALAKSHMI 

Secretary 

Karnataka Legislative Council 

 

 

  



5 
 

 

ANNEXURE 

Extract from the Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological 

Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 07 of 1962) 

 

XXX                              XXX                           XXX 

 

           15.  Voluntary contributions.-The Director may receive voluntary contributions 

towards the cost of maintaining a protected monument and may give orders as to the 

management and application of any funds so received by him: Provided that no 

contribution received under this section shall be applied to any purpose other than the 

purpose for which it was contributed. 

XXX                              XXX                           XXX 

 

26. Penalties.- Whoever,-  

(1) (i) destroys, removes, injures, alters, defaces, imperils, or misuses a protected 

monument; or  

(ii) being the owner or occupier of a protected monument, contravenes an order 

made under sub-section (1) of section 9 or under sub-section (1) of section 10; or 

(iii) removes from a protected monument any sculpture, carving, image, bas relief, 

inscription or other like object; 

 (iv) does any act in contravention of sub-section (1) of section 20, -shall be 

punishable with imprisonment which may extend to three months, or with fine which may 

extend to two thousand rupees, or with both.  

(2) Any person who moves any antiquity in contravention of a notification under 

subsection (1) of section 22 shall be punishable with imprisonment which may extend to 

three months or fine which may extend to five hundred rupees or with both, and the court 

convicting a person of any such contravention may by order direct that such antiquity shall 

be forfeited to Government. 

 

XXX                              XXX                           XXX 

 

31. Power to make rules.-  
 

(XXX                              XXX                           XXX 

  

(3) Any rule made under this section may provide that a breach thereof shall be 

punishable,-  

(i) in the case of a rule made with reference to clause (a) of sub-section (2), with 

imprisonment which may extend to three months, or with fine which may extend to two 

thousand rupees, or with both; 



6 
 

 

(ii) in the case of a rule made with reference to clause (b) of sub-section (2), with fine 

which may extend to five hundred rupees.  

(4) Every rule made under this section shall be laid as soon as may be after it is 

made, before each House of the State Legislature while it is in session for a total period of 

thirty days which may be comprised in one session or in two successive sessions, and if 

before the expiry of the session in which it is so laid or the session immediately following, 

both Houses agree in making any modification in the rule or both Houses agree that the 

rule should not be made, the rule shall thereafter have effect only in such modified form or 

be of no effect, as the case may be; so however that any such modification or annulment 

shall be without prejudice to the validity of anything previously done under that rule. 

 

  XXX                              XXX                           XXX 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengaluru, 24th July, 2024, P7, W.D., Copies 300 


