TIRFEIT DO JOXB
SRT [T SHRTVOD WR[EST

FooF&dF 930N D3I, 03TAIT T TFINYH DI, PTe33, 3 ¢ Ne 3.,
ORICRNY (3TWI_RD) ATICODT, 2024
(20243 DRz Jechs Kosd-36)
(BTFWE DTRTTLIONOT WONCHRTTRE SRITY)

FTOOEET D3 aNI), 803T/AAT A IOTIND aNI), R)T33, A INY NI,
BFRNY 9D, 196330, 3T eTVTED) 20T IGLODNT.

Q). YJEWNOT FOWY WAW B LBNPMON FoocddT YW D3I,
803302T A OBN) aN3), Y0033, RINY D3, OSFHRNY 9DAAHD, 1963
(19643 TUEEIT 9DIONTD 4)3),, 3TV FBE &3I0TIEIH T ONT 200 NTEHTWOOTS;

AT, 003 NPTILT DB,B4B SREBS), ToOEET Tos PO
ENOBOTWROT T8 TDV0ORNTOI L9IDAORN 3TN E):-

1. O R, BIV) DI, TYT0RW.- (1) B LPIONRNTI, TEET D3¢
H3), 03To2T AIBNY 03y, Y033, RINY 3, WSHRNY (3BT8)
9RO, 2024 ROTD FBONIT,T),..

(2) AT, B8 TRTWEX 22001 20TIT,T),,;

2. BOORYNY B33 RCWR.- TooFEdT DYBES DI, 038T/OAIT X IIN)
03), RO33, RINY 303), WRFHRNY e9DICHD, 1963 (19643 BooeEds
OPAONT 43D, (VWTL), AVTNOT  aNR  BIRIONTNROT  ee3 fDAT)
"ABETT” D0 BVINPY  WANE IBNFS O, "eSO3NNT" D0V  BWNFS,
R8503N ER0NNR &3S BRITT,,.

3. B30 150 3WIBR.- 300 IRIONTNT 15:3¢ &yFTETE),, -

(i) T=0,3e)T033 DOTEIT, (1) DOTIIOTI BOS3500R, DCBITTI),; 3030,

(i) R} ROB;0NT), NBORT (1) DOBTW 3TN &8 ZORITI,
AORIT,RD,, DOTWT:-

"2) ARITRI, WD), IRTRWNE  BRLEIONRODE).  ToOTOOT,
IDNFRWIODN DROT TEET AT Tog) INDIBBATIE aoNERAWBNY) L9ITe00



BRDAIBIE ROINNY) NI, DWOFING 9IVART, FORBA) 9T adr’e LITe00
283 BRWMODT ADBLONI, (LLP) S0, TOITWODT 3a30°F, 3R BN, AR AEIND
9300 ABTOT AOFPNE), EYAENS) 900 ATEXIT RFOA NS 9T SAFTOING,
BsBNY), 9330 TO0RT A00RT BRBMEOT  (CSR) TODETINY 980N
TOOEETOOW;038TVE WIS A JBINY)  a0I), 033, ASND D3I,
9RHBNE), DOCOROT TELBNYY D), FTOTORVT Ioceny TFBN, AOTFHN,
2RBRCEDOT0T,, WOAET DeED/BIT PONR I ANON 2DRO NI, SBTNIT
APOPMF R, 923D BRI IIINFI, B, INTTR DT T,N ‘Ao BT AJ T’
D02 TE3,00E). AT 95330 9BETINTIT3.”

4. R0 268 STWHBB.- DR IRPIRDRDT  26:3¢ TJyTTRT  (1)3e
NVTVTFTTRTRAS (iv)¢ VOB, “aDRTY SONPINLR" 0 BWNY TR DT
SRENPTBN” TONR "DTBY AT BRTWIONTPR” 02 JWNF WHBONR 2003 OF
BRTIANNPR" 020 BWNFI, &)3A3RLRAIT,T,.

5. ®¥yYFO0 3180 3T R/R.- DR 9PRINDT 3136 JyF3RE  (3)C
VBT TTLDTE),, -

() OB ()BAS "2DRTY  SONHNPR" N0 J/INY  WBOR TR
VRENFPTOR" 020 VWNP, BN "RTTW Ae)T CRTICNER" 00 IJWNY
WRON "2,0T) OF BRTCANDR" D0W BWNF, &38R IT,T0,.

(i) VOB ()BT "8I SRTY TRTIONTIER" D0 BWNY WHRON “2,0T) OF
B OINPR" D0 BWNF, T3 RCRAST,R),.



T LBNP) H3), FoONY BCLTF
(Deecbena, HoRHTR CndLEod)

T ZDVODTINENMON TOEERT HYWS 20D, 803T0AT A IJTINDD 20,
R)0033, AIPNY D), WBHBNY PO, 1963 (19648 FUEEIT L9IPIODD
4)3, 3T 2390TBITHT) 93T T30 WONBAT, -

(1) TOBD BT PI*E 90 AT BRBMOOT ABLPNS, (LLP) ROX,
€930 TONTWRDT P, eSAFONY, ARALEINS) 9T FBTOT AOPNY, EY=,
N P ATEXIT FOR N 90 BAFTANG, WsINYI, AT I3’
R¢3,00). REDRIT)TF, IBETINRITHTY; 303,

(2) B3 LRI N OFIMON OB 03I, dF 0N, BOR,DRI)TI0.

3T D0T, B8 LATICODT.



SDFT 39 RIS RI)

FA0e)3 TORT03,T Beeg) OBI0sHTI Bed, S a303,53:0, LPRBORTIHDE) .

N F.Toé3eer

TODRR, D50 2NI), 230 3es BI,ND,
ROARLOD 235e3TRTNED NI, TOAS TLFS
[ SRIAVORATALISNOIN ARV IRV OX:)

3.e30°. mmoie
TOORNFTEF
TIOFWE VOT TORDD



eodrwog’

FooFédT 930N 23D, 03TAT T JFINY) D), PTe33, 3. &N
D3I, TICRNY LIDAODD, 1963 (196480 T T 9D AODD 4)0 T3 43
N

XXX XXX XXX

15. B,00023. 0D TB03FN).- ATETTI) FOTEF MO TTI), MRS E30,FR0T)
WHPTT,NS  F23,APMN  F 00, K[OINRNFI), ALTDFWBID D), @33 ont
A LTDAT 0T ADNY WsesABS a0, LD DARENT R, BSREBNF[), DLTBTITD:
BWB0I), B8 TTTEIT 33BN ALTOAOVET 00T @303NRONT,, O30T T,N e303NRODNT,
ABRAN3eE &3 YT L3To,N BRTI) A3T O30T AT LTF, d)SRENAIT, L.

XXX XXX XXX
26. ToBNYH.-

(1 (i) RNOTZE A OTHI), NoIdBRAIEE, INCNTORE, DOIRPAI,
WBOANRIES, dBRTNRPPRIE, NOTIOITELEBIINCEIEE I  TITITWOSRENTRIES;

(SIAIND)

(i) RO0E3 A 0TE WwBOD T 9P RINTICTINGY, I [TTears (1)
QURBTYTCEITS BN 900 10:3¢ &WyFTEAT (1) QVEB-TTTEITS TN 08T STBTI,
P OB RIET; eIT3200

(i) R0T8 3 A9 ITDOW A0YTE Do, FIS, F)dad, L9TAN,LET), TR 9T
B30 90ITWITIK 23,233, A, STV EINRPRIE; L9G3e0

(ii) 20:3¢ TTTRT (1) VTR TTEDaI30, BV O A O30T TOODE eI, 2300T3IeS

-0350a33¢ €37, eNRTY SONFINPR A DAWTITICOT FOTORIRADOT €90 dTTBY
A0e)T  CRTIOINYT IADIWBIWRWORT  HIVISON0T 9GP0 933BDOTWOLR
aeleIN[{OVWINDIACEAANE

) 223¢ WyTTW (1) NOTWETTRTW  a0CNS DR PWIODRD, YO0
O30T RT3 ALY, A WEBUONAEE O3 353030 0R3BY  3oNSHNPNR
IR.DRWBIDOTOT FTOUIRDOL €930 0T SRTY BRETICNNER )R DRWIITIITIOT
ZIOY,RION0T 95300 9RCBOOWOR  WOBLODVINITE), a0J), ONo) 90T
U OFIORN W7, 358,003, LITTIRONOTI) DEIEONAIE V503N E) STHIT eNROT
e9I0T3 T)TOIN e3R,5330, ATOETT, a0E30,RRCN T3 FERY,3T,T3,003) DTLEDRLIITI.



XXX XXX XXX
31. QoD 83T T0.-
XXX XXX XXX
(3) B8 TTTEATS a0CB1T Oe)TIE DODENY), EITIT GV 0TI, -

(i) )3 DRBTJTTOHT (D) DOWT, IOWORPA TBAIX ANDEW ROWFETE),,
SNRTY 3ONPINPNR LIXDRIIDVEOT FOUWRRNOL €930 DT Fee)T CRTICNYT
)RDAWBITOTOT 2D, SANI0TT LITI0 L9RTBOOTBOR);

(i) (2)3€ NVIJTJFTTIT () DOTWT, IOWORPA TLIAIT DONNT ROTIIETE). 8053
SPT) BR@AINYT JADRWBIDOTOT I ANOT-TOTWILORNNI T, TIOT)

VW ORDRWTIT.

4) 8 FTOT 3N TWAT F3O3ROTD ORI, LT, BB A 3Bz000D
e3TBRY,, NS Tos LIPS TNOBOT 3O3R0 AW 30T, 9T L9RIIITE) Tozoen,
WO  IRNITT TP WOWITW CSBROWT03  WEW  ATVRY 9RISINSS),
BT DINTVIDITOT 2830, eDRI), NBANY L98PONETNR VBIT,R),,; 03I, BT, TN
Qe 9PWETT €90 DTEIRCITT IRRCSTag) T0IT,ODWINIEHTT, 30002 €3 DONTNTE),
O300YT 0WEEIR), 2B TOT) NTVBR ABINY) WD T, 9GP0 €3 DO,
FOBTRBTOT) TR AWM 20D, B3, €8 3Ba0003 €3 D0 ROTILIRE VAT, oo
VT EINT BRRTRE). e3903) BOBONTODOIINIFE, IT0 BOBONTOOOINIF,T.L).;
e3T30NR;, EIOT OVHT @350 E 90 3R 030303 €3 DONTNT ETN 00T B3
O30T TOONET AOTIT, WO TeIS),083) 208 3T,T.L)..

RFFO BOTFIVOD, DFIIG, WonenDd, &7, AR , JEMWD 300, 243e 20, 2024



KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL
ONE HUNDRED AND FIFTY THIRD SESSION

THE KARNATAKA ANCIENT AND HISTORICAL MONUMENTS AND
ARCHAEOLOGICAL SITES AND REMAINS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2024

(LA Bill No. 36 of 2024)
(As passed by the Karnataka Legislative Assembly)

A Bill to amend the Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and

Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961.

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ancient and
Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961, (Karnataka

Act 7 of 1962) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy fifth year of

the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains

(Amendment) Act, 2024.
(2)It shall come into force at once.

2. Substitution of expression.- In the Karnataka Ancient and Historical
Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 7 of
1962) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) for the word “Director”, where

ever it occur the word “Commissioner”, shall be substituted.
3. Amendment of section 15.- In the Principal Act, in section 15,-
(i) the existing clause shall be numbered as clause (1) ; and
(ii) after clause (1) as so numbered the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(2) A Company or Firm or Limited Liability Partnership concern (LLP) or a
Partnership Firm, interested Societies or Cooperative Societies, Trusts or Non-
Governmental Organisations or interested individuals are eligible to be empanelled
as ‘Smaraka Mitras’ to adopt Ancient Monuments and Archaeological sites and
remains, Heritage buildings and Heritage areas across Karnataka for conservation,

preservation, restoration and annual maintenance, development of tourist basic



2

and advance amenities under their corporate social responsibility (CSR) programme
as per the stipulated guidelines or terms and conditions set forth by the
Government of Karnataka and issued thereon from time to time by the way of

Notification under the scheme of Adopt a Monument”.

4. Amendment of section 26.- In the Principal Act, in section 26, in sub-
section (1), in clause (iv), for the words “ three months” the words “two years” and
for the words “two thousand rupees” the words “Rupees one lakh” shall be

substituted.

5. Amendment of section 31.- In the Principal Act, in section 31, in sub-

section (3),-

(i) in clause (i) for the words “ three months” the words “two years” and for
the words “two thousand rupees” the words “Rupees one lakh” shall be substituted;

and

(ii) in clause (ii) for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “Rupees one
lakh” shall be substituted.



3

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

(As appended to at the time of Introduction)

It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Ancient and Historical
Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 7 of
1962) to,-

(1) make eligible a Company or Firm or Limited Liability Partnership
concern (LLP) or a Partnership Firm, interested Societies or Cooperative
Societies, Trusts or Non-Governmental Organisations or interested
individuals to be empanelled as ‘Smaraka Mitras’.; as

(2) revise penalty and punishment for the violation of the Act.

Hence the Bill.



4

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure.

H. K. PATIL
Minister for Law and Parliamentary
Affair, Legislation and Tourism

K.R. MAHALAKSHMI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Council



5

ANNEXURE

Extract from the Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological
Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 07 of 1962)

XXX XXX XXX

15. Voluntary contributions.-The Director may receive voluntary contributions
towards the cost of maintaining a protected monument and may give orders as to the
management and application of any funds so received by him: Provided that no
contribution received under this section shall be applied to any purpose other than the
purpose for which it was contributed.

XXX XXX XXX

26. Penalties.- Whoever,-

(1) (i) destroys, removes, injures, alters, defaces, imperils, or misuses a protected
monument; or

(ii) being the owner or occupier of a protected monument, contravenes an order
made under sub-section (1) of section 9 or under sub-section (1) of section 10; or

(iii) removes from a protected monument any sculpture, carving, image, bas relief,
inscription or other like object;

(iv) does any act in contravention of sub-section (1) of section 20, -shall be
punishable with imprisonment which may extend to three months, or with fine which may
extend to two thousand rupees, or with both.

(2) Any person who moves any antiquity in contravention of a notification under
subsection (1) of section 22 shall be punishable with imprisonment which may extend to
three months or fine which may extend to five hundred rupees or with both, and the court
convicting a person of any such contravention may by order direct that such antiquity shall

be forfeited to Government.

XXX XXX XXX

31. Power to make rules.-

(XXX XXX XXX

(3) Any rule made under this section may provide that a breach thereof shall be
punishable,-

(i) in the case of a rule made with reference to clause (a) of sub-section (2), with
imprisonment which may extend to three months, or with fine which may extend to two

thousand rupees, or with both;



6

(ii) in the case of a rule made with reference to clause (b) of sub-section (2), with fine
which may extend to five hundred rupees.

(4) Every rule made under this section shall be laid as soon as may be after it is
made, before each House of the State Legislature while it is in session for a total period of
thirty days which may be comprised in one session or in two successive sessions, and if
before the expiry of the session in which it is so laid or the session immediately following,
both Houses agree in making any modification in the rule or both Houses agree that the
rule should not be made, the rule shall thereafter have effect only in such modified form or
be of no effect, as the case may be; so however that any such modification or annulment

shall be without prejudice to the validity of anything previously done under that rule.

XXX XXX XXX

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengaluru, 24t July, 2024, P7, W.D., Copies 300



