
 
PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À¸À̈ sÉ 

ºÀ¢£ÁgÀ£ÉÃ «zsÁ£À¸À¨sÉ 

DgÀ£ÉÃ C¢üªÉÃ±À£À 

ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಕಬัಃ ඛ๤ಧ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) เඒಯಕ, 2025 
(2025gÀ «zsÁ£À¸À s̈ÉAiÀÄ «zsÉÃAiÀÄPÀ ¸ÀASÉå-15) 

 

 

 ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಕಬัಃ ඛ๤ಧ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2011ඝ౬  ಮತ౨ ๠ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ಡฤ ಒಂൿ 

เඒಯಕ. 

 ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ಉഴಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಕಬัಃ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 

2011ඝ౬  (2014ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲  38) ಮತ౨ ๠ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ഴโൿ 

෷ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ; 

 ಇൿ ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ౲ ದ ಎಪ౭ ൞౨ ರඡ ವಷბದย౵  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲  เඋನ෱ಡಲൽಂದ ಈ 

෨ಂൽඦ൤ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗย:- 

 1. ๸౾౹ භತ ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ౳ ฏಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬  ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಕಬัಃ 

ඛ๤ಧ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2025 ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(2) ಇൿ ಈ ಁಡศ ೦คಡ  ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 2. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 2ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.-ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಕಬัಃ ඛ๤ಧ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2011 (2014ರ 

ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 38)(ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ ಉว౵ ೕ಍ಸมಜං)ರ 2ඡ 

ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (ല) ಘಡದย౵  (i)ඡ ಉಪಘಡದย౵ ನ ಪฏൡಕದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬   

๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “ಮൡ౨  ಪฏൡ ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1964 (1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 

12)ರ 39, 104 ಅಥ฿ 67ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣಗಳല ේ෦ಗಳ ෬ว ෴ช ಸౘಮ ඩ౳ ඌ౽คಗำ ෴โඃ 

ಕ౳ ಮವඝ౬  ඩ౳ ฏ෗๭ದฉ, ಅದඝ౬  ෈ഖౣ ෈ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 ಅಲ౵ ං ಪฏൡ, ಇย౵  ಅಂತರಗಳඝ౬  ็෥ඛಕ฿ಜ (aerially) วಕౙ ๻ಕತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  

෴โඃ ಇತರ เඋನವඝ౬  ಪคಗ൐ಸತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ .” 

 3. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 4ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 4ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (3)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ฆವ 

“ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗಳವರಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ ಬದมಜ “ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ 

งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 



2 

 
 4. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 5ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 5ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (ಇ)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ฆವ 

“ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗัಡ ಬದมಜ “ಐವൡ౨  ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 5. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 9ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 9ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i) ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ (2)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(2) เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯโ ෮ಕದ౪ ෫ಯඝ౬  ๸೬ౢ ೕಯ൤ಡ ൤ಡൿಆำ౶ ವ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ, 

ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಕಬัಃ ෥ಡมಜฆโංಂൿ ಆฌೕඪಸมದ ේ෦ಯ ಇฆವ ೦ಗ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ 

เ๭౨ ೕಣბ ಅಥ฿ ෥ยೕಕತ౷ ವඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ಒಳತಂലฆವ ౽ඞඝ෇๼ರ൤ಯ ಸ౷ งಪ ಅಥ฿ 

ක౲ ෽ೕං౪ ೕಶದ ඁ๞ౣ ಯඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ಇತฉ ๸ීඌತ เಷಯವඝ౬  ಪคಗ൐ಸತಕౙ ൿ. “ 

 (ii) ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ (3)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(3) ಅඌඛಯಮದല ಆฌೕඪಸมದ ේ ಕಬัಃಯ ಂತ౲  ಅಥ฿ ಹಀౙ ๬౷ ಮ౲  ಮൡ౨  

෥ยೕಕತ౷ ದ ಪ౳ ๔౬ ಯ ඛಧბರൕ ಅಥ฿ ಈ ಕಬัಸมದ ෴โඃ ේ෦ಯ ౽ඞඝಬದ౫  

๬౷ ඌೕನ൤ಯ ๻ಟ ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1964 (1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 

12)ರ ಅඋ౲ ಯ XIV-ಎ-ರย౵  ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലಸมದ ಅಪฃಧಗಳ ๸ීಧದย౵ , ಕಬัಸมದ ේ෦ 

ಇฆವ ನഷದ ಪ౳ ඃಶ౽ౙ ಜ ರ೉ಸมದ เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯದย౵  ಅඌเೈರൕಯඝ౬  

ನഷಯಬ๾ൿ ಮൡ౨  เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯದ ൟೕ෥ბನโ ಅಂൟಮ฿ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

 6. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 12ರ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕಜච.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 12ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ಬದยಡ ಈ 

෨ಂൽನದඝ౬   ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “12. เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯದ ๭ಬ౯ ಂൽ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದലಯย౵  เ๕ಷ 

ක౲ ෴ಲಯโ ತನ౬  ಪ౳ ౽ಯბಗಳඝ౬  චರๆคಸฤ චರโ ඛೕഴโದ౽ౙ ಜ ಅಗತ౲ เฆವ 

ಅඌ౽คಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  ಇತರ ๭ಬ౯ ಂൽಯඝ౬  ಸ౽ბರโ ඡಮಕ ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (2) ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣ (1)ರല ඡಮಕ฿ಗಬ๾ർದ ಅඌ౽คಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඥಕರರ ಪ౳ ವಗბಗำ, ಅವರ 

๸ಬಳಗำ, ಭ൤౲ ಗำ, ඡಮ౽ൟ เඋನ ಮൡ౨  ಇತರ ๳฿ ಷರൡ౨ ಗำ ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർඈ൤ 

ಇರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದല ඡ෦ಸมದ ಅඌ౽คಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඥಕರರ ಆಡั൞ತ౱ ಕ 

ಅඌ౽ರಗಳඝ౬  เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯದ ಅಧ౲ ౘฆ ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലಸಬ๾ൿ.” 

  

 

 

 



3 

 

ಉං౪ ೕಶಗำ ಮൡ౨  ౽ರಣಗಳ ຂัಃ 

 

 ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಕಬัಃ ඛ๤ಧ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2014 (2014ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 38)ඝ౬  

ฃಜ౲ ದย౵  ’ේ ಕಬัಃ’฀ತಹ ෴โඃ ಆඩൽತ ಂತ౲ ಗಳ ಅඌเೈರൕಯඝ౬  ತ౷ คತತัಸฤ 

ಮൡ౨  ේ ಕಬัಃ, ಕಬั๭ದ ේ෦ಯ ಒഷತನ, ౽ඞඝಬದ౫ ฿ಜ ේ෦ಯ ๬౷ ඌೕನಃౙ  

๸ීඌ๭ದ ๻ಟ ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1964 (1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 

12)ರ ಅඋ౲ ಯ XIV(ಎ)ರย౵  ඛൽბಷౣ ಪല๭ඈಥ ಅಪฃಧಗัಡ ๸ීඌ๭ದ ಪ౳ ಕರಣಗಳ 

ಅ෗෽ೕಜචಛಜ เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯವඝ౬  ๬౩ ඪಸฤ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತತัಸมಜං. 

 ಸ౽ბค ේ෦ ಮൡ౨  ๬ವბಜඛಕ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜನ ේ෦ಯ ರౘൕಛಜನ ಉಪීಧಗಳඝ౬  

෨ನ౬ วಡ ತರฤ ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1964 (1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 12)ඝ౬  

ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ಡมಜං. ෥ನ౲  ಸ่ೕბಚ౟  ක౲ ෴ಲಯโ ๼ಂೖ มฯ ൟ฿ค เฆದ౫  ಕಮม 

ඃเ, ಜಗඩฯ ๭ಂ಩ เฆದ౫  ඵ೦೴ ฃಜ౲  ಮൡ౨  ಇತರฆ ๻ಟ ೯ೕಜಂದฑ เฆದ౪  

ಹ෴ბಣ ฃಜ౲  ಮൡ౨  ಇತರฆ, ಇโಗಳย౵ ನ ವರൽ ෽ೕಗ౲  ൟೕඬბಗಳย౵  ಸ౽ბರದ ಮൡ౨  

๬ವბಜඛಕ ේ෦ಗಳ ๸ರౘൕಯย౵  ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರದ ಜ฿෇౪ คಯඝ౬  ಪඃಪඃ ಒൟ౨  ຂัං. ಈ 

ൟൿ౪ ಪല෷ ಸ౽ბರದ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ๸ರ౾౹ ๯โൿ ಮൡ౨  ಉർಯ ಅඌ౽คಗำ ಅವರ 

ඩ౳ ಥ෦ಕ ಜ฿෇౪ ค෵ಂದ ຄರຄೕಗඈൟฆโದඝ౬  ಌತคಪല๯ತ౨ ං. ಸ౽ბರದ ේ෦ಗಳ 

ಒൡ౨ ವคಯ เฆದ౫  ಪ౳ ಕರಣಗಳ ർಖย๯฿ಗ ಅಂತರವඝ౬   วಕౙ ๻ಀವ ඛಖರ ෥ಗბವඝ౬  

ඩ౳ ฏ෗๯โൿ. 

 ๭ಬ౯ ಂൽ ಮൡ౨  ඥಕರರ ඡಮ౽ൟ෷ ಸ౽ბರದ ಪರ෥ඌ౽ರ฿ಜൿ౪  ๻ಟ ඛಯಮಗำ, 

෥ನඈಡಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಆ൮ბಕ ಆඃಶಗಳ ෩ಲಕ ಆಡัತ ඛವბ๼ಸมಞโದคಂದ, ෴โඃ 

ඡಮ౽ൟಛಜ ಸ౽ბರದ ෬ย౷ ೈರൕಯඝ౬  ಅಗತ౲ ಪലಸมಜං. ේ ಕಬัಃಯ ಇತರ 

ಪ౳ ಕರಣಗಳย౵  ඈಡචಯඝ౬  ກ೉౞ ಸมಜං. 

ಆದ౪ คಂದ ಈ เඒಯಕ. 

 



4 

 
ಆ൮ბಕ ೦ౢ ಪನ ಪತ౳  

 

 ಪ౳ ๬౨ เತ ๎ಸකತ౱ ಕ ಕ౳ ಮโ ෴โඃ ກ೉౞ ನ ๅಚ౞ ವඝ౬  ಒಳತಂലฆโൽಲ౵ . 

 

 



5 

 
ಪ౳ ൞౲ ෽ೕ೧ತ ๎ಸකඌ౽ರದ ಀคൡ ೦ౢ ಪನ ಪತ౳  

ಘಡ-6 12ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෩ಲಕ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸฤ ಉං౪ ೕ๏ಸมದ (2)ඡ ಉಪ-ಪ౳ ಕರಣโ, 
เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯದ ಅඌ౽คಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಇತರ ඥಕರರ ඡಮಕ ๻ಟ ๸ಬಳಗำ, 
ಭ൤౲ ಗำ, ඡಮ౽ൟ เඋನ ಮൡ౨  ಇತರ ๳฿ ಷರൡ౨ ಗಳ ಀคൡ ඛಯಮಗಳඝ౬  
ರ೉ಸฤ ฃಜ౲  ಸ౽ბರಃౙ  ಅඌ౽ರವඝ౬  ඛೕഴತ౨ ං. 

   

 ಪ౳ ๬౨ เತ ๎ಸನ ರಚචಯ ಪ౳ ൞౲ ෽ೕಜච෷ ฿ലಃಯ ಸ౷ งಪർ౪ ಜฆತ౨ ං. 

 

 

 

   

ಂಷ౧  ෞชದಡ 
ಉർಯ ෱ൟ౳  

 
 
 

 
JA.PÉ. «±Á¯ÁQë 

PÁAiÀÄðzÀ²ð 

PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À̧ À̈ sÉ 

 

 

  

 
 
 



6 

 

ಅඝීಧ 

ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಕಬัಃ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2011ರ 

 (2014ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ๸ಒ౲  38) ಉඁತ ූಗ 

XX                 XX                XX 

2. ಪคූ๣ಗำ .- ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದย౵ , ๸ದಭბโ ಅನ౲ ൭ ಅಗತ౲ ಪല๭ದ ຄರൡ,- 

XX                 XX                XX 

(ല) ``ේ෦'' ಎಂದฉ,- 

XX                 XX                XX 

“(i) ฃಜ౲ ದ ಎม౵  ನಗರ ಪ౳ ඃಶಗಳย౵ ನ ේ෦ ๻ಟ ෌ಹ൬ ෍ಂಗิฆ ಮ๻ನಗರ ඩยಃ 

ಪค෦ൟ෵ಂದ 18 ౾.෦ೕ.ಗูಳಜನ ේ෦, ಕකბಟಕ ನಗರ ඩยಃಗಳ  ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1976ರ 

ಉಪීಧಗಳ ಅലಯย౵  ಅඌ๰೉๭ದ ನಗರ ಪค෦ൟಗัಂದ 10 ౾.෦ೕ.ಗูಳಜನ ේ෦, 

ನಗರಸොಗಳ ಪค෦ൟಗัಂದ 5 ౾.෦ೕ.ಗูಳಜನ ේ෦, ඬರಸො ಪค෦ൟಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಪಟౣ ಣ 

ඵೈ෵ൟ ಪค෦ൟಗัಂದ 3 ౾.෦ೕ.ಗูಳಜನ ಸ౽ბರ, ವಋ౭  ಅಥ฿ ๼ಂ඀ උ෦ბಕ ๸๲౩ ಗำ 

ಮൡ౨  ಧ෥ბർಯ ದൟ౨ ಗำ, ಸ౩ ัೕಯ ඩ౳ ඌ౽ರಗำ, ಸ౽ბರದ ಒഷತನ, ඛ฀ತ౳ ಣ ๻ಟ 

ವ౲ ವ๬౩ ಪචಯย౵ ฆವ ๎ಸನಬದ౫  ಅಥ฿ ๎ಸನಬದ౫ ವಲ౵ ದ ๸๲౩ ಡ ๳คฆವ ේ෦ಯඝ౬ : 

ಪฏൡ, ෬ว ඛൽბಷౣ ಪല๭ದ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ຄರൡಪല๭ ಇತರ ಪ౳ ඃಶಗಳย౵ ನ ේ 

ಕಬัಃಡ ๸ීඌ๭ದ ෇౾ ಪ౳ ಕರಣಗำ ತౘಣൽಂದ ಆචತಳ౶ ತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

XX                 XX                XX 

4. ේ ಕಬัಃಯ ඛ๤ಧ.-  XX                 XX                XX 

(3) (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ಅಥ฿ (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ಉಪීಧಗಳඝ౬  ಉಲ౵ ಂಫ๯ವ 
෴่ಬ౯ ඝ, ಅಪฃಧ ඛಣბಯ฿ದ ತฆ฿ಯ, ಒಂൿ ವಷბಃౙ  ಕല෫ಯಲ౵ ದ ಆದฉ ෩ฆ 
ವಷბಗಳವฉಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർದ ಅವඌಯ ౽ฃ฿ಸ ๏ಃ౹ ಂದ ಮൡ౨  ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗಳವฉಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർದ ೩ม౱ ච෵ಂದ ඈലತකಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

XX                 XX                XX 

5. ේ ಕಬัಃಡ ๸ීಧಪಟౣ ಂ൤ ಇತฉ ಅಪฃಧಗัಛಜ ඈಡ.- ෴่ಬ౯  ವ౲ ౾౨ ෷, 
ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಉಪීಧಗಳඝ౬  ಉಲ౵ ಂಫ๭ ේಕಬัಃ ෥ഴವ ඁ๞ౣ ෵ಂದ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ 
ಅಂಥ ේಕಬัಃ ๸ීಧದย౵ ,- 

XX                 XX                XX 

(ಇ) ෴่ಬ౯  ವ౲ ౾౨ ෷, ෬ว ನ෩ൽ๭ದ ෴โඃ ಂತ౲  ෥ഴ๋൤ ෥ലದฉ ಅಥ฿ 
ಅದ౽ౙ ಜ ෴่ಬ౯  ವ౲ ౾౨ ಯඝ౬  අರ౾๭ಆಂಡฉ ಅಥ฿ අರ౾๭ಆಳ౶ ฤ ಪ౳ ಯൟ౬ ๭ದฉ, 

- ಅವඝ, ಅಪฃಧ ඛಣბಯ฿ದ ತฆ฿ಯ, ಒಂൿ ವಷბಃౙ  ಕല෫ ಇಲ౵ ದ ಆದฉ, ෩ฆ 
ವಷბಗัಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർඈಥ ಅವඌಯ ౽ฃ฿ಸ ๏ಃ౹ ෵ಂದ ಮൡ౨  ಇಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖൿ ๬เರ 
งඩ෵ಗัಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർದ ೩ม౱ ච෵ಂದ ඈലತකಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 



7 

 
XX                 XX                XX 

9. เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯಗಳ ౽ಯბเඋನ ಮൡ౨  ಅඌ౽ರಗำ.-  

 XX                 XX                XX 

(2) เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯโ, ෮ಕದ౪ ෫ಯඝ౬  ๸೦ౢ ನಃౙ  ൤ಡൿಆำ౶ ವ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ, ේ 
ಕಬัಃ ෥ಡมಜං෺ಂൿ ಆฌೕඪಸมದ ේ෦ ಇฆವ ೦ಗ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ เ๭౨ ೕಣბ ಅಥ฿ 
෰ಲ౲ ವඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ಒಳತಂലฆವ ಃಡ౾ನ ಗಹನ൤ ಅಥ฿ ಅಗತ౲ เฆವ ක౲ ෽ೕං౪ ೕಶದ 
ඁ๞ౣ ಯඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ๸ීಧಟౣ  ෴โๆ ಇತರ เಷಯಗಳඝ౬  ಪคಗ൐ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(3)ಎม౵  ಆฌೕඪತ ේಕಬัಃ ಂತ౲ ಗำ, ಕಬัಸมದ ේ෦ ಎย౵ ං෽ೕ ಆ ಪ౳ ඃಶ౽ౙ ಜ 
ರ೉ಸมದ เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯ ෥ತ౳ ๆ ಅಥ฿ ಅಂಥ ಪ౳ ඃಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಒಂದ౾ౙ ಂತ ກ೉౞ ನ เ๕ಷ 
ක౲ ෴ಲಯಗัದ౪ ฉ, ಅโಗಳ න౾ ಸ౽ბರโ ಈ ಀคൡ ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലಸಬ๾ർದ ಅಂಥ ಒಂದರย౵  
เೈರൕಯඝ౬  ෥ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 ಪฏൡ, เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯโ ತನ౬  ෨ಂං ಸย౵ ಸมದ ෴โඃ ಅ೧ბ෷ 
෬ส౬ ೕಟಃౙ  ಀ౹ ಲ౵ ಕ ಅಥ฿ ౾ฆಀಳ౽ค෴ಜං෺ಂൿ ಅ෗ඩ౳ ಯಪಟౣ ฉ ಅൿ, ಆ ಅ೧ბಯඝ౬  
෴โඃ, ກ೉౞ ನ เೈರൕಯඝ౬  ನഷಸං ൟರಸౙ คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

XX                 XX                XX 

12. เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯದ ๭ಬ౯ ಂൽ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದലಯย౵  เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯโ 
ತನ౬  ಪ౳ ౽ಯბಗಳඝ౬  චರๆคಸฤ ಸ๻ಯ౽ౙ ಜ ෎౽ಞವ ಅඌ౽คಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  ಇತರ 
ඥಕರರඝ౬  เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯದ ಅಧ౲ ౘฆ ඡ෦๭ಆಳ౶ ಬ๾ൿ. 

 (2) (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದല ඡ෦ಸಬ๾ർದ ಅඌ౽คಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඥಕರರ ಪ౳ ವಗბಗำ, ಅವರ 
๸ಬಳಗำ, ಭ൤౲ ಗำ, ඡಮ౽ൟ เඋನ ಮൡ౨  ಇತರ ๳฿ ಷರൡ౨ ಗำ ಮൡ౨  เ๕ಷ ක౲ ෴ಲಯದ 
ಅಧ౲ ౘರ ಆಡั൞ඌ౽ರಗำ, ಅಧ౲ ౘฌಡච ಸ෥สೕ೉๭ದ ತฆ฿ಯ, ඛಯ෦ಸಬ๾ർඈಥโ 
ಆಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

XX                 XX                XX 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

¸ÀPÁðj ªÀÄÄzÀæuÁ®AiÀÄ, «PÁ¸À ¸ËzsÀ, ¨ÉAUÀ¼ÀÆgÀÄ,  PÁ¸ÀÆ , ¥ÀæwUÀ¼ÀÄ 500, 10£ÉÃ ªÀiÁZïð 2025 



 
KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

SIXTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 
SIXTH SESSION 

THE KARNATAKA LAND GRABBING PROHIBITION (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025 

(LA Bill No. 15 of 2025) 
 

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition Act, 2011.  

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Land Grabbing 

Prohibition Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 38 of 2014), for the purposes hereinafter 

appearing;  

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy sixth year of 

the Republic of India as follows:- 

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 

Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition (Amendment) Act, 2025. 

(2) It shall come into force at once. 

2. Amendment of section 2.- In the Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition 

Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 38 of 2014),(hereinafter referred to as the Principal 

Act)in section 2, in clause (d), in sub-clause (i), after the proviso, the following shall 

be inserted, namely:- 

“Provided further that, where any action has been initiated on lands under 

sections 39, 104 or 67 of the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act 

No. 12 of 1964) by any competent authority, the same shall be excluded. 
 

Provided also that, the distances herein shall be reckoned aerially and in no 

other manner.” 
 

3. Amendment of section 4.- In the Principal Act, in section 4, in sub-

section (3), for the words “twenty five thousand rupees”, the words “fifty thousand 

rupees”, shall be substituted. 



2 
 

 

4. Amendment of section 5.- In the Principal Act, in section 5, in clause (e), 

for the words “twenty five thousand rupees”, the words “fifty thousand rupees”, 

shall be substituted. 

5. Amendment of section 9.- In the Principal Act, in section 9,- 

(i) for sub-section (2), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(2) The Special Court shall for the purpose of taking cognizance of the case, 

consider the location or extent or ownership of the land alleged to have been 

grabbed or of the nature of the illegality involved or in the interest of justice or any 

other relevant matter”. 

(ii) for sub-section (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(3) In respect of an alleged act of land grabbing or the determination of 

questions of title and ownership to, or lawful possession of any land grabbed under 

this Act and offences specified in Chapter XIV-A of the Karnataka Land Revenue 

Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act No. 12 of 1964)may be tried in the Special Court 

constituted for the area in which the land grabbed is situated and the decision of 

the Special Court shall be final:” 

6. Substitution of section 12.- In the Principal Act, for section 12, the 

following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“12. Staff of the special court.-(1) The Government shall appoint officers 

and other employees required to assist the Special Court in the discharge of its 

functions under this Act. 

 

(2) The categories of officers and employees who may be appointed under 

subsection (1), their salaries, allowances, method of recruitment and other 

conditions of service shall be such as may be prescribed. The administrative powers 

of officers and employees appointed under sub-section (1) may be specified by the 

Chairman of the Special Court.” 

 

 

 

 



3 
 

 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 
 

The Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition Act (Karnataka Act 38 of 2014) 
was enacted to establish a "Special Court” in the State for speedy trial of any act 
alleged as 'land grabbing' and to prosecute the offences related to land grabbing, 
ownership of the grabbing land, cases related possession of land legally and such 
offenses specified in Chapter XIV(A) of the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964 
(Karnataka Act 12 of 1964). 

Whereas the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1964) 
has been amended to streamline the provisions for the protection of Government 
Land and land meant for public purposes. The Hon’ble Supreme Court in  Hinch 
Lal Tiwari vs Kamala Devi, Jagpal Singh vs State of Punjab and others and Joginder 
vs State of Haryana and others in reportable judgements has repeatedly 
emphasized the responsibility of the State Government in protecting the 
Government and public lands. This amendment will enable to protect the 
Government land and ensure the revenue officials do not strike from their primary 
responsibility. To introduce the accurate way of measuring distance while filing 
case against encroachment of the Government lands. 

And whereas appointment of staff and employees is a prerogative of the 
Government and governed by the rules, norms and economy orders. Hence, 
surervision of the Government is required for any recruitment. Enhancement of 
penalty in other cases of Land grabbing.   

Hence, the Bill.  

 

 

 

 

 



4 
 

 

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 

 There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed Legislative measure.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



5 
 

 

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION 

 

Clause: 6 sub-section (2), of section 12 proposed to be substituted 
empowers the State Government to prescribe rules the salaries, 
allowances, method of recruitment and other condition of service 
of officers and other employees of the special court.  

 

The proposed delegation of legislative power is normal in character. 

 
 
 
 

 
KRISHNA BYREGOWDA 

Minister for Revenue 
 
 
 
 

M.K. VISHALAKSHI 
Secretary 

Karnataka Legislative Assembly 
 

  

 
 
 



6 
 

 

ANNEXURE 

Extract from the Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition Act, 2011 

(Karnataka Act 38 of 2014) 

XXX    XXX    XXX 
 

 2. Definitions.- In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,-  

XXX    XXX    XXX 

(d) “Land‟‟ includes,- 2 [(i) Land falling in all urban areas of the State and 

also land falling within 18 kms from the Bruhat Bengaluru MahanagaraPalike 

limits, land falling within 10 kms from the city limits notified under the provisions 
of the Karnataka Municipal Corporations Act, 1976, land falling within 5 kms from 

the City Municipal Council limits, land falling within 3 kms from the Town 
Municipal Council limits and Town Panchayat limits belonging to the Government, 

Wakf or the Hindu Religious Institutions and Charitable Endowments, a local 

authority, a statutory or nonstatutory body owned, controlled or managed by the 

Government: Provided that, excluding the land specified above in all other areas the 
cases pending related to land grabbing shall stand abated forthwith. 

4. Prohibition of land grabbing.-XXX  XXX  XXX 

(3) Whoever contravenes the provisions of sub-section (1) or sub-section (2) 

shall on conviction, be punished with imprisonment for a term which shall not be 

less than one year but which may extend to three years, and with fine which may 

extend to twenty five thousand rupees.  

XXX    XXX    XXX 

5. Penalty for other offences in connection with land grabbing.- Whoever, 

with a view to grabbing land in contravention of the provisions of this Act or in 
connection with any such land grabbing,-  

XXX    XXX    XXX 

(e) causes or procures or attempts to procure any person to do any of above 

mentioned acts;  

shall, on conviction, be punished with imprisonment for a term which shall 

not be less than one year but which may extend to three years and with fine which 
may extend to twenty five thousand rupees. 

XXX    XXX    XXX 

9. Procedure and powers of the Special Courts.-XXX XXX XXX 

(2) The Special Court shall for the purpose of taking cognizance of the case, 

consider the location, or extent or value of the land alleged to have been grabbed or 
of the substantial nature of the evil involved or in the interest of justice required or 
any other relevant matter.  



7 
 

 

(3) All alleged acts of land grabbing shall be tried only by the Special Court 
constituted for the area in which the land is situated, or where there are more 

Special Courts than one for such area, by such one of them as may be specified in 

this behalf by the Government. 

Provided that if, in the opinion of the Special Court, any application filed 
before it, is prima facie frivolous or vexatious, it shall reject the same without any 
further enquiry. 

XXX    XXX    XXX 

12. Staff of the Special Court.- (1) The chairman of the Special Court may 

appoint officers and other employees required to assist the Special Court in the 
discharge of its functions under this Act.  

(2) The categories of officers and employees who may be appointed under 

subsection (1), their salaries, allowances, method of recruitment and other 

conditions of service and the administrative powers of the Chairman of the Special 
Court shall be such as may be prescribed, after consultation with the Chairman. 

 

XXX   XXX    XXX 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengalur, 17th Mar, 2025, P7, W.D. , Copies 500 


