TATTICe NPeRDY
303C WRNEST

FOoF &% P FWDF ARG (3T IB) IGZCODF, 2025
(202538 QHoSTLECR JPeeks :30935—15)

FTOIEET 3R FWPT ORG 9PIOND, 201130, aNI ), 3T HE a300TEN 20T
QATRODT.

Q). YREN0T FORBWRE NBL3NPMON Foe&dT B3R FWPT ORI,
201130, (20148 TIE&T ©RPICHD R0Bs 38) D3R, ST BR 0830
O30T 200NBIHTWOOTS;

YT 003 NEAT0%T DR,IATS, adme BE), TooFEdT Toss dPONOTBORNOT &3
Aol el R SIANIOWSNCTArIal S

1. I0FF*3B BRIV DI, TT0YI.- (1) B8 LPRICDRNRD, TOIEET PR FWPT
ARG (STT) L9DADE, 2025 0T BBOHIT,R,..

(2) AR S8 TP 201 20333,

2. RVTOW 20 W BR.-ToorEdT PR TWPT QRCF 9PN, 2011 (20143
FTooFEdT RIOND 38)(VL), BRENOTW DR IRAONNTIOT eNe3LDRINI)T 2:3¢
TyTORT  (B) DOBTA, (I NJDOBTAS TOOINTE IO &8 a30DIT,
AOR3T,R, DOTWT:-

"203), WC0I) TOREET 230 TOWIORN LIPIONTD, 1964 (19648 T €T IR0
12)3 39, 104 953500 673¢ FTTLONF L 230NNY 03 OB FFD TYRTOONE) O0e)TIC
FaDeS ), DYTO AT, 9T, 2 DB3T,0,.

R B/T0I), V), OIVNPI, WyedodTeooN (aerially) 33,700T3T,53), 03I,
0300e)TE BT AHPOTR), BONBRIT,TZ.L).."

3. BT00 40 3T BR.- DR LIPNIONINT 43¢ TyTTLOT (3)¢ NI &T LT Toas
"PR,3,4730 AT BRDIANPR[TNR” D020 TJWAYR WD "80e33), AT
BREOINP VR D02 BBNPIY, B3R RERAIT,),.



4. BTV 58 W) BB.- DR e9PIONTNT 53¢ TyFTLIT (V) VR Iy T 33
"G 43,4730 ARe)T CREIONNPT” 0L WBNPNR TN "60e33), A0edT BRTIONNPR" D0
BBNF,, 303 CBRIT,E,.

5. B339 90 3T BR.- 30RO L9PNIONTNT I TyFTTE),,-
(i) QVBTTTED (2)3 0TWN T3 FNODITIN, &) 3ASRERRIT,TI),, OTIT:-

"(2) AHT D503 WRTT PN, R0, L3R 3RTRFE T L3T,N,
5340eOPNT, FWPT e300BRNTIEH O eSBREDRIIT 2300003 ATIES Nt €950 93T
eJRLDE LTIV VT B 230, IR0 WFNRODTE TSR IWI0T3ON R CRT 9T
V53R LITI TyA,00R0, 9T C0e)TE WIT ROWOHPI IRONIR), RONBRITI).

(i) OUTTTTED (3)C WBN B8 e0I0RTTI, T)3BRERAIT, T3, DOTT:-

") 9RARDNDDTER STRLDROIT PR TRPTOD T,YIs R0 BI,AEDs 03,
BROTI B BFOD IPECHW 9T &8 FWPIOT 00T 23000 TSRV,
FO,DLI30D TN FUIELT 30 TOWIOD SIPIOND, 1964 (19648 FUoEEIT 9RO
12)3 953050 XIV-d-8€), ADEF R, BRACT 9TTOFENY FOWOFHE), FWPAOT 230edd
PNT  SBW  JREST,N  BBRRT  IFHR  D0500OCNTE).  e9RIFOTHBORNTY,
SBONWTBIT &I, TR V000N eI Jag) 903D NTIT,T),."

6. ®¥T0D 120 TF)3O3RCWN.- NP LIRNIANDET 123¢ JyFTHT WTBOR 8
FORTTIN, &W)3A3RCBRIT,,, DOTT:-

12, IFCR ©o;,000DT  AW0D.- (1) B PRIRDDDTROND,  IFR
Vo;0ONEY) I, TyTOORENFS), STXORD) [Ty  ARBIRTT,N  INB5eIT0e3
ODTONF I, &NIY, BIT 220,000, ATETed) ST e00B 3T,

(2) NOTWETTED (1)B SN TeIONLITBITIVE LIPTOONE) 03I, NPTTT Wje3NeE NS, €933
ROWPNE), B3NP, SeDTo3 IHS 203, BIT A0 RBOINE) QONARWTITVCTOI
BUV3T,E),. (1) BTTTRWER  SCeROITW  9DTONY) aNI), I°FITT BRPIIT
ORTIVNFN, TR V5030 ONT CITIsTTY DR ETI@ TR WTIT.”



T LBNPH H3), FoONY BCPTF

FTOOEET PR TUPT ARG 9RIODD, 2014 (20143 FUEE3T 9PDIOND 38)30,
00%53C). "5340 TRPTFT ONOITB® O0e)TC 30D FH3IsNY €99e)2FTHBONTY, 3 03NRLIEN
DI, Po FWPT, FWPAT PO WBIT, ToSLIDWEE0N BeedOD Ao HDIST,
ROWORATW ToNL FUEET 30 TOWORN RO, 1964 (19648 ToeEIT 9RO
12)3 5000  XIV(Q)TD), ADEFR,DBRATOT  OBTIPNPT  FOWORAT  JyFTLony
€92) A3UCZIMON TR V5030000, A ARE) LIPICNeNIRRPRIING.

RTED PR aNI), APRE T AT LTTO,NT 2302003 TTHBNMONS SVTWOBNT,
003,31 BB TREENT 2300 TOTWIOR €PN, 1964 (19643 TRREEIT LRI 12)30,
3TN RBB BN, w0 ReRLE, V50300 00%W® ey 33300 ITIE, T
), MW AOTT DTNT, WO Ty o03I), VWSTT) Tone BeCNOWT® LTI,
BOREED Tog a0I), VITT), YINYAS B[R Bty AR)FNP). IFTETW NI,
AOWEL T 230N FOTTHBONE), Doy ATOE T 220020,.000), BELBTC %Y, TP, &3
3TN JBBO) RTETTW  BReONT),; AOTFATHT) e0I3), TOWIOH PTONY) €930
YT eNT 2299239, 00008 BRTBRINTTOITIYT, V03VBRRIZE. ATETE 230N
2323800 AT, JyTTLNY DDDAIN O0ITRY, STTOE DT 0N a3,
DYTOLRIHTN.

220,00 D3I, SPTTT SeNTO30) ATE BT BT TOTI0NTI), 30oNe )ONINED,
FRITOBNR) NI, BRET BTINE DROT BWPI D3 0RIMIHTOOT, 00T
JeDNTAMON  ATOETT N LFITBONTY,  INBBRBACNT.  Be  FWPITOD B33
TYTTNFS), BOBIONT, B3, RN,

ST DO B8 IGKONT.



SDFT 2, IS R,

F0e)3 TORTIT Taed OIIEC BT 3323,550, WFREORTIID,



39,0300 3 FOAFTODTVOE VI 23, VI K3

DOT3-6

123¢ BBTEOW NPT F3A3RCBI) W LRV () VR -TyTT:),
)R V500D 0NT LPTOONY) DI, BIT S°TTT SCaNT TooNe ROVPNRYD,
B35, DTS IS 0B, V3T Afede ROIDNY DI DODTINF I,
CBA) Doy AT TT, LIPTOTaI, LIS .

TyAY,e)3 TAS BBIO &3)F05030¢2:30300 290 TOD A BRI NI .

TR, WeOCITPR
TOWIO 03

N0.8. QToRE,
TOODNFTEF
BIOF 3T QOIRG




WO

BooF&dT P FPF PI0HD, 20110
(20140 B33 eoDAoDed Foad; 38) 3,3 won

XX XX XX

2. BOLRAY .- T8 LRI, FOTWLIE ) LIV INB;BRAT BRTI,-
XX XX XX

(83) PR DOTT,-
XX XX XX

"(i) DO25T8 D39, SNT WTBNY O S 2340edd TONR 29yT3* WONKRAT) eNTOSNT WOOT
BDA3AN0TW 18 B.LDENLRPNS 230e)), ToOFET SINT TDINY RO, 19763
NBWORPNY RBONE). IPNIBRWBAT SNT BDNINPLOT 10 3.DENLRPNS 2300,
SNSRPAY @DNINPOTW 5 3.NCNRAERFNS 2300ed), TR BDNIN DI, W3,
FTOTIONS BVeN3NPOTW 3 3. NLRYNS BT T, BT, €950 0B PeET AOA NP
DI, FeFmaod BWINY, I LD DYPTITNS, FTETH WBIT, DODOJD TN
B35 A,B/I0DNE) BDeS TOASWE, 9T TOASWEH L FORN ADTIZS 23000y

B0, NS ADER,BBAT BoICHTY, BATHTBL B30 FEINTAS 50
BB FOWODIT 2308 FFTONT) SFLOOT BOSKOY,33,3,."

XX XX XX
4. PR FYFOD ORCG.- XX XX XX

() (1D OBVTyTTRT OFTde (2 NWTTTIE  GOBWOFNFI), VORI
O300E3R20,R), €9WTAE IEONWRE 3T0e00R, WOTD TWRE T, TRNODNDE 3BT DRI
BRENAFDTTR  DFDAWTIDOE  9BPHON ToD9WeAR T, OB aDI), [YRB,3,4E0 AedT
CREIOINP TN IAR,DRDTITOE BIVIAN0T WOLRIVNIT,3),.

XX XX XX

5. 3R FRPIN J0WOFRE,03 933 dRVTPNRALNON BWOR.- 0302, a358,030,
B3 9RO NTWWOENF T, PV 0N PRTWPT e0TBIET T3ye, 0TI 9T O30 T3C
903 PRI WPT ROWORTE,,-

XX XX XX

() ORI, 353,030, 33 SDPDAT OVYTIE T35 23903e303 2R T L9IT3e00
TN O30 R,, 5TONT), BRTBATAOWT LI WRTIATRF,N &3/03.3, 533,

- 953D, BTG NDEONWIT 3TIe00R, 20T BWRET, TLD VAL ST, aNLRT
BRENLT  DFDAWTBICOTEOT  9BRDON ToO0ad0A DFANOTW aDI), VB3, 4G0 @0edT
BREIOINPN )R DAWIBITIOE 2,30 BOLIVNITE),,.



XX XX XX
9. AR V0359 0DNY FPODNFIPON NI, LIPTOTNY).-
XX XX XX

(2) DR V50PN, TRTTIENONT, A0, ST, INTNTRPES ST L3T,N, B8R
FPT 20BN ONORD BSTREDRCIIE 230edd BB TN 9IG00 IWT DALLDE 9T
PO, BT WFNROBRE TBIS NBSI P INI5edB0e ;8RR LT
By AL0NRD, eIGe00 BOWOGIE, O350e)a3 G3T LDROPNT ), SONBRI T,

(B)), S3TRLDI BRTWYT TSNP, TWPRT 3R ) BA3RE €3 T3 eSTo,N
BBROIE dFHR J95030000 30033 €900 0T ITTT,N 2,003,038 BW,S DR
V50O CNNYT B, L9IYNY By ATOE Tag) B8 DI DDEFR,BRAWIBITIOT 90T 20T,
JFOTHBODN, 2T T,

RB03), IFHR DO0O0NY) I, WWOW A IERT  OVHYTC €923
RBRSBRLET, T)OT 9T FTIDPTOONNEBONOT) €92)TY0NTE,T 9T, €3 9IBEODNTI),
O30T, B3, DWOTBONI), SBARE 3CX,DRITE,..

XX XX XX
12. AR 9503500 JW,0N.- (1) B8 LIDDONNTRONE). dFHRT Vo030 ON)

33, FJTOODENPI, [STHOAD) ATOODT,N T RNTONTI, D3, BIT
VOTTT, dFeR V950300 0NT BITISTT e ATRBRITIT.

(2) (1) VTTTTLRTWE R WIITIVT LIRTIONS) NI, FOFTT Fje3Ne NS, €930
ROWPNE), 33;NPD, SeDT3 IGON 03I, BIT Aledo RO NPD eI, TR Mo503500NTI
935 T0 SBP IR TOTNY), LIIT;FTCRTBS Ae3i0S023 AT 3BIa300R, OB LTITITOTa)
BSNTIT,T,.

XX XX XX

TFFO BOTFHOOCR, VTR AP, LBONHRDD, TAR ., JAML 500, 103e [weFE 2025



KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SIXTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SIXTH SESSION

THE KARNATAKA LAND GRABBING PROHIBITION (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025
(LA Bill No. 15 of 2025)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition Act, 2011.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Land Grabbing
Prohibition Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 38 of 2014), for the purposes hereinafter

appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy sixth year of

the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the

Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition (Amendment) Act, 2025.
(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2.- In the Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition
Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 38 of 2014),(hereinafter referred to as the Principal
Act)in section 2, in clause (d), in sub-clause (i), after the proviso, the following shall

be inserted, namely:-

“Provided further that, where any action has been initiated on lands under
sections 39, 104 or 67 of the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act
No. 12 of 1964) by any competent authority, the same shall be excluded.

Provided also that, the distances herein shall be reckoned aerially and in no

other manner.”

3. Amendment of section 4.- In the Principal Act, in section 4, in sub-
section (3), for the words “twenty five thousand rupees”, the words “fifty thousand

rupees”, shall be substituted.



2

4. Amendment of section 5.- In the Principal Act, in section 5, in clause (e),
for the words “twenty five thousand rupees”, the words “fifty thousand rupees”,

shall be substituted.
5. Amendment of section 9.- In the Principal Act, in section 9,-

(i) for sub-section (2), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(2) The Special Court shall for the purpose of taking cognizance of the case,
consider the location or extent or ownership of the land alleged to have been
grabbed or of the nature of the illegality involved or in the interest of justice or any

other relevant matter”.

(ii) for sub-section (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(3) In respect of an alleged act of land grabbing or the determination of
questions of title and ownership to, or lawful possession of any land grabbed under
this Act and offences specified in Chapter XIV-A of the Karnataka Land Revenue
Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act No. 12 of 1964)may be tried in the Special Court
constituted for the area in which the land grabbed is situated and the decision of

the Special Court shall be final:”

6. Substitution of section 12.- In the Principal Act, for section 12, the

following shall be substituted, namely:-

“12. Staff of the special court.-(1) The Government shall appoint officers
and other employees required to assist the Special Court in the discharge of its

functions under this Act.

(2) The categories of officers and employees who may be appointed under
subsection (1), their salaries, allowances, method of recruitment and other
conditions of service shall be such as may be prescribed. The administrative powers
of officers and employees appointed under sub-section (1) may be specified by the

Chairman of the Special Court.”



3

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition Act (Karnataka Act 38 of 2014)
was enacted to establish a "Special Court” in the State for speedy trial of any act
alleged as 'land grabbing' and to prosecute the offences related to land grabbing,
ownership of the grabbing land, cases related possession of land legally and such
offenses specified in Chapter XIV(A) of the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964
(Karnataka Act 12 of 1964).

Whereas the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1964)
has been amended to streamline the provisions for the protection of Government
Land and land meant for public purposes. The Hon’ble Supreme Court in Hinch
Lal Tiwari vs Kamala Devi, Jagpal Singh vs State of Punjab and others and Joginder
vs State of Haryana and others in reportable judgements has repeatedly
emphasized the responsibility of the State Government in protecting the
Government and public lands. This amendment will enable to protect the
Government land and ensure the revenue officials do not strike from their primary
responsibility. To introduce the accurate way of measuring distance while filing
case against encroachment of the Government lands.

And whereas appointment of staff and employees is a prerogative of the
Government and governed by the rules, norms and economy orders. Hence,
surervision of the Government is required for any recruitment. Enhancement of
penalty in other cases of Land grabbing.

Hence, the Bill.



4

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed Legislative measure.



5

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

Clause: 6 sub-section (2), of section 12 proposed to be substituted
empowers the State Government to prescribe rules the salaries,
allowances, method of recruitment and other condition of service
of officers and other employees of the special court.

The proposed delegation of legislative power is normal in character.

KRISHNA BYREGOWDA
Minister for Revenue

M.K. VISHALAKSHI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Assembly




6

ANNEXURE
Extract from the Karnataka Land Grabbing Prohibition Act, 2011

(Karnataka Act 38 of 2014)
XXX XXX XXX

2. Definitions.- In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,-
XXX XXX XXX

(d) “Land™" includes,- 2 [(i) Land falling in all urban areas of the State and
also land falling within 18 kms from the Bruhat Bengaluru MahanagaraPalike
limits, land falling within 10 kms from the city limits notified under the provisions
of the Karnataka Municipal Corporations Act, 1976, land falling within 5 kms from
the City Municipal Council limits, land falling within 3 kms from the Town
Municipal Council limits and Town Panchayat limits belonging to the Government,
Wakf or the Hindu Religious Institutions and Charitable Endowments, a local
authority, a statutory or nonstatutory body owned, controlled or managed by the
Government: Provided that, excluding the land specified above in all other areas the
cases pending related to land grabbing shall stand abated forthwith.

4. Prohibition of land grabbing.-XXX XXX XXX

(3) Whoever contravenes the provisions of sub-section (1) or sub-section (2)
shall on conviction, be punished with imprisonment for a term which shall not be
less than one year but which may extend to three years, and with fine which may
extend to twenty five thousand rupees.

XXX XXX XXX

5. Penalty for other offences in connection with land grabbing.- Whoever,
with a view to grabbing land in contravention of the provisions of this Act or in
connection with any such land grabbing,-

XXX XXX XXX

(e) causes or procures or attempts to procure any person to do any of above
mentioned acts;

shall, on conviction, be punished with imprisonment for a term which shall
not be less than one year but which may extend to three years and with fine which
may extend to twenty five thousand rupees.

XXX XXX XXX
9. Procedure and powers of the Special Courts.-XXX XXX XXX

(2) The Special Court shall for the purpose of taking cognizance of the case,
consider the location, or extent or value of the land alleged to have been grabbed or
of the substantial nature of the evil involved or in the interest of justice required or
any other relevant matter.



7

(3) All alleged acts of land grabbing shall be tried only by the Special Court
constituted for the area in which the land is situated, or where there are more
Special Courts than one for such area, by such one of them as may be specified in
this behalf by the Government.

Provided that if, in the opinion of the Special Court, any application filed
before it, is prima facie frivolous or vexatious, it shall reject the same without any
further enquiry.

XXX XXX XXX

12. Staff of the Special Court.- (1) The chairman of the Special Court may
appoint officers and other employees required to assist the Special Court in the
discharge of its functions under this Act.

(2) The categories of officers and employees who may be appointed under
subsection (1), their salaries, allowances, method of recruitment and other
conditions of service and the administrative powers of the Chairman of the Special
Court shall be such as may be prescribed, after consultation with the Chairman.

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengalur, 17t Mar, 2025, P7, W.D. , Copies 500



