TATTICe NPeRDY
303C WRNEST

Fooréds 3020003000 (3WH RBR) AZCodh &, 2025
(202538 QHONTLECH PR 30936—04)

TOOEET SCe00t3edTOCT IPIOND, 196130, aNIR), ST WE T
20003 ATEODT.

Q). YBEN0T  FORWAE NBLINLMON Tor&dT  30a0003ed0T3
9RO, 1961 (19628 T EIT RO 12)3), aNIT R, TR 23I0T8I)TI)
ONT 200NBIH OO ;

QY P03 NOTHT  DR,IOE SRERDE),  TooedddT Do
LROTTNOTODOT 3 eNIODTO0 I IR ZeIoN ;-

1. TOFR, BRIV DI, ®WYT0P.- (1) B WPIDRNEI, TOEET
3e0T3e)TIOTT (3T, FBE) 9RO, 2025 0T FTONIT,T,..

(2) BT 8 TPTWE3 230N WIB3T,T),.

2. FB00 100 3WI_BB.- T &dT 3(a003LedTOTT 9PN, 1961 (19623
FooEET 9PN 12)T ([, BYR0,z3000T 2RO IR0 OT FTODETDNT)
103 RTTRTS), "800 WVRENY” N0 JBINY WRON "D0BY JRENY” 0
BBAP, B33 CBRIT,,,

3. §T0@ 158 W BR.- DR RINNT 153¢ &JyFTLT (3)3¢ V-
TYTTTS 3B200 T8 eNI0T PFT-TWjTTEe3), ADRIT,T,, DOTT:-

"4) BB OPIRDNDT DD, ToorEdT edI3DT 0B, DPRIIT DR
9RO, 2004 (20043 TR EIT 9RO 14)3 SVEWOPRFI), OB &353,0300
QU ONATT, TOWIOD YOB TR0 NMYeddTIOLTHD, 20I), WOFTVONI* T
BB BT SNU0REHR, VU8 9w SNT O3l YU 950 03P
D3, DTY PR, BB 95300 Ae0t T YR €900 &I, AODs3T
T30 YLD ITT00 LIBTEL), TEID5E0 YV €900 00TNPT SBNENS €92)e3,R,



BB N 2) 9IRTIDON) AOWORHES, D3R, 0°, ATBONT DVA,,0° CITe00
88 DI Doty ATOE Tag) LIRNTINRP A O3 L9DTON 308 300B 3T,

(5) DRA,,0°, ATB/IONT DVA,,,0° 9IF0 HPNTINRPAT O3 9IPTIDOAIN
333 R,03 TR IGO0 NVRIFTTD (1)3TD). ES3LNAIT 9PNTONS A AT
OO T, B HDACHENTE PVBWOGFRFE Bahaswh, BHe,33,T0,."

4. 15 D3I, 152) VPRI RFOONY ACRFT.- DR BDIODNNT 153
TYTTATI 3BI2I00N B8 eNI0ON BRA TyFTTEINF D, ALDAIT,),, DOTWT:-

"15d. WOWNTERIFD® DROT  D0oBNY Q3 FFRRIIF.-
LIBNY, VIBERRRIYTT,N, AOONOT 9GP0 30eI0tCITOCS T3S
NP5 TN FOODE DIE0 AN ATIE T OIPRRBTBIOD NPOT
20T TRE D, DT ZRBITLEY,. V3TBE a0I), &N TOD TOONE IO
DI, TRNERRBTIF) DO RWTIDIOT )POSEE) 33T,

152). BOTNTAUVINY DW00H RCDF.- AT Tag) ART0E BDOTNTRTI
NI Dleon) TOODE 3523, 00T, RO AR IT,T,,. FHONTRTI ANIplelson!
FTOONE B3R, 0N TOODEIPONT  aNI),  NEARBNY) DO RWIBIWIOT
LPIST) B3T,30,.."

5. ®F0e0 370 SWIH_RBR.- (1) 3NR IPIONTNT 373¢ TJyFTTLT (2)3€ V-
TBOTE). -

(D) "e33) 3ONP[IN" DN0W RWNY WWOR "B, BRENPITN” O
BRAF I, 8RB RCBRIT,TY,,; a0,

() "20TD AT TRTIAWNFITNR" D0 JIINY  WTBOR  “808D OF
CREONNF [T 020 BWNF, &35 RIT,),.

6. B30 380 STWH_BR.- (1) aDR L9RICNNT 383 BTTTE),, -

(D) "WORD WREWIVNR” D0 JBBNY BN "®BI3), WRENFRTR” dOW
BENF I, 8RB RLBRIT,TY,,; eI,

() "80e33), AT TRTIOWNPR[TNR" N0 JIFNY WTOR "800 OF
BREONNFR[TNR” 020 BWNFD, &)303eCLRIT,),.



7. B30 3800 FCRFT.- (1) 2DR LD 383 TByTTEATS 3TIe00 S8
ZORITI, ALDRIT,E,, DOTIT:-

"38. WOT0ITW FHINTW WFTFTOD ARCG.- (1) OB 353,000 IO BT
O30T AT a3 eA3eIIADTT 208, 0N, LDPRITTL,.

(2) €360V FOOTVTDOTI T BARCIVION e33ToNC) 9T €33
NBOET NROTINGD 90 333 BEWN0W AWRD0wane) )¢ 933
DOTOIT FDBRY, WFAST,EL)., D), VOO0 BALRDICHN Oz )T
R CRTT,N S8 HIPRIONXDT NWVWWOBNFPR WOBIN BRBOIINIT,), ToNe &
IDACNTDT TR VTWONREIVEIOZ 90T €3¢e00t3e)TOTR  SLCOTIEIONTI,
9230033,V EBA N SIAND) OJANIAI Y[ SN) SeC0TIER Y PRTO O
&I TOTe) ¥, 00 NT 3T, ).,

ARVW: T8 JTCORW NTLINPMN, 3€ei0tdTO0S  aNDROT  "OONMITT
BT "WOTTOITW Fa"ad) B8 0TI INP ), WP, DOTWT:-

(i) FOOMOTT, G0 33JT/STOD N0 AWAON 23,We33), TOBTHT
B0 SBABRTWILITD 9T H0ARONTY, WFATT) 9T 933e300)AIeHTI)
IR0 WERORIRIHTD, €9T3e00

(i) ROOMITIRN,, €33T/S3TOD TEN0W AWAT, B IFDOTW B FPT, DCO0IZTedoN
20020ODRT)T) BT €333/3FTO 2WwHBIST P WFFTONA S 00x)e &,3,1
N5y IRITHT) 9T €33 /e3TANOT FILBRP YT CITed0 O0e)TE I0T3
RS WPTT €98 BLIRITIH T, LIGa00

(i) AOOMITC) WRWDPNTE BP0 TOR RBIITE PN 235630000
SBAISTVE DS 900 V3T APT, WORBOITW Tjeadd), FHiePes B L30T
es3Mm 23063 LTI T 95300 3€30350m0e303 00 RBIEH T, €T30

(iv) ROOMPTINR 3B T3 3MON WOTOITW NI, 9B I &FjIoeseddd, WP
03TIN/20390NRR)TWT, VAN T BRTMINR T WoBds; NVBINY,
BJeT® 303,30300%,533 A0, WPRITHTD, 900

(V) ATOETT O30T FOONE TNTWRONE), FOOMITIN &33BT BB, NS,
0300 T WA 263, AOOMRTIOT 20e303eI0N T OIEHT.”



4

8. BTV 390 3T BR.- DR 9PN 393¢ BFTTLITE),,-
() DOT ()3 -

(i) "20O0T) VREWRTN IR DARWIBIROE AW FTOUARN0T" D0 BWNY
WBON "RV BRENFRBTR IR DRWTIDRE ToUARN0R" 02 BWNAPI),
T 3RBRRRIT,T,,; a3,

(i) "80333), AT TRTIANNFRTN" D02 JIINY DTOR "2DRT OF
BREDIONNF [T 02 BWRFN,, B33 RIT,),,.
() DOTB ()3 -

(i) "NTB) TRETRTVN LR DRWIICIOE AW TOURAN0R" D0W BWNY
BN "), BDRENPTOR IR DRWBITOE  FoU00ARN0TW" D0W BVBERNYI,
T 3BRCRRIT,),,; aNIY,

(i) “20T ©F TRDIOVNFYR[INR" D0w BINY BOR "0  OF
BR@DIONNF [T 020 BWRFN,, B3OS RIT,D,.



5

VT LINPH H3), ToONnY BCPTF

SRT,OMNT, et ITWIT DB, R),C3  SCe00t3eITTT) LTI
WD Wk, WONY 9083 3R0WT aNI), WOR03TW RRRCWS LPOSNPOT
BRETIN  DWED  MORNS NI, NP, TFA)BT,N, TOe&dT
30e0T3e)TTT 9RO, 1961 (19628 Toe&dT IR 12)3), 3T T
eTBITIT) 9e3T5TI0T) TSONEIATS.

e3T3.D0T B8 LIGFCONT.



SDFT 2, IS R,

TR,IS TOAV3T TeDRDOWoN 00T B2, 36,29 SVOEIIMHD)..



R)39;03,0C 2R 3 FOZTODTOOT TV W, IS R3)

DOT 4

(1) 88 DOWT eNRDT ALDAD) TAY.DATIES 15-6 yTTEIeY) O,
BREOS DDPOT BIFE oD, DFATOAD dRoSTY,NS
FTOODEIPOS  aNI),  ONERRBNFI, DONDNY  DDROT
QAONNR) ATOE VT, LIDTOTEIN, WIS .

2) &8 DOBT DPOT AADA) TyARDATE  15-2) TTTa))
PDOWTATE Q0T XDTOD DOWTRTI DT
FTOONE 53R, ONS  FoONEIPOS DI,  aoNne RPWNPID,
QAONTINY ZDRDT DONNAD) AT TT, L9PTOTEII), RIS,

TR,IS TOAS BFV0RTOCE &330503/0¢23030) @0l FTOD A BRI, NG.

F9;3,003) OD°. DO,
Tod a30TE3 0N, BRTIVTEA
ABTOT &N0Y

N0.8. NToRE,
TOONFTEF
BIOF 3T OIRG




(ETM AN ol
FooFédT 303003000 9D, 19613 (19628 FoF 3T aDAODD 12)

nT_y3 on

XXX XXX XXX

10. SRS OID.- SAIS TR, O [RENY w0 93N
20T 5e00NTIT,T3),:

VW03, AT, BRODTIE et eITOTD, 63 TyTCEE (1) VT TTTEITS
9RONE). DONNFCIVT DIV0TE,03 a02F, 9IT03TTW 93N FOWORATI03 2,07 BRA
SR N 9B IDRWT, ©OT  HtdO0TT),  WRS  HARDS  9a3OIN
FINODDTI N BRA R NTON TOITROT 933 LIBETT FOWORDAT03 95330 230D
STRINFI),  ALTOAITEOR 93T 20T DTl SRS, BRODTEIOW)
IARINEICEAAME

XXX XXX XXX

37. WORPRI, WOFWPHNYD), 3F), DRI TR, SNRDRIFHT w0TWd
OR0VG.-
XXX XXX XXX
) (NI NVIJTTRTW  VBWOPNYTY, ORI O3¢  e3ne),  eITTG
QAEREONWIT €3 €380 3ONPTTN LR DRWIIVE FoUWADOT &G 200D AT
BRETIAINF TN IR DRIBITIOE BOBROT 95300 YRITWOOTOR SOLITINITTD,.
XXX XXX XXX

38. QORTW)ePF,N WOBR.- T ARSI LFANTIE FODOT WAROMN FSOMOTIN
NTVT)eS TRTWI IR0 IWF, wTLDRI OOTE eSTWTR, LITTIE IREONWIT a0ee3,
20T BRETRBN A DRVTBITOE FOUD0RDOT &9ITI0 80533), AedT BUaeto QNS ST
R DRWTITOT TIDRANOTS €9T3590 YesCBDOTWOR L3O ZTNIT, T3,

XXX XXX XXX

39. BoBNYR FJoWORDAW TeHON; LOBVWOFPNA.- &8 OPRIANTNT  O30eHT
UTBWOTRTY, DODA) 3D,T 90 IW), VONAT OoBE  353.0350Ne), &8
L9RAONNTA), OHTE ADER,, BOBWR, NBWORPATRRL), OBTIG DDEONWIT
a30¢e3,-

() BRTOI LITTILITY,N 2,0T) eIRETWITN IA,DAWIIWOCT RO TOUD0R DO
PN 03), AT  CRDIOINPRCNR IADIWTBIWOT  BVIDSA0T 9530
YRICBOOTOR WORITNIT,I),,; a3,

() DVBRC IT00 =I0TNRTT €9TTIEETO,N DT eSRE LT )R DA WIITIITI
RO TOUIRIARNOT IF0 WwOR) OF BRTIOINFRDTN IR,DRWIBITOE IO 0T
95300 YRTBOOTWDOR BORITNIT,I),.

XXX XXX XXX

TTE0 BRTHIOOR, DTA FOF, WONKRD, AR , BENH 500, 33¢ TPFE 2025

=



3

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SIXTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SIXTH SESSION

THE KARNATAKA MONEY LENDERS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025
(LA Bill No. 04 of 2025)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Money Lenders Act, 1961.

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Money Lenders Act,

1961 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1962) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the seventy sixth year of

the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the

Karnataka Money Lenders (Amendment) Act, 2025.
(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 10.- In section 10 of the Karnataka Money
Lenders Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1962)(herein after referred to as the

Principal Act) for the words “five years” the words “two years” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 15.- In section 15 of Principal Act, after sub-

section (3), the following sub- sections shall be inserted, namely:-

“(4) The Group B Officer of Revenue Department or Rural Development and
Panchayath Raj Department or Urban Development Department or Town Planning
Department or Woman and Child Development Department or Social Welfare
Department or Minority Welfare Department or Tribal Welfare Department or
Backward Classes Welfare Department shall report if any person is in contravention
of the provisions of this Act and the Karnataka Prohibition of Charging Exorbitant
Interest Act, 2004 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 2004) to the concerned Registrar,
Assistant Registrar or any Officer authorized by the State Government, in this

behalf.

(5) The Registrar, the Assistant Registrar or any Officer authorized may on his
own motion or on the report submitted by the Officers referred in sub-section (1),

shall take action under the provisions of this Act.”



2

4. Insertion of new sections 15 A and 15 B.- After section 15 of the

Principal Act, the following new sections shall be inserted, namely,-

“15-A. Settlement of disputes by Ombudsperson.- The Government shall
by notification appoint an Ombudsperson who can act as a mediator between the
borrower or lender, for settling the disputes. The procedure and guidelines for the

settlement and mediation shall be in the manner as may be prescribed.

15-B. Grievances Redressal Forum.- The Government shall establish
suitable grievance mechanism. The procedure and guidelines for grievance

mechanism shall be in the manner as may be prescribed.”

5. Amendment of section 37.- In section 37 of Principal Act, in sub-

section (2),-

(a) for the words “six months”, the words “ten years”, shall be substituted;

and
(b) for the words “one thousand”, the words “five lakh”, shall be substituted.
6. Amendment of section 38.- In section 38 of the Principal Act,-
(a) for the words “one year”, the words “ten years”, shall be substituted; and
(b) for the words “fifty thousand”, the words “five lakh”, shall be substituted.

7. Insertion of section 38A.- After section 38 of the Principal Act, the

following shall be inserted namely,-

“38A. Prohibition of using coercive action.- (1) No person shall charge

exorbitant interest on any loan advanced by him.

(2) Money Lender shall not use any coercive action either by himself or by his
agents or by his family members for recovery of money from the debtor and any
form of coercive recovery shall be liable for punishment under the provisions of this
Act and empower the Registering Authority to suspend or cancel the Registration of

such Money Lender as provided under the provisions of this Act.

Explanation: For the purposes of this section, "coercive Action" by a Money

Lender against the debtors include the following, namely:-

(i) exerting pressure or obstructing or using violence to or insulting or

intimidating the debtor or his/her family members, or



3

(i) persistently following the debtor, his/her family member from place to
place or interfering with any property owned or used by him/her or
depriving him/her of, or hindering him/her in the use of any such
property, or

(iii) frequenting the house or other place where the debtor resides or works,
or carries on business, or happens to be, with an intension of taking
coercive action, or

(iv) using the service of private or outsource or external agencies, criminal
background to negotiate/urging the debtor to make payment using
coercive and undue influence, or

(V) Seeking to take forcibly any document from the debtor which entitles the

debtor to a benefit under any Government programme.”
8. Amendment of section 39.- In section 39 of the Principal Act,-
(a) in clause (a),-

(i) for the words “with simple imprisonment which may extend to one year”,
the words “with imprisonment which may extend to three years”, shall be

substituted; and

(ii) for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words “three lakh”, shall be
substituted.

(b) in clause (b),-

(i) for the words “with simple imprisonment which may extend to two years”,
the words “with imprisonment which may extend to ten years”, shall be

substituted; and

(ii) for the words “one lakh rupees”, the words “five lakh rupees”, shall be

substituted.



4

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Money Lenders Act, 1961
(Karnataka Act 12 of 1962) to protect economically vulnerable groups and
individuals from the undue hardship usurious interests rates and coercive means of

recovery by licensed money lender and unlicensed money lender.

Hence, the Bill.



5

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed measure.



6

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

Clause 4: (1) Section 15-A proposes to be inserted by this clause
empowers the Government to prescribe by rules the
procedure and guidelines for the settlement and the manner
of mediation by the Ombudsperson.

(2) Section 15-B proposes to be inserted by this clause
empowers the Government to prescribe by rules the
procedure and guidelines for grievances mechanism of the

grievances redressal forum.

The proposed delegation of Legislative power is normal in character.

KYATHASANDRA N.RAJANNA
Minister for Co-operation
excluding Agriculture Marketing

M.K. VISHALAKSHI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Assembly




7
ANNEXURE
EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA MONEY LENDERS ACT, 1961
(KARNATAKA ACT 12 OF 1962)

XXX XXX XXX
10. Term of licence.- A licence shall be valid for a term of five years.

Provided that where a money-lender holding a licence has made an
application for a fresh licence before the date prescribed under sub-section (1) of
section 6, for the succeeding 1[term]1l, such money-lender shall, notwithstanding
the expiry of the term of his licence, be deemed to have a valid licence until orders
are received by him on his application for the fresh licence.

XXX XXX XXX
37. Entry of wrong sum in bond, etc., to be an offence.-
XXX XXX XXX

(2) Whoever contravenes the provisions of sub-section (1) shall, on conviction,
be punished with imprisonment which may extend to six months or with fine which
may extend to one thousand rupees or with both.

XXX XXX XXX

38. Penalty for molestation.- Whoever molests, or abets the molestation of,
a debtor for the recovery of a debt due by him to a creditor shall, on conviction, be
punished with imprisonment which may extend to one year or with fine which may
extend to fifty thousand rupees or with both.

XXX XXX XXX

39. General provision regarding penalties.- Whoever fails to comply with or
acts in contravention of any provision of this Act, shall, if no specific penalty has
been provided for in this Act, on conviction, be punished,-

(a) for the first offence with simple imprisonment which may extend to
one year or with fine which may extend to fifty thousand rupees or
with both, and

(b) for the second or subsequent offence with simple imprisonment
which may extend to two year or with fine which may extend to one
lakh rupees or with both.

XXX XXX XXX

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengalur, 3¢ Mar, 2025, P7, W.D. , Copies 500



3

(Provisionally admitted)

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
(SIXTEENTH ASSEMBLY)
SIXTH SESSION

Amendments to the Karnataka Money Lenders (Amendment)Bill, 2025
(LA Bill No.4 of 2025);

By Shri Kyathasandra N. Rajanna Minister for Co-operation Excluding
Agricultural Marketing;

I hereby give notice of my intention to move the following amendment to
theKarnataka Money Lenders (Amendment) Bill, 2025 (LA Bill No.4 of 2025,
namely:-

Clause-2
In the said Bill, in clause 2, for the words “two years” the words “three

years” shall be substituted.

M.K.VISHALAKSHI
Secretary



