TATTICe NPeRDY
303C WRNEST

Foor&F NOAWTT (3WI_RBR) AT3C0DT, 2025
(202538 QHONTLECH PR 30936—02)

BTOEEIT NBIOTT e9DA0DED, 19610, sHBR), ST VTN 2,083 «ITH DB,

Q) YIEN0T FOWIWTE VB LINPMON FoEEdT NTBe)TWOTT LIRDOND, 1961
(196238 T EIT 90N 13)3),, eI R, 3T30IWE e300T328 T30 OT.e0NBIe)TBOOTS ;

YT POTI NETH5T DR, TOT WRE B, TOEEIT Tt PO NOBONOT &3
FORT03 9D ONN 3TN~

1. 0B RV, BRIV DI, WT0W.- (1) S8 PICDNR, TooeedT NTedWOTT
(3TNEB) IR, 2025 0TI FBCANI T,

(2) AT B BREES 20N WTSB,,.

2. RWyFO0 30 W RBB.- TOorEdT NBeIWTT eIRIODD, 1961 (19628 TNoeEdT
9PN 13)3 (B, BR,@N0T aDRO EIRDONTNWOTY FTONENT) 33 RT3
)WTHB-20D), "80T0 WJRENEY” N0 BWINE WTON “DTWY BRENEY” D0 BRNYS,
3B RCBRITT,,.

3. ®30e0 158 T BB.- 30R DIORNTNT 15:3¢ RWFTT (1) eVe3-33yTTLTE),
803D SPT) TRTIONNENR" D02 JWNY WROR "8 ©OF SRHTIANFTTBN" 0w
BENFPI, 33 RERAIT,I),.

4. BT00 168 3WI_BR.- aDR LRIODTNT 16:3¢ T)FTLTE),, -
(®) (7)3¢ DOBT 3B B eNV0ORIT, ADRIT,TI),, DOWT:-

"(8) NTe) BEFTOOTW /D  WVARVIMN  33ToN® TP 333 DB0ET
DROTINEG 9T 33T TEN0W ATAD0TINS OHTE V3T WOTWOIT Fjead),
WPRIT,EL), aNI), 0003 HVAPDI0D OHo)RE & CR@BT,N &8 PRI
NBVWOPNP T WOBIN BRTBOININIT,TI), THoNR B3 LIDIONTNT 20Tt V00N VTO3
905 NTeITOTR  SECOTEICNT),  IIOIIBRAED) 9F00 BWILBRAD)  SCOTIED
DYDTDO O LIRNTTeY) B,e300NT3T,T3),.

AWOW: B JyTTPT B LINPMN, NTITITS eDROT NTed YELET DTVTE
"200B0IT FaN" ) B8 ORI YN PN, WwFRRIPDDT, DOTT:-



(i) NBed YEFTI, 9T 33I/BSTOD N0 AWADN 3BT, TOTTHTI)
90 IBABRTBI)T) 9GFwo HOAODRY, WFAHR) BB 9z3e300RI)R) 9T
IATA TSRV JANSIATND)

(i) NTed Y BT, 333/3TOD BEN0W ATRTC, A IDOT APT, QB03TzooN
00230DRIHT) 9P €33T/3TOD  WwRBITTW 9T WFFTONAS O30 &1
NP5 IRITHTI) €900 €33 T/ESTANOT BB BRPIHT) 9Fed0 O0e)T IO R385
WFIN 98 BRI, L9IGa00

(i) NCed YEEID) DoAWINTE WP FIOA WIS RNGE 9P 3533000
SBRISTET DS 900 VIV X PT, WOTOITW Taaddd, HRRFS GBS B0 esman
23€€3 DLTBIY)T €90 23€E30350Mm0e303 @30T, LIT e

(iv) NBed YEESINR BED D3 3MN WO03W aNI), 9NV I &@jeioededsdyy, WP
203)T3N/2T0ONA)TT, DOAN 90 BRTMINR 980 20D/ NV NY, Bjedd3eH®
20:3,3030%,e33 ReRSOD, WPRIHT, L9ITTe00

(V) RFTEFTT O0e)T3E FOONEFHENBRONE). NTed YE IR FOSREBIT BB,NDY,
O30T AR ), FOOTRTCNIOT WOe303e00N &WT3ONIH)T.”

() "e33) 30NN DO0W JWPNY BN "®3I), BRENFTTNR" D0W VBBNYSY,
3B RCBRIT,T,;

(R) "200TD AT TRTIANTLR" D02 JHNEY WHRON "800 OF SRDICINY ST
N0 BBNFI, T)3BRCRAIT,),,; 303,

(8d) BWB03HrTE, €0, TBIT,I),,.

5. ®¥yYFO0 160-80 3 BR.- (1) RO 9RARNDE 1600 JyFTHDTAS  (2)3€
R -TyFTREE). -

(D) "e33) 3ONPIHNPTR" D02 BWNY WHRAN "BI), BRENFRTR” D0W BWRPS,
3B RCBRITT,,

() "0 FOIT TRBDWIONNPNR" D0W BWNY TR "80%) OF SRWDWOONNYSTN”
R0 BBNFI, T)3BRCRAIT,),,; 303,

() BS0ZBRE), -

(i) "2,0T3) 3ONPN0IZ" D0 BVWNY BN "eNRTY WRENPN0I" DOW BWNYIY,
33 RCBAITE,; D3I,

(i) 803 ST TRTIANNPN0I" D02 BRNY WBON “DTRBY OF SRTANNPN0I"
N0 BWNFI, &)3A3CRBRIT,3,.

6. B T0D 180 3T BV.- 2RO LIRI0DNE 18- &FTTE), -
() (1) GVEs-TBTETE), -



(i) "80833), BRTIATER" D0 BWINY WHRONR "eNRTY ©OF SRWIONNPR" 02
BENFID, &3O3RCBRIT,T,,; 203D,

(i) "2,0T3) SRTY BRTICNNPR” 02 BTN TN 80T OF CRTWICNPNR” 0
BENFD,, 3ABRCLRIT,,.

Q) R NVTJ-JyTTLTS), "BI), CRTICNNPT" D0 IJWNY VTN "DTRBY OF
BRTIAINFTNR” 202 BBNF, 31303 RAIT,T,.

7. 18, 18 D3, 183 BRI RFVINY ACTFTW.- DPO BRI 183
R BT 3THaI0D), T BNODS BT FBTONF, RORITE,, OBT:-

"18-0d. WOWITTERIFV® TDROT JWOWNY YIBFPFRDBRIFT.-  JoBNII,
Y3 FE BRI TT,N, NC) VLD DD, N3OS SWR e NPFsA TN
FTOODEDSEDOARD)  ATETeY) NARWTION 3DRDT  WOWITFBAE )y CaNT
DOBITED,. BVIBE D), DFATOD  ToORERIPOT  NI),  ONEARBTD
NIOWNNETAL M anlelaRNIARIN aldle ke EAANE

18-). IOWTFTRUTINY AWO0HmO WRCDF.- ATEFTe) APTWOT IOTNTRTI
DT FTOONE WA ONT,  AODAITE),. DOWNTRTV3 D000  ToONE 35a3R,0D
FOODEIFON 203, TVONERBRBTIF) DO eNRWIBITOOT )POSEE) BIT,T3),.

18-3. 9DFHIRAPPAT 9DTD.- (1) 88 RINDT aNI), FOOEET 1D
W8, APRIIT DR PIONED, 2004 (20043 FIEET 9PIOND 14)3 SOBWOFNF 0,
O30 2353030 SV ONATT, TOWIOD YO 95330 Myl eR, 30D, WOFCHI®
00 YR G0 0P 3NI), NTLY 93D, VOB TR0 AeoW T YOS
900 I R0WD;3T T Y0 90 WIBTE,, T50 B0 OPT LINeNY
€92)33,8, BDBOD NE° 2) RTDON) FOWOTFHES,, DV A, 0%, ATBONT DR Ae,,0° C9IG00
3 BHOI) Doy ATOE T LIPTINRRPL AT 003 9DTOOR 83TD 300B3T,T),,.

(2) ORAR,,0°, ATVIONT DBAY,,0° 9T LPTINRPAT 9RTON) 333 &,03
TR T OUB-IyTT (1)3), VeSLNDAT LRTONE) I AT T[T TR , &8
9RAODNTNT NTWVOFNP R Tjead), FRRP,STHT,.



VT LINPH H3), ToONnY BCPTF

3;R:30,0308, NBedTWoT a03I), 383,833 NBIWOTT AT TH2dD 2wk, BONY
W3 3POTW3T NI, WOROITW BRRCVS LIPISNPOT BSRDETN TNWED NMOR)NED
D), WBNYD, B AIRTT,N, TREET NCIWTT L9RAOND, 1961(19623 Toe€ds
IR0 13)30, STWIRE 2350BIYT) 93T T30 BONBAT.

303,000 B8 IFLONT.



SDFT 2, IS R,

TR TOAVO3T TjanDOTWN O30T B3, 2323,a3) PVOETNMIHDD)..



39,0300 3 TOIT BWToDT0T HDI20, IS &3)

0B 7

(1) &8 DOBE DROT ADRD) TADAITE 18 T3
WOWITBRE DS PRDT YIRE D), aNF5ATOD  LdPIT,NS
TOODEIFON aNIBY, sNERRBNP, DODNINE ZDRDT DOeIIREN)
RTOETT, LPTOTIN, ABIST.

(2) B8 OB TNROT ALDREN TyAYDATIE 182) &WTTEaed) TDOTNTRTI
DT BXDTOAD DDOTNTRTCI D00 TOODE 335537, MONS
FTOODERIPIN NI, N BRWNFIN,; DONZINE DRDT DOReREN
ATETT, IRPTOT S0, DEBRIZT.

TARe)3 TOAS BWRPTOTE 53)F0503/0¢IOR) 2008T O X BT NE.

T9;3,003) OD°. DO,
TA e030TES 0N, BRTIVTWEA
ABTOT &N0Y

N0.8. QToRE,
TOODNFTEF
BIOF LT PO




(ETM AN ol
Foor 3% NOITOT0T e9DD0HED, 19610 (19620 Foor &% e9DD0HD 13) 03,3 Ion

XXX XXX XXX

3. NBATTR 3RS, 3, BBODHIF,T_.- OB &353,030), OV JyRESTE), &3
9DIONTNT PVTVOENE) 230N WTWOT DI0TROTW €330 30NN 230TY0D0T
300a3003, &8 9IRDONRDT 3N NTeITWOTS RS0, BBRTROBE, BRTI 90T
BI3BD). ) AFTE), NTIWITIOR) 353300033, a0I), FooeedT NTBeIoT3T
(BT BR) LRI, 19853 ;80230 332000 4ed RBFTTLRTE), NTWOPATO3I 230330
BeIRONT),  ROWOOD RT3 BRATI) SBASTBL). OGP0 STLRITHTD,
2DIOTIR[VOAITTLD...

dWOB1.- 93¢ BELLWAONE 31D 95300 MRNTONE e3ie) e9¥zde 233 233
BE NP DI, MNP ORNE 31D 2,038,083 TR, LIONTBONT, CIFWO 335e3BOTT
RFDTI,; NCIWTI) BRODTE 933D LOT TdO3ROT) IONBNR 9IGR a35e3500083
R IT, ROWORPAITO3 &y34LT NTeIWOT SR80, BBONITED,..

dWVB2.- S8 IO N3N 2D02PTI VRT3 3A3ROT NBITRTS A,
0 BRENY  ©BHODRTN JAOGWINTIT,E), SWT, WIB, 9RPANOT  93HNR
SedTORWITIT.

XXX XXX XXX

15. NOTOTR SEBINY), ADFR BRRIP T 3,03 TR DRWONR), T
FRRBIP T PP BW,,S WRODI, I LFVPHTD BoBACODHoNIF,I),..- (1) NTed
23030, 9T TS ST,BITE), 9P DBRBING).  3eDATNPTE,03 FLaD
FRWONR, 0X,:300N TN TRTI, €953z00 NTed 330N, 9B 933 S3T,NTE).
95500 OBRTINTE). 3RDATIHT 3,03 B8, BB, WB,0N, G0 030s)e B3I
303,530, 3RTIBREE 9Fee ALB0RIE 0300 NTeITOTRD, IRTIGeY DEHE 0NV
&0€e3 80730 SRTBY BRTIAINPR JRDAWIBITICIOT I3 AI0T TOLITINIT,T,..

XXX XXX XXX
16. NOADOOT FOFPF Y3T FTooDFNYH BWoRBNCODTONBT,T_ .- (1) BTN,

SRENSNOZ BBeH TWODLFVBIOR G 303EOTEHTION FOBIWTHE O30T 358DI0T
NBIC3TRN 33,5370, 3RTHBEWE; e953a70

(2) B3R, NBeITOTI TRE, NTed 23eE30NN, NBIONS), TV IDTDONTE),
DODRIE TR SNEBITRF)S; 9T

(3) NBANAD), 23 NP, INTNTRL,L BRTOT) WRENPNOI TN ONA,;S 03503¢
sBOD, DA3RCBATRP S, 9T

(4) O3RYTE w3 oD, BT RIS, NTed VWY WITON BTIRIL), BRTIY,
03505 FBTE). DO 2350TBE3; 9T

(5) ORTE w30NI,; BT ©9[ID), NTd YW ITID, Tk DODRI
Ty RLOIIOT WTWINTS 20T €9e3T0T 2300 TR TIES; CITeI0



(6) DBATPPES TOOWRFT 9T DOLANON, 3500083T0,N €953e00 LISMON 95350
O30T BRI, NTed BRI 95300 NTed VWD) TalBIes OB a35303R0DN 950
93T 2BODIBRODT O0eHT FTTIT, LTI 23 0TI, VTR P)ES; LT3

(7) 88 e9DINDT NROT 90 TN IPTFHINRPACVTOT ToOTS), D3I,
903 DEIODNE). BRTID), 933, NTed QEY, O30HTE 2,300, WIVTVES VT, 37T
23000323, NTed QTBII IS0 )€ 2330TBIISEITTOGTeg) DLIEORNIVTS 2303 €33 SonShHnPn
IR, DRWTIDOEOT FTOU0R DO EIT00 2,083 ARedT BRTWIONNPNR IR DR WBIITOT
2D, CANO0T LIT00 €9:3BBDOTWOR TOTIVINIT,T),.:

BTB03I), (1) DOBRBS), SLNDAIT ToONET,N TOTWOAT 9P 2,083
3ONPNAZ  TFRIDANTITLL), aNI), WSO 08D SPT)  BRTOINPNOS
FREDANTIT,BL)..

XXX XXX XXX
16. NBAWOTI W3 NY R, VBATAY,IT,TD,..
XXX XXX XXX

(2) R DBATRF,LN 3R, 8 O03¢ NTeITWOTRD €9WOIE DEEONIIE a0fe3 €33
3ONPINDR LR DRWBITDOTOE  TOU2OAN0E  aNI), WOTWD AT  TCRTIOINDNR
IR, DRWTITOTOT I3 AN0T WOLRIVONIT,T),:

FVC03), TOUOOAE GIRPO)  WwOTWY IJOoNPNO3 TRIDANTIT,EBL), NI,
6D O 80T SRV BRETIONINPNOIF FLHONTIT,EL)...

XXX XXX XXX

18. PAODRDT NVOFIMN TN; BORS, YIM.- (1)88 LRI
T BT &BR AT AT DODTNT NBWORPNPI, 90 eD0LRT 230083
SRS O30T DWOBPINPR, 9B ROIINPI, PONAEIE O3E 371, 90T
V) OFIMON B8 IRV, 233 TEB )T Y3T WOBIODTY, LVBWORIDT T,
TV e)) VREONIVE a3 80e33), BRWIOINPNR IR DI WIBIWITOT 26D 3ANOTI
I, 90T 3353000 T3 00T 8 TYTTLT aNCTN 371D e9TTad0 8 LIRDONTNTE). 2 PNRPOT
O35059T¢ B3V OBWOTE T 3N e9TTIR 0T DeEITINTT 20T ST
BREIINPN )R DAWBITOTOT IV SON0T WOLITINIT,3),..

(2)33¢ JyTTOT NWVOFPNF Y, CVDONA NBIWOT 2353000330, BRI TIS
9T BTBRITHTITI, WOTBTRIGTBeS ITWVOGE 9T ONOTI) DEICEI T 3TIzI00N
03503¢ 353,000 T BT, ©ITE WRETWE). VBT TRY, 30T TAITT (1)3€
WV EYTTEICT BN 92330 03503 28I MIDOIIINTIRIRE €3 20039, 303 B3N, TN
9TV SIOTBIT)TRY, €93 TI0TNDAITOT €9BRONE), eITTOG ILEONT 0D
V0T 3B020003 &8O3POT) B3R T,N B3I, CREWICNDN A DRWIITIVETOT DI R,
2D ANO0T TCOLIVONISTT),.

XXX XXX XXX

T5F0 INTFHOOOD, NFTF TG, Woneed, TRR , JEN 500, 33e [wEE 2025



3

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SIXTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SIXTH SESSION

THE KARNATAKA PAWN BROKERS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025
(LA Bill No. 02 of 2025)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Pawn Brokers Act, 1961.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Pawn Brokers Act,
1961. (Karnataka Act No 13 of 1962) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the seventy sixth year of
the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Pawn Brokers (Amendment) Act, 2025.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 3.- In the Karnataka Pawn Brokers Act,1961
(Karnataka Act No 13 of 1962) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in
section 3, in the explanation-2 for the words “five years” the words “two years” shall
be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 15.- In the Principal Act , in section 15, in sub-
section (1) for the words "five hundred rupees", the words "five lakh rupees” shall be
substituted.

4. Amendment of section 16.- In section 16 of the principal Act,

(a) after clause (7) the following shall be inserted, namely,-

“(8) shall not use any coercive action either by himself or by his agents or
family member for recovery of money from the pawner and any form of coercive
recovery shall be liable for punishment under the provisions of this Act and
empower the Registering Authority to suspend or cancel the Registration of such

pawn broker as provided under the provisions of this Act.

Explanation: For the purposes of this section, "coercive Action" by a pawn

broker against the pawner include the following, namely:-

(i) exerting pressure or obstructing or using violence to or insulting or

intimidating the pawner or his/her family members, or



2

(ii) persistently following the pawner, his/her family member from place to
place or interfering with any property owned or used by him/her or
depriving him/her of, or hindering him/her in the use of any such
property, or

(ii) frequenting the house or other place where the pawner resides or
works, or carries on business, or happens to be, with an intension of
taking coercive action, or

(iv) using the service of private or outsource or external agencies, criminal
background to negotiate/urging the pawner to make payment using
coercive and undue influence, or

(v) Seeking to take forcibly any document from the pawner which entitles
the pawner to a benefit under any Government programme.”

(b) for the words "six months", the words "ten years", shall be substituted;
(c) for the words "one thousand rupees", the words "five lakh rupees", shall be
substituted; and
(d) the proviso shall be omitted.
5. Amendment of section 16A.- In section 16A of the principal Act, in sub-

section (2),-

(a) for the words "six months", the words "ten years", shall be substituted;
(b) for the words "rupees one thousand", the words "rupees five lakh", shall
be substituted; and
(c) in the proviso,-
(i) for the words "one month", the words "three years", shall be
substituted; and
(ii) for the words "rupees five hundred", the words "rupees two lakh",
shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 18.- In section 18 of the principal Act,-

(a) in sub-section (1),-
(i) for the words "fifty rupees", the words "three lakh rupees", shall be
substituted; and
(ii for the words "one hundred rupees"’, the words "five lakh rupees”,
shall be substituted.
(b) in sub-section (2), for the words "ten rupees", the words "two lakh

rupees", shall be substituted.



3

7. Insertion of new sections 18A, 18B and 18C.-After section 18 of the

principal Act, the following new sections shall be inserted, namely,-

“18-A. Settlement of disputes by Ombudsperson.- The Government shall
by notification appoint an Ombudsperson who can act as mediator between the
pawner or pawn-broker, for settling the disputes. The procedure and guidelines for
the settlement and mediation shall be in the manner as may be prescribed.

18-B. Grievances redressal forum.-The Government shall establish suitable
grievance mechanism. The procedure and guidelines for grievance mechanism shall
be in the manner as may be prescribed.

18-C. Authorized Officer.- (1) The Group-B Officer of Revenue Department
or Rural Development and Panchayath Raj Department or Urban Development
Department or Town Planning Department or Woman and Child Development
Department or Social Welfare Department or Minority Welfare Department or Tribal
Welfare Department or Backward Classes Welfare Department shall report if any
person is in contravention of the provisions of this Act and the Karnataka
Prohibition of Charging Exorbitant Interest Act 2004 (Karnataka Act No 14 of 2004)
to the concerned Registrar, Assistant Registrar or any Officer authorized by the
State Government in this behalf.

(2) The Registrar, the Assistant Registrar or any Officer authorized may on his
own motion or on the report submitted by the Officers referred in sub-section (1),

shall take action under the provisions of this Act.”



4

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Pawn Brokers Act, 1961
(Karnataka Act No 13 of 1962) to protect economically vulnerable groups and
individuals from the undue hardship usurious interests rates and coercive means of

recovery by licensed money lender and unlicensed money lender.

Hence, the Bill.



5

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed measure.



6

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

Clause 7: (1) Section 18-A proposes to be inserted by this clause
empowers the Government to prescribe by rules the
procedure and guidelines for the settlement and the manner
of mediation by the Ombudsperson.

(2) Section 18-B proposes to be inserted by this clause
empowers the Government to prescribe by rules the

procedure and guidelines for grievances mechanism of the

grievances redressal forum.

The proposed delegation of Legislative power is normal in character.

KYATHASANDRA N.RAJANNA
Minister for Co-operation
excluding Agriculture Marketing

M.K. VISHALAKSHI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Assembly




7

ANNEXURE
EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA PAWN BROKERS ACT, 1961

(KARNATAKA ACT 13 OF 1962)

XXX XXX XXX

3. Pawn-broker to obtain licence.- No person shall, after the expiry of six
months from the date on which the provisions of this Act come into force in any
area, carry on or continue to carry on business as a pawnbroker at any place in
such area, unless he has obtained a pawn-broker’s licence under this Act and after
the commencement of the Karnataka Pawn Brokers (Amendment) Act, 1985, except
on payment of security deposit as provided in section 4A.

Explanation 1.- Where a pawnbroker has more than one shop or place of
business, whether in the same town or village or in different towns and villages he
shall obtain a separate pawnbroker’s licence in respect of each such shop or place
of business.

Explanation 2.- Every pawn-broker’s licence granted under this Act shall be
valid for a term of five years, but may be renewed from term to term.

XXX XXX XXX

15. Pawnbroker advancing smaller amount or receiving higher interest
than that specified in accounts to be punishable.- (1) Any pawnbroker who
actually advances an amount less than that shown in the pawn-ticket or in his
accounts or registers or who takes or receives interest or any other charge at a rate
higher than that shown in the pawn-ticket or in his accounts or registers shall, on
conviction be punished with fine which may extend to five hundred rupees.

XXX XXX XXX

16. Certain other acts of pawnbrokers to be punishable.- A pawnbroker
who,-

(1) takes an article in pawn from any person appearing to be under the age of
fourteen years or to be intoxicated

(2) purchases or takes in pawn or exchange a pawn-ticket issued by another
pawnbroker

(3) employs any person under the age of sixteen years to take pledges in pawn

(4) under any pretence purchases, except at a public auction, any pledge while in
pawn with him

(5) suffers any pledge while in pawn with him to be redeemed with a view to his
purchasing it

(6) makes any contract or agreement with any person pawning or offering to pawn
any article, or with the owner thereof, for the purchase, sale, or disposition
thereof within the time of redemption; or



8

(7) sells hypothecates, pawns or otherwise disposes of any pledge pawned with him
except at such time and in such manner as is authorised by or under the Act

shall on conviction be punished with imprisonment for a term which may
extend to six months or with fine which may extend to one thousand rupees or with
both

Provided that for an act referred to in clause (7), the term of imprisonment
shall not be less than one month and the fine shall not be less than five hundred
rupees.

XXX XXX XXX
16A. Pawnbroker to redeem pledges.-
XXX XXX XXX

(2) Any pawnbroker who fails to so redeem shall, on conviction, be punished
with imprisonment for a term which may extend to six months and with fine which
may extend to rupees one thousand:

Provided that the term of imprisonment shall not be less than one month and
the fine shall not be less than rupees five hundred.

XXX XXX XXX

18. General penalty for contravention of Act, etc.- (1) Whoever
contravenes any of the provisions of this Act or of any rule or of any terms or
conditions of a licence made or granted thereunder shall, if no other penalty is
elsewhere provided in this Act for such contravention, on conviction be punished
with fine which may extend to fifty rupees and, if such person has been previously
convicted whether under this section or any other provision contained in this Act,
with fine which may extend to one hundred rupees.

(2) Any person who after having been convicted of the offence of carrying on,
or continuing to carry on the business of pawnbroker in contravention of the
provisions of section 3, continues to commit the same offence in the same year,
shall in addition to the fine to which he is liable under sub-section (1), be punished
with a further fine which may extend to ten rupees for each day after the previous
date of conviction during which he continues so to offend.

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengalur, 3¢ Mar, 2025, P7, W.D. , Copies 500



(Provisionally admitted)

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
(SIXTEENTH ASSEMBLY)
SIXTH SESSION

Amendments to the Karnataka Pawn Brokers (Amendment)Bill, 2025 (LA
Bill No.2 of 2025);

By Shri Kyathasandra N. Rajanna Minister for Co-operation Excluding
Agricultural Marketing;

I hereby give notice of my intention to move the following amendment to
the Karnataka Pawn Brokers (Amendment)Bill, 2025 (LA Bill No.2 of 2025),
namely:-
Clause-2
In the said Bill, in clause 2, for the words “two years” the words “three

years” shall be substituted.

M.K.VISHALAKSHI
Secretary



